
SCHEDULE OF PRICES - PAGE 1 of 6

Bid Number 939800-2017 
Trash/Refuse Removal

Opening Date 11/7/2016
Bid Tabulation

WASTE RECYCLING  AWARD VALUE 
PTC 

location
# Size # Size Unit Price Unit Price

Account #
Service 

Schedule
Waste 

Containers
Waste 

Containers
Recycling 

Containers
Recycling 

Containers
Per service / 

container
Per service / 

container
FACILITIES ACCESSIBLE TRAVELING WESTBOUND LISTED IN ORDER FROM EAST TO WEST

DONEGAL MAINTENANCE 14,000$         
MILEPOST T88.8, R.D. #1, BOX 331

ACME, PA 15610

NEW STANTON INT. #75 3,000$           
M.P. T75.5, RT. 119 & i-70

NEW STANTON, PA 15672

IRWIN INT. #67 2,000$           
M.P. T67.4, ROUTE 30

IRWIN, PA 15642

HARRISON CITY MAINTENANCE 15,000$         
MILEPOST T63.2, BOX 397-B

HARRISON CITY, PA 15636

PITTSBURGH INT. #57 3,000$           
M.P. T56.5, R.D. #1

TURTLE CREEK, PA 15145

ALLEGHENY VALLEY INT. #48 2,000$           
M.P. T47.7, R.D. #2

CHESWICH, PA 15024

GIBSONIA MAINTENANCE WAREHOUSE 15,000$         
MILEPOST T39.6, 3000 HABERLEIN ROAD

GIBSONIA, PA 15044

BUTLER VALLEY INT. #39 2,000$           
M.P. T39.1, R.D. #2

GIBSONIA, PA 15044

WARRENDALE INT. #30 3,000$           
M.P. T30.9, 117 PLAZA LANE

WARRENDALE, PA 15086

NEW CASTLE FARES OFFICE 2,000$           
MILEPOST T10.7

NEW GALILEE, PA 16141

GATEWAY INT. #2 3,000$           
M.P. T1.4, BURKEY ROAD

ENON VALLEY, PA 16120
FACILITIES ACCESSIBLE TRAVELING EASTBOUND LISTED IN ORDER FROM WEST TO EAST

HOMEWOOD MAINTENANCE 14,000$         
M.P. T11.8, 286 FOXWOOD ROAD

WAMPUM, PA 16157
FACILITIES ACCESSIBLE TRAVELING WESTBOUND ON ROUTE 376, BEAVER VALLEY EXPRESSWAY - LISTED IN ORDER FROM EAST TO WEST

EAST TOLL PLAZA #30 2,000$           
M.P. B31.1, ROUTE 51

BEAVER FALLS, PA 15010

WEST TOLL PLAZA #18 2,000$           
M.P. B18.1

NEW CASTLE, PA 16102

WASTE  RECYCLING  

1/WEEK

1/WEEK

BIWEEKLY

1/WEEK

1/WEEK

1/WEEK

2 CYD

1

1

11/WEEK

1/WEEK

 $                  14.81 

4 30 CYD  $                505.30  $                  18.95 

1 30 CYD  $                505.30  $                  14.81 

2

1

1

1

96 GAL 
MONTHL

Y

2 CYD

2 CYD

6 CYD

 $                  14.81 

30140 1

20140 6 CYD  $                  25.75 

BIWEEKLY

Line DISTRICT 1

1

20130 1

30130 1 1

BIWEEKLY

1/WEEK

1/WEEK3 2 CYD  $                  16.24 

7 30 CYD  $                505.30  $                  18.95 

5 6 CYD  $                  25.75  $                  14.81 

6 4 CYD  $                  21.00  $                  14.81 

20120 1

20720 1

30120 1

1

1

1 6 CYD

2 CYD

9 6 CYD  $                  25.75  $                  14.81 

10 2 CYD  $                  16.24  $                  14.81 

8 2 CYD  $                  16.24  $                  14.81 20710 1

20700 1

20670 1

1

1

1

2 CYD

2 CYD

2 CYD

11 6 CYD  $                  25.75  $                  14.81 

12 30 CYD  $                505.30 

20680 1

30110 1

1 2 CYD1/WEEK

BIWEEKLY

13 2 CYD  $                  16.24  $                  14.81 

14 2 CYD  $                  16.24  $                  14.81 1

20790

20750

2 CYD

2 CYD

Waste Management of PA
Morrisville PA

Waste Management of PA



SCHEDULE OF PRICES - PAGE 2 of 6

Bid Tabulation

WASTE RECYCLING  AWARD VALUE 
PTC 

location
# Size # Size Unit Price Unit Price

Account #
Service 

Schedule
Waste 

Containers
Waste 

Containers
Recycling 

Containers
Recycling 

Containers
Per service / 

container
Per service / 

container

WASTE  RECYCLING  

Line DISTRICT 1

Waste Management of PA

FACILITIES ACCESSIBLE TRAVELING NORTHBOUND ON ROUTE 43, MON/FAYETTE EXPRESSWAY - LISTED IN ORDER FROM SOUTH TO NORTH

INT. #5, M5 TOLL PLAZA 1,000$           
M.P. M4.6, RUBLES MILL ROAD

SMITHFIELD, PA 15478

INT. #19, M19 TOLL PLAZA 1,000$           
M.P. M19.5, 1098 FOX RIDGE ROAD

NEW SALEM, PA 15468

INT. #35, M35 TOLL PLAZA 3,000$           
M.P. M35.0, CALIFORNIA DRIVE

COAL CENTER, PA 15423

JEFFERSON HILLS MAINTENANCE 15,000$         
M.P. M51.4, 4000 ROUTE 43

JEFFERSON HILLS, PA 15025
FACILITIES ACCESSIBLE TRAVELING SOUTHBOUND ON ROUTE 43, MON/FAYETTE EXPRESSWAY - LISTED IN ORDER FROM NORTH TO SOUTH

INT. #52, M52 TOLL PLAZA 2,000$           
M.P. M52.0

JEFFERSON HILLS, PA 15025

SEARIGHTS MAINTENANCE 14,000$         
M.P. M18.1, 135 UPPER MIDDLETOWN 
ROAD
SMOCK, PA 15480

FACILITIES ACCESSIBLE TRAVELING NORTHBOUND ON ROUTE 66, AMOS K HUTCHINSON BYPASS - LISTED IN ORDER FROM SOUTH TO NORTH

WEST REGIONAL OFFICE 3,000$           

M.P. G0.6, 2200 NORTH CENTER AVENUE

NEW STANTON, PA 15672

INT. #5, AKH TOLL PLAZA 2,000$           
M.P. G4.7

GREENSBURG, PA 15601

GREENSBURG MAINTENANCE 14,000$         
M.P. G7.1, RD #2 BOX 352

JEANETTE, PA 15644

INT. #8, NORTHBOUND FACILITY 2,000$           
M.P. G7.8, ROUTE 130

JEANETTE, PA 15644

139,000$       
NO BID ON THIS DISTRICT:
Republic Services of PA (York)

BFI Waste, Republic Services (Valley Forge)

Weaver's Sanitation
JP Mascaro

1

1

1

1/WEEK

BIWEEKLY

1/WEEK

BIWEEKLY

1/WEEK

1/WEEK

BIWEEKLY

1/WEEK

15 2 CYD  $                  16.24 20190 1

16 2 CYD  $                  16.24 20810 1

1/WEEK

17 6 CYD  $                  25.74  $                  14.81 20150 1 1

19 1 CYD  $                  16.24  $                  14.81 

18 30 CYD  $                505.30  $                  18.95 30170 1

20170 1

1 6 CYD

2 CYD

2 CYD

 $                  14.81 10180 1

20250 1

2 CYD

2 CYD1

20230 1 2 CYD1/WEEK24 2 CYD  $                  16.24  $                  14.81 1

23 30 CYD  $                505.30  $                  14.81 30160 1 2 CYD

20 30 CYD  $                505.30 30175 1

22 2 CYD  $                  16.24  $                  14.81 

21 6 CYD  $                  25.75 



SCHEDULE OF PRICES - PAGE 3 of 6

Bid Number 939800-2017 
Trash/Refuse Removal

Opening Date 11/7/2016
Bid Tabulation

WASTE RECYCLING
 AWARD 
VALUE 

PTC location # Size # Size Unit Price Unit Price

Account #
Service 

Schedule
Waste 

Containers
Waste 

Containers
Recycling 

Containers
Recycling 

Containers
Per service / 

container
Per service / 

container
FACILITIES ACCESSIBLE TRAVELING WESTBOUND LISTED IN ORDER FROM EAST TO WEST

KEGG MAINTENANCE 13,000$  
MILEPOST T132.2, RD #1, BOX 197

MANNS CHOICE, PA 15550
FACILITIES ACCESSIBLE TRAVELING EASTBOUND LISTED IN ORDER FROM WEST TO EAST

SOMERSET MAINTENANCE 13,000$  
M.P. T113.9, 202 MENSER ROAD

SOMERSET, PA 15501

SOMERSET PSP 3,000$    
M.P. T113.9, 177 MENSER ROAD

SOMERSET, PA 15501

EVERETT MAINTENANCE 13,000$  
M.P. T154.2, 1657 ASHCOM ROAD

EVERETT, PA 15537

EVERETT FARES OFFICE AND WAREHOUSE 4,000$    
M.P. T154.2, 1657 ASHCOM ROAD

EVERETT, PA 15537

BURNT CABINS MAINTENANCE 13,000$  
M.P. T186.0, HC 62, BOX 522

SHADE GAP, PA 17255

59,000$  
NO BID ON THIS DISTRICT:
Waste Management of PA
Republic Services of PA (York)

BFI Waste, Republich Services (Valley Forge)

JP Mascaro

Weaver's Sanitation Service
Breezewood PA

Weaver's Sanitation Service

50120 1/WEEK 1 6 CYD  $              45.00 

WASTE  RECYCLING  

2 30200

 $              45.00  $                20.00 

1 2 CYD

1 2 CYD

2 CYD1

1 2 CYD

 $              45.00  $                20.00 

 $              45.00  $                20.00 

 $              45.00  $                20.00 

 $              45.00  $                20.00 

2 CYD5 30240 1/WEEK 5 6 CYD 1

3 30230 1/WEEK 5 6 CYD

4 20330 1/WEEK 1 6 CYD

1/WEEK 5 6 CYD

Line DISTRICT 2

1 30210 1/WEEK 5 6 CYD
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Bid Number 939800-2017 Morrisville PA
Trash/Refuse Removal

Opening Date 11/7/2016
Bid Tabulation Waste Management of PA

WASTE RECYCLING
 AWARD 
VALUE 

WASTE RECYCLING

PTC location # Size # Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Account #
Service 

Schedule
Waste 

Containers
Waste 

Containers
Recycling 

Containers
Recycling 

Containers
Per service / 

container
Per service / 

container
Per service / 

container
Per service / 

container
FACILITIES ACCESSIBLE TRAVELING WESTBOUND LISTED IN ORDER FROM EAST TO WEST

BOWMANSVILLE MAINTENANCE 5,000$    
MILEPOST T288.3

411 PANORAMA DRIVE

DENVER, PA 17517

ADMINISTRATION BUILDING 9,000$    
700 S Eisenhower Blvd

Middletown PA 17057

TIP BUILDING 4,000$    
2850 Turnpike Industrial Drive

Middletown PA 17057

NEWVILLE MAINTENANCE 8,000$    
MILEPOST T214.2, 246 CENTER 
ROAD
NEWVILLE, PA 17241

FACILITIES ACCESSIBLE TRAVELING EASTBOUND LISTED IN ORDER FROM WEST TO EAST

NEW CUMBERLAND MAINTENANCE 7,000$    
M.P. T243.8, 519 MARSH RUN 
ROAD
NEW CUMBERLAND, PA 17070

MOUNT GRETNA MAINTENANCE 7,000$    
M.P. T265.5, 3014 PINCH ROAD

MANHEIM, PA 17545

40,000$  
NO BID ON THIS DISTRICT:
BFI Waste, Republich Services 
(Valley Forge)
Weaver's Sanitation
JP Mascaro

Waste Management of PA

RECYCLING  

1 4 CYD

1 6 CYD
$175./haul 
$56./ton

$9.69

$125./haul
$91.96/ton 

5 30290 1/WEEK 4 6 CYD

6 30300
BI-

WEEKLY
4 6 CYD

$16.561 2 CYD

1

$27.10$470.21

$49.35

2 CYD $27.71 $9.69

$27.71 $9.69

$33.22 $16.56

4 30280
BI-

WEEKLY
1 30 CYD

$18.24

$27.10

3 10245 1/WEEK 2 4 CYD $27.35

2 10240
ON CALL 
approx 

monthly
1

40 CYD 
trash 

compacto
r

$9.69

$26.56 $9.69

$922.80

$16.561 30310 1/WEEK 3 6 CYD $38.54$27.71 $9.691 2 CYD

1 6 CYD

Republic Services of PA
York PA

Republic Services of PA

Line DISTRICT 3

WASTE  



SCHEDULE OF PRICES - PAGE 5 of 6

Bid Number 939800-2017 King of Prussia, PA Audubon PA
Trash/Refuse Removal

Opening Date 11/7/2016
Bid Tabulation Waste Management of PA BFI Waste, dba Republi   JP Mascaro & Sons

WASTE RECYCLING
 AWARD 
VALUE 

WASTE RECYCLING WASTE RECYCLING

PTC 
location

# Size # Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Account #
Service 

Schedule
Waste 

Containers
Waste 

Containers
Recycling 

Containers
Recycling 

Containers
Per service / 

container
Per service / 

container
Per service / 

container
Per service 
/ container

Per service 
/ container

Per service 
/ container

FACILITIES ACCESSIBLE TRAVELING WESTBOUND LISTED IN ORDER FROM EAST TO WEST

NESHAMINY FALLS INT. #353 2,000$    
M.P. T352.7, 2986 GALLOWAY RD.

BENSALEM, PA 19020

BENSALEM INT. #351 5,000$    
M.P. T351.3, ROUTE 1
BENSALEM, PA 19020
WILLOW GROVE INT. #343 4,000$    
M.P. T342.9, ROUTE 611
WILLOW GROVE, PA 19090
FORT WASHINGTON INT. #339 3,000$    
M.P. T338.5, ROUTE 309
FORT WASHINGTON, PA 19034
NORRISTOWN INT. #333 3,000$    
M.P. T333.1, GERMANTOWN PIKE
PLYMOUTH MEETING, PA 19462
VALLEY FORGE INT. #326 3,000$    
M.P. T326.3 SCHUYKILL EXP.WAY
KING OF PRUSSIA, PA 19406
DEVAULT MAINTENANCE 17,000$  
MILEPOST T316.3
RT. 1, BOX 44 VALLEY HILL ROAD
MALVERN, PA 19355

FACILITIES ACCESSIBLE TRAVELING EASTBOUND LISTED IN ORDER FROM WEST TO EAST

EAST REGIONAL OFFICE 58.64$            8,000$    
M.P. T330.2, 251 FLINT HILL ROAD 39.83$            $82.50/8CYD 400.00$     

KING OF PRUSSIA, PA 19406 18.81$            $51.92/2CYD

DISTRICT 4 TRADES AND WAREHOUSE 3,000$    
M.P. T332.37, 1801 GALLAGHER ROAD

PLYMOUTH MEETING, PA 19462

PLYMOUTH MEETING MAINTENANCE 15,000$  

M.P. T333.3, 331 W. GERMANTOWN PIKE

PLYMOUTH MEETING, PA 19462

TREVOSE MAINTENANCE 17,000$  
M.P. T353.1, 2999 GALLOWAY ROAD

BENSALEM, PA 19020

FACILITIES ACCESSIBLE TRAVELING NORTHBOUND ON ROUTE 476 - LISTED IN ORDER FROM SOUTH TO NORTH

MID-COUNTY INT. #20 3,000$    
M.P. A333.15, GERMANTOWN PIKE

PLYMOUTH MEETING, PA 19462

83,000$  
NO BID ON THIS DISTRICT:

Republic Services of PA (York)

Weaver's Sanitation

BFI Waste, dba 
Republic Services of JP Mascaro & Sons

 $600./4 tons - 
$77.00 over 4 

tons 
 $       81.23 

 $600./4 tons - 
$79.00 over 4 

tons 
 $       19.15 

 $          82.50  $       42.05 

 $695./4 tons - 
$102.00 over 

4 tons 
 $       81.23 

 $       42.05 

 $        197.75  $     187.50 

 $          41.07  $       11.53 

 $          70.12  $       42.05 

 $          70.12  $       42.05 

 $          32.36  $       19.15 

 $          32.36  $       19.15 

 $     575.00  $       75.00 

 $     225.00  $     110.00 

 $       75.00 

 $     110.00 

 $     100.00  $       50.00 

 $     110.00 

 $     210.00  $     110.00 

 $     210.00  $     110.00 

 $     110.00 

 $     350.00  $     110.00 

 $     350.00  $     110.00 

 $     210.00 

 $     210.00 

 $     550.00 

 $          34.84  $       11.53 

 $       75.00 

2CYD  $          11.78 

WASTE  RECYCLING  

2 CYD  $          14.77 

1 6 CYD  $          18.98 

 $          18.20 

3 CYD  $          14.77 

 $          18.81 

2 CYD  $          14.77 

1 2 CYD  $          14.77 

 $          14.77 

12 20550 1/WEEK 1 8 CYD  $            39.83 1

11 30350 BI-WEEKLY 1 40 CYD  $         609.02 

10 30340 BI-WEEKLY 1 40 CYD  $         536.34 1 6 CYD

1 2 CYD

9 30320 1/MONTH 1 8 CYD  $            39.83 1

8 10170 1/WEEK 2
8 CYD
2 CYD

7 30330 BI-WEEKLY 1 40 CYD  $         610.12 1 6 CYD  $          20.28 

6 20480 1/WEEK 1 6 CYD  $            32.92 1

5 20490 1/WEEK 1 6 CYD  $            31.81 

3 20510 1/WEEK 2 6 CYD  $            29.69 1

4 20500 1/WEEK 1 6 CYD  $            36.24 1 2 CYD

Waste Management of PA
Morrisville PA

 $     575.00 

Line DISTRICT 4   

1 20528 1/WEEK 1 6 CYD  $            22.38 1

2 20520 1/WEEK 2 6 CYD  $            33.38 

2 CYD  $          14.77 

1 2 CYD  $          15.61 



SCHEDULE OF PRICES - PAGE 6 of 6

Bid Number 939800-2017 Audubon PA
Trash/Refuse Removal

Opening Date 11/7/2016
Bid Tabulation JP Mascaro & Sons

WASTE RECYCLING
 AWARD 
VALUE 

WASTE RECYCLING

PTC location # Size # Size Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Account #
Service 

Schedule
Waste 

Containers
Waste 

Containers
Recycling 

Containers
Recycling 

Containers
Per service / 

container
Per service / 

container
Per service 
/ container

Per service 
/ container

FACILITIES ACCESSIBLE TRAVELING NORTHBOUND ON ROUTE 476 - LISTED IN ORDER FROM SOUTH TO NORTH

LANSDALE INT. #31 3,000$    
M.P. A30.1, ROUTE 63

KULPSVILLE, PA 19443

QUAKERTOWN MAINTENANCE 12,000$  

M.P. A43.7, 1800 JOHN FRIED HIGHWAY

QUAKERTOWN, PA 18951

SLATINGTON MAINTENANCE 10,000$  
M.P. A70.1, 2952 MOUNTAIN ROAD

SLATINGTON, PA 18080
FACILITIES ACCESSIBLE TRAVELING SOUTHBOUND ON ROUTE 476 - LISTED IN ORDER FROM NORTH TO SOUTH

WYOMING VALLEY MAINTENANCE 11,000$  
M.P. A114.5, ROUTE 315

PITTSTON, PA 18640

POCONO MAINTENANCE 7,000$    
M.P. A94.6, 511 STATE ROUTE 940

WHITE HAVEN, PA 18661

NO BID ON THIS DISTRICT: 43,000$  
Republic Services of PA (York)
Weaver's Sanitation
BFI Waste, Republich Services (Valley 
Forge)

 $               32.01 

 $          14.77  $               36.82 

 $          22.32 

JP Mascaro & Sons

 $     210.00  $     110.00 

 $     210.00  $     110.00 

 $     190.00  $     110.00 

 $     110.00 

 $     210.00  $     110.00 

 $     210.00 

Waste Management of PA

30410 1/WEEK 3 6 CYD 2 CYD1

5

6 6 CYD  $               31.17 1 2 CYD4 30420 1/WEEK

3 30390 1/WEEK

5

2 30380

 $          22.32 

1/WEEK 6 6 CYD

 $               33.69 16 CYD

 $               33.44 1 2 CYD  $          14.77 

2 CYD  $          20.39 

Morrisville PA

Waste Management of PA

1 20580 1/WEEK 1 6 CYD

Line DISTRICT 5

WASTE  RECYCLING  

1 2 CYD
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