PA Turnpike Commission

Pennsylvania Turnpike Commission

Sodium Chloride 2018-2019

Bid Tabulation Awarded Locations Riverside Construction Materials Eastern Salt Company Inc
Bid Number 853046-2018-A Fairless Hills PA Lowell MA
Due Date 7/26/2018 6771 3662
District [Location Location Code |County LOCATION | Firm Salt Price / | Evaluation Total | Firm Salt Price / | Evaluation Total
Estimated [Ton (PER LOCATION) |Ton (PER LOCATION)
Total (PER LOCATION) (PER LOCATION)
2 Burnt Cabins BRNT Huntingdon 5,500 TON $76.82 $422,510.00(no bid
3 Carlisle Salt Storage [SLT2 Cumberland 1,000 TON $68.97 $68,970.00 $64.50 $64,500.00
4 Devault DVLT Chester 4,100 TON $58.33 $239,153.00 $55.00 $225,500.00
4 Plymouth Meeting PLYM Montgomery 7,200 TON $55.97 $402,984.00 $55.50 $399,600.00
4 Trevose TREV Bucks 6,900 TON $51.77 $357,213.00 $54.50 $376,050.00
5 Quakertown QTWN Bucks 8,600 TON $56.98 $490,028.00 $57.50 $494,500.00
Estimated Total $1,980,858.00 $1,560,150.00
$1,269,751.00 $689,600.00

No Bid
Compass Minerals
LeVeck Lighting
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PA Turnpike Commission

Pennsylvania Turnpike Commission
Bid Tabulation

Awarded Locatil

Cargill Inc - Salt, Road Safety

Haven Salt Company LLC

Bid Number 853046-2018-A North Olmsted OH Clarks Summit PA
Due Date 7/26/2018 944 6405
District [Location Location Code | Firm Salt Price / | Evaluation Total | Firm Salt Price / | Evaluation Total
Ton (PER LOCATION) |Ton (PER LOCATION)
(PER LOCATION) (PER LOCATION)
2 Burnt Cabins BRNT $79.86 $439,230.00|no bid
3 Carlisle Salt Storage [SLT2 $74.73 $74,730.00|no bid
4 Devault DVLT $61.94 $253,954.00 $60.47 $247,927.00
4 Plymouth Meeting PLYM $61.85 $445,320.00 $59.21 $426,312.00
4 Trevose TREV $56.76 $391,644.00 $55.41 $382,329.00
5 Quakertown QTWN $61.85 $531,910.00 $60.13 $517,118.00
Estimated Total $2,136,788.00 $1,573,686.00

No Bid
Compass Minerals
LeVeck Lighting

Sodium Chloride 2018-2019
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PA Turnpike Commission

Pennsylvania Turnpike Commission
Bid Tabulation

Awarded Locatil

American Rock Salt Co LLC

Morton Salt Inc

Bid Number 853046-2018-A Mt Morris NY Chicago IL
Due Date 7/26/2018 1254 832
District [Location Location Code | Firm Salt Price / | Evaluation Total | Firm Salt Price / | Evaluation Total
Ton (PER LOCATION) |Ton (PER LOCATION)
(PER LOCATION) (PER LOCATION)
2 Burnt Cabins BRNT $79.35 $436,425.00|no bid
3 Carlisle Salt Storage [SLT2 $90.61 $90,610.00|no bid
4 Devault DVLT no bid $67.07 $274,987.00
4 Plymouth Meeting PLYM no bid $63.41 $456,552.00
4 Trevose TREV no bid $61.03 $421,107.00
5 Quakertown QTWN no bid $65.36 $562,096.00
Estimated Total $527,035.00 $1,714,742.00

No Bid
Compass Minerals
LeVeck Lighting

Sodium Chloride 2018-2019
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PA Turnpike Commission Sodium Chloride 2018-2019

Pennsylvania Turnpike Commission

Bid Tabulation Awarded Locati| Mid-Atlantic Salt LLC Detroit Salt Company
Bid Number 853046-2018-A Gladwyne PA Detroit Mi
Due Date 7/26/2018 3451
District [Location Location Code | Firm Salt Price / | Evaluation Total | Firm Salt Price / | Evaluation Total
Ton (PER LOCATION) |Ton (PER LOCATION)
(PER LOCATION) (PER LOCATION)
2 Burnt Cabins BRNT no bid no bid
3 Carlisle Salt Storage |SLT2 no bid no bid
4 Devault DVLT no bid $63.94 $262,154.00
4 Plymouth Meeting PLYM $63.93 $460,296.00 $62.01 S446,472.00
4 Trevose TREV no bid $63.78 $440,082.00
5 Quakertown QTWN no bid $67.50 $580,500.00
Estimated Total $460,296.00 $1,729,208.00
No Bid
Compass Minerals
LeVeck Lighting
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