	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 1 - 1st Aid - Protective Materials	Rejected Alternate			WESCO	Distribution	n Inc (Vendo		Stauffer Glove and Safety				
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number		Est Qty (2 yrs)		Alternate Part Number		Bid Price per Ordering UOM	EST TOTAL	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	of Measure	Bid Price per Ordering UOM
7342	BLANKET, EMERGENCY DISPOSABLE, 60 IN. X 90 IN. CON- STRUCTED WITH FOAM LAMINATION OVER POLY, WATERPROOF, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED IN PLASTIC BAGS.	6090 U.S. LAMINATING CORP.	19	19 EA	DUKAL: Disposable Emergency Blanket: 58" X 90"	32722	EA	\$4.64	\$88.16	HONEYWEL L	551003	EA	\$3.33
7344	INSECTICIDE, BEE & WASP KILLER 12 TO 15 OZ. AEROSOL CAN, EPA REG. #7754-39 NON-CONDUCTIVE UP TO 26,500 VOLTS REFERENCE BEE BOPPER AS MFG'D BY ARI.	61011ARI BEE BOPPER	1000	1,000 EA			EA	\$3.82	\$3,820.00			EA	\$3.79
7345	REPELLENT, TICK/INSECT, 5-12 OZ. AEROSOL CAN. MUST CONTAIN BETWEEN 20 TO 30% DEET.	61604ARI BUG BARRIER II	200	200 EA			12/CS	\$50.00	\$833.33			EA	\$4.36
7346	INSECT REPELLENT, 2 OZ. PUMP SPRAY BOTTLE, 98.11% DEET (DIETHYL-M-TOLUAMIDE).	GF10025 TEC LABS	120	120 EA			EA	\$3.74	\$448.80		stock item - can purchase by EACH	CS/48	\$197.76
7352	HAND CLEANER, WATERLESS, ANTISEPTIC BIO- HAND CLEANER, KILLS 99.9% OF GERMS, NO RINSING REQUIRED, CONTAINS ALOE VERA 12-16 OZ. PUMP BOTTLE, 12 PER CASE.	17354 SAFETEC	2100	2,100 EA			EA	\$4.67	\$9,807.00			EA	\$5.06
7353	WATERLESS GERM KILLING AGENT, SUPPLIED TOWELETTE FORM, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, FOR ONE TIME USE. ACTIVE INGRED- IENT PCMX COMBINED WITH NON- OXYNOL-9 TO EFFECTIVELY DESTROY TB, STAPH, E-COLI, STREP AND OTHER MICRO-ORGAN- ISMS, 50-100 TOWELETTES/BOX.	V25100 VIONEX	120	120 BX			50/BX	\$8.27	\$992.40			EA	\$11.10
10883	FIRST AID KIT, COMPACT, LATEX FREE. KIT INCLUDES: SCISSORS, FIRST AID GUIDE, ADHESIVE TAPE 1/2 IN. X 2 1/2 YDS, 2 STERILE GAUZE PADS 3 X 3 IN., 2 PLASTIC ADHESIVE BANDAGE EXTRA LARGE, 6 PVP IODINE WIPES, 4 FIRST AID/BURN CREAM WITH ALOE, ROLLER BANDAGE 2 IN. X 4.1 YDS, 8 PLASTIC ADHESIVE BANDAGE 1 X 3 IN., 1 ANTIBIOTIC OINTMENT POUCH KIT IS NOT TO CONTAIN ANY DRUGS, SUCH	019733-0020L NORTH SAFETY	19	19 EA			EA	\$5.94	\$112.86			EA	\$6.08

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 1 - 1st Aid - Protective Materials	Rejected Alternate			WESCO	Distribution	n Inc (Vendo	r# 4007)				Glove and Safety	
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number		Est Qty (2 yrs)	Alternate Manufacturer Name		Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM	EST TOTAL	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	of Measure	Bid Price per Ordering UOM
10913	CASE CONTAINS THE FOLLOWING: 3 BZK ANTISEPTIC TOWELETTES, 1 DISPOSABLE GOWN W/FULL SLEEVES, 2 DISPOSABLE SHOE COVERS, 1 EYE SHIELD WITH EAR LOOP MASK, 1 FLUID CONTROL SOLIDIFIER PACK 21 GM, 1 BIOHAZARD SCOOP, 2 - 24 IN. X 24 IN. BIOHAZARD BAGS, 2 - 8 IN. X 12 IN. CLEAR PLASTIC BAGS, 2 TWISTIES, 2 - 5 IN. X 8 IN. GERMICIDAL (KILLS GERMS) WIPES, 3 DISPOSABLE CLEAN-UP TOWELS, 2 EXAM QUALITY VINYL GLOVES 1 PAIR, 1 BODILY FLUID PICK-UP GUIDE MEETS FEDERAL OSHA	214-U/FAO FIRST AID ONLY	63	63 EA			EA	\$10.72	\$675.36			EA	\$11.96
12755	REPELLENT, TICK/INSECT, 9 OZ. AERSOL CAN, CONTAINS THE ACTIVE INGEDIENT PERMETHRIN. 12 CANS PER CASE.	SP602 SAWYER	500	500 EA			EA	\$4.56	\$2,280.00			EA	\$6.24
13115	CLEANSER, SKIN, OAK-N-IVY CLEANSING CREAM, 0.5 OZ PACKET, TECNU.	25333 TEC LABORATORIES	50	50 BOX			50/BX	\$22.56	\$1,128.00			BX	\$23.95
13116	REPELLENT, INSECT, TOWELETTES, CROC BLOC, REPELS BLACK FLIES, BITING MIDGES, DEER FLIES, STABLE FLIES, TICKS AND CHIGGERS, CONTAINS 52.25% DEET.	12-4000 CROC BLOC	50	50 BOX			50/BX	\$28.00	\$1,400.00			ВХ	\$29.65
13273	DISPENSER, TISSUE LENS CLEANING, SIZE SMALL, METAL, GREEN, 3-3/8 IN. X 1-1/2 IN. X 9 IN.	1LCR24D BOUTON	50	50 EA			1/EA	\$7.56	\$378.00			BX	\$7.82
13346	TISSUE, LENS CLEANING, PRE-MOISTENED, SIGHT SAVERS, 5 IN. X 8 IN., ANTI-FOG, ANTI-STATIC, SILICONE-FREE, 100 SHEETS PER BOX.	LOMB	50	50 BOX			100/BX	\$7.99	\$399.50			ВХ	\$8.46
	NO BID	TOTAL EST. BID							\$22,363.41				

Action Supply Products

Scott Electric

Arbill

Premier Safety & Service

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 1 - 1st Aid - Protective Materials	Rejected Alternate		,			W W Gra		Fremont Industria				
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number		Est Qty (2 yrs)	EST TOTAL	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number		Bid Price per Ordering UOM	EST TOTAL	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)
7342	BLANKET, EMERGENCY DISPOSABLE, 60 IN. X 90 IN. CONSTRUCTED WITH FOAM LAMINATION OVER POLY, WATERPROOF, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED IN PLASTIC BAGS.	6090 U.S. LAMINATING CORP.	19	19 EA	\$63.27	North Safety	551003 WWG 3PAJ9	Each	\$3.51	\$66.69			EA
7344	INSECTICIDE, BEE & WASP KILLER 12 TO 15 OZ. AEROSOL CAN, EPA REG. #7754-39 NON-CONDUCTIVE UP TO 26,500 VOLTS REFERENCE BEE BOPPER AS MFG'D BY ARI.	61011ARI BEE BOPPER	1000	1,000 EA	\$3,790.00	Johnson Diversy (RAID)	CB013536 (1	Each	\$3.99	\$3,990.00			EACH BUT HAVE TO ORDER IN CASES OF 12
7345	REPELLENT, TICK/INSECT, 5-12 OZ. AEROSOL CAN. MUST CONTAIN BETWEEN 20 TO 30% DEET.	61604ARI BUG BARRIER II	200	200 EA	\$872.00	Johnson Diversy (OFF)	CB018425 (1	Each	\$5.12	\$1,024.00			EACH BUT HAVE TO ORDER IN CASES OF 12
7346	INSECT REPELLENT, 2 OZ. PUMP SPRAY BOTTLE, 98.11% DEET (DIETHYL-M-TOLUAMIDE).	GF10025 TEC LABS	120	120 EA	\$494.40	TEC LABORATO RIES	FG10025 (23	Each	\$3.45	\$414.00			EACH BUT HAVE TO ORDER IN CASES OF 48
7352	HAND CLEANER, WATERLESS, ANTISEPTIC BIO- HAND CLEANER, KILLS 99.9% OF GERMS, NO RINSING REQUIRED, CONTAINS ALOE VERA 12-16 OZ. PUMP BOTTLE, 12 PER CASE.	17354 SAFETEC	2100	2,100 EA	\$10,626.00	PURELL	3639-12 (109	Pack of 12	\$49.00	\$8,575.00			EACH BUT HAVE TO ORDER IN CASES OF 12
7353	WATERLESS GERM KILLING AGENT, SUPPLIED TOWELETTE FORM, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, FOR ONE TIME USE. ACTIVE INGRED- IENT PCMX COMBINED WITH NON- OXYNOL-9 TO EFFECTIVELY DESTROY TB, STAPH, E-COLI, STREP AND OTHER MICRO-ORGAN- ISMS, 50-100 TOWELETTES/BOX.	V25100 VIONEX	120	120 BX	\$1,332.00	VIONEX	MVSW07851	Pack of 50	\$12.15	\$1,458.00			EA
10883	FIRST AID KIT, COMPACT, LATEX FREE. KIT INCLUDES: SCISSORS, FIRST AID GUIDE, ADHESIVE TAPE 1/2 IN. X 2 1/2 YDS, 2 STERILE GAUZE PADS 3 X 3 IN., 2 PLASTIC ADHESIVE BANDAGE EXTRA LARGE, 6 PVP IODINE WIPES, 4 FIRST AID/BURN CREAM WITH ALOE, ROLLER BANDAGE 2 IN. X 4.1 YDS, 8 PLASTIC ADHESIVE BANDAGE 1 X 3 IN., 1 ANTIBIOTIC OINTMENT POUCH KIT IS NOT TO CONTAIN ANY DRUGS, SUCH	019733-0020L NORTH SAFETY	19	19 EA	\$115.52	North Safety	019733-0020	Each	\$5.90	\$112.10			EA

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 1 - 1st Aid - Protective Materials	Rejected Alternate						inger Inc		Fremont Industrial Co			
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number		Est Qty (2 yrs)	EST TOTAL	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM	EST TOTAL	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)
10913	BLOODBORNE PATHOGEN/BODILY FLUID SPILL KIT - PLASTIC CASE CONTAINS THE FOLLOWING: 3 BZK ANTISEPTIC TOWELETTES, 1 DISPOSABLE GOWN W/FULL SLEEVES, 2 DISPOSABLE SHOE COVERS, 1 EYE SHIELD WITH EAR LOOP MASK, 1 FLUID CONTROL SOLIDIFIER PACK 21 GM, 1 BIOHAZARD SCOOP, 2 - 24 IN. X 24 IN. BIOHAZARD BAGS, 2 - 8 IN. X 12 IN. CLEAR PLASTIC BAGS, 2 TWISTIES, 2 - 5 IN. X 8 IN. GERMICIDAL (KILLS GERMS) WIPES, 3 DISPOSABLE CLEAN-UP TOWELS, 2 EXAM QUALITY VINYL GLOVES 1 PAIR, 1 BODILY FLUID PICK-UP GUIDE MEETS FEDERAL OSHA	214-U/FAO FIRST AID ONLY	63	63 EA	\$753.48	North Safety	552001 WWG 5ELW0	Each	\$9.13	\$575.19			EA
12755	REPELLENT, TICK/INSECT, 9 OZ. AERSOL CAN, CONTAINS THE ACTIVE INGEDIENT PERMETHRIN. 12 CANS PER CASE.	SP602 SAWYER	500	500 EA	\$3,120.00	CRC	14036 WWG 20KC01	Each	\$6.59	\$3,295.00			EACH BUT HAVE TO ORDER IN CASES OF 12
13115	CLEANSER, SKIN, OAK-N-IVY CLEANSING CREAM, 0.5 OZ PACKET, TECNU.	25333 TEC LABORATORIES	50	50 BOX	\$1,197.50	PAC-KIT	POIC50BXG 39N938	Pack of 50	\$35.27	\$1,763.50			EACH BUT HAVE TO ORDER IN CASES OF 6
13116	REPELLENT, INSECT, TOWELETTES, CROC BLOC, REPELS BLACK FLIES, BITING MIDGES, DEER FLIES, STABLE FLIES, TICKS AND CHIGGERS, CONTAINS 52.25% DEET.	12-4000 CROC BLOC	50	50 BOX	\$1,482.50	PHYSICIAN SCARE	18-750 WWG 6AZ07	Pack of 50	\$29.13	\$1,456.50			EA
13273	DISPENSER, TISSUE LENS CLEANING, SIZE SMALL, METAL, GREEN, 3-3/8 IN. X 1-1/2 IN. X 9 IN.	1LCR24D BOUTON	50	50 EA	\$391.00	BAUSCH & LOMB	8568GMP WWG 5BB81	Each	\$35.17	\$1,758.50			EACH BUT HAVE TO ORDER IN CASES OF 20
13346	TISSUE, LENS CLEANING, PRE-MOISTENED, SIGHT SAVERS, 5 IN. X 8 IN., ANTI-FOG, ANTI-STATIC, SILICONE-FREE, 100 SHEETS PER BOX.	8574GM BAUSCH & LOMB	50	50 BOX	\$423.00	BAUSCH & LOMB	8574GM WWG 2AR69	Pack of 100	\$8.08	\$404.00			EA

NO BID TOTAL EST. BID \$24,660.67 \$24,892.48

Action Supply Products

Scott Electric

Arbill

Premier Safety & Service

Bid 632000-636000-2017 LOT 1 LOT 1 1st Aid Protective Materials

20	000-636000-2017				LOT 1
	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 1 - 1st Aid - Protective Materials	Rejected Alternate			
	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number		Est Qty (2 yrs)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM
	BLANKET, EMERGENCY DISPOSABLE, 60 IN. X 90 IN. CON- STRUCTED WITH FOAM LAMINATION OVER POLY, WATERPROOF, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED IN PLASTIC BAGS.	6090 U.S. LAMINATING CORP.	19	19 EA	\$5.60
	INSECTICIDE, BEE & WASP KILLER 12 TO 15 OZ. AEROSOL CAN, EPA REG. #7754-39 NON-CONDUCTIVE UP TO 26,500 VOLTS REFERENCE BEE BOPPER AS MFG'D BY ARI.	61011ARI BEE BOPPER	1000	1,000 EA	\$4.88
	REPELLENT, TICK/INSECT, 5-12 OZ. AEROSOL CAN. MUST CONTAIN BETWEEN 20 TO 30% DEET.	61604ARI BUG BARRIER II	200	200 EA	\$5.30

Material

7342

PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation	Rejected Alternate	
Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017		
LOT 1 - 1st Aid - Protective Materials		

Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number		Est Qty (2 yrs)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM
10913	BLOODBORNE PATHOGEN/BODILY FLUID SPILL KIT - PLASTIC CASE CONTAINS THE FOLLOWING: 3 BZK ANTISEPTIC TOWELETTES, 1 DISPOSABLE GOWN W/FULL SLEEVES, 2 DISPOSABLE SHOE COVERS, 1 EYE SHIELD WITH EAR LOOP MASK, 1 FLUID CONTROL SOLIDIFIER PACK 21 GM, 1 BIOHAZARD SCOOP, 2 - 24 IN. X 24 IN. BIOHAZARD BAGS, 2 - 8 IN. X 12 IN. CLEAR PLASTIC BAGS, 2 TWISTIES, 2 - 5 IN. X 8 IN. GERMICIDAL (KILLS GERMS) WIPES, 3 DISPOSABLE CLEAN-UP TOWELS, 2 EXAM QUALITY VINYL GLOVES 1 PAIR, 1 BODILY FLUID PICK-UP GUIDE MEETS FEDERAL OSHA	214-U/FAO FIRST AID ONLY	63	63 EA	\$12.79
12755	REPELLENT, TICK/INSECT, 9 OZ. AERSOL CAN, CONTAINS THE ACTIVE INGEDIENT PERMETHRIN. 12 CANS PER CASE.	SP602 SAWYER	500	500 EA	\$4.95
13115	CLEANSER, SKIN, OAK-N-IVY CLEANSING CREAM, 0.5 OZ PACKET, TECNU.	25333 TEC LABORATORIES	50	50 BOX	\$25.26
13116	REPELLENT, INSECT, TOWELETTES, CROC BLOC, REPELS BLACK FLIES, BITING MIDGES, DEER FLIES, STABLE FLIES, TICKS AND CHIGGERS, CONTAINS 52.25% DEET.	12-4000 CROC BLOC	50	50 BOX	\$71.65
13273	DISPENSER, TISSUE LENS CLEANING, SIZE SMALL, METAL, GREEN, 3-3/8 IN. X 1-1/2 IN. X 9 IN.	1LCR24D BOUTON	50	50 EA	\$8.82
13346	TISSUE, LENS CLEANING, PRE-MOISTENED, SIGHT SAVERS, 5 IN. X 8 IN., ANTI-FOG, ANTI-STATIC, SILICONE-FREE, 100 SHEETS PER BOX.	8574GM BAUSCH & LOMB	50	50 BOX	\$9.90
	NO DID	TOTAL ECT DID			

NO BID

TOTAL EST. BID

Action Supply Products

Scott Electric

Arbill

Premier Safety & Service

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 1 - 1st Aid - Protective Materials	Rejected Alternate			SEAL (SLOVE MFG	INC / ARK S	AFETY	Supreme Safety, Inc				
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number		Est Qty (2 yrs)	Alternate Manufacturer Name			Bid Price per Ordering UOM	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	of Measure	Bid Price per Ordering UOM	
7342	BLANKET, EMERGENCY DISPOSABLE, 60 IN. X 90 IN. CONSTRUCTED WITH FOAM LAMINATION OVER POLY, WATERPROOF, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED IN PLASTIC BAGS.	6090 U.S. LAMINATING CORP.	19	19 EA	MOORE MEDICAL	17570	EACH	\$4.56	Dukal 22-130	22-130 54x80	each	\$6.20	
7344	INSECTICIDE, BEE & WASP KILLER 12 TO 15 OZ. AEROSOL CAN, EPA REG. #7754-39 NON-CONDUCTIVE UP TO 26,500 VOLTS REFERENCE BEE BOPPER AS MFG'D BY ARI.	61011ARI BEE BOPPER	1000	1,000 EA			CASE OF 12	\$61.20			each	\$5.39	
7345	REPELLENT, TICK/INSECT, 5-12 OZ. AEROSOL CAN. MUST CONTAIN BETWEEN 20 TO 30% DEET.	61604ARI BUG BARRIER II	200	200 EA			CASE OF 12	\$65.28	ARI 61605	2861605	each	\$9.10	
7346	INSECT REPELLENT, 2 OZ. PUMP SPRAY BOTTLE, 98.11% DEET (DIETHYL-M-TOLUAMIDE).	GF10025 TEC LABS	120	120 EA	TEC LABS	17331	CASE OF 48	\$236.13	TecLabs	FG10025	each	\$6.19	
7352	HAND CLEANER, WATERLESS, ANTISEPTIC BIO- HAND CLEANER, KILLS 99.9% OF GERMS, NO RINSING REQUIRED, CONTAINS ALOE VERA 12-16 OZ. PUMP BOTTLE, 12 PER CASE.	17354 SAFETEC	2100	2,100 EA			CASE OF 12	\$58.60			each	\$6.34	
7353	WATERLESS GERM KILLING AGENT, SUPPLIED TOWELETTE FORM, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, FOR ONE TIME USE. ACTIVE INGRED- IENT PCMX COMBINED WITH NON- OXYNOL-9 TO EFFECTIVELY DESTROY TB, STAPH, E-COLI, STREP AND OTHER MICRO-ORGAN- ISMS, 50-100 TOWELETTES/BOX.	V25100 VIONEX	120	120 BX			CASE OF 12	\$108.02			each box of 50	\$18.40	
10883	FIRST AID KIT, COMPACT, LATEX FREE. KIT INCLUDES: SCISSORS, FIRST AID GUIDE, ADHESIVE TAPE 1/2 IN. X 2 1/2 YDS, 2 STERILE GAUZE PADS 3 X 3 IN., 2 PLASTIC ADHESIVE BANDAGE EXTRA LARGE, 6 PVP IODINE WIPES, 4 FIRST AID/BURN CREAM WITH ALOE, ROLLER BANDAGE 2 IN. X 4.1 YDS, 8 PLASTIC ADHESIVE BANDAGE 1 X 3 IN., 1 ANTIBIOTIC OINTMENT POUCH KIT IS NOT TO CONTAIN ANY DRUGS, SUCH	019733-0020L NORTH SAFETY	19	19 EA			EACH	\$6.25			each	\$6.69	

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 1 - 1st Aid - Protective Materials	Rejected Alternate			SEAL (GLOVE MFG	INC / ARK S	SAFETY	Supreme Safety, Inc			
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number		Est Qty (2 yrs)	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM
	BLOODBORNE PATHOGEN/BODILY FLUID SPILL KIT - PLASTIC CASE CONTAINS THE FOLLOWING: 3 BZK ANTISEPTIC TOWELETTES, 1 DISPOSABLE GOWN W/FULL SLEEVES, 2 DISPOSABLE SHOE COVERS, 1 EYE SHIELD WITH EAR LOOP MASK, 1 FLUID CONTROL SOLIDIFIER PACK 21 GM, 1 BIOHAZARD SCOOP, 2 - 24 IN. X 24 IN. BIOHAZARD BAGS, 2 - 8 IN. X 12 IN. CLEAR PLASTIC BAGS, 2 TWISTIES, 2 - 5 IN. X 8 IN. GERMICIDAL (KILLS GERMS) WIPES, 3 DISPOSABLE CLEAN-UP TOWELS, 2 EXAM QUALITY VINYL GLOVES 1 PAIR, 1 BODILY FLUID PICK-UP GUIDE MEETS FEDERAL OSHA	214-U/FAO FIRST AID ONLY	63	63 EA			EACH	\$11.50			each	\$12.71
12755	REPELLENT, TICK/INSECT, 9 OZ. AERSOL CAN, CONTAINS THE ACTIVE INGEDIENT PERMETHRIN. 12 CANS PER CASE.	SP602 SAWYER	500	500 EA	SAWYER	SP646N	CASE OF 12 - 6 OZ	\$77.28			each	\$6.50
	CLEANSER, SKIN, OAK-N-IVY CLEANSING CREAM, 0.5 OZ PACKET, TECNU.	25333 TEC LABORATORIES	50	50 BOX			BOX OF 50	\$29.45			box	\$32.18
13116	REPELLENT, INSECT, TOWELETTES, CROC BLOC, REPELS BLACK FLIES, BITING MIDGES, DEER FLIES, STABLE FLIES, TICKS AND CHIGGERS, CONTAINS 52.25% DEET.	12-4000 CROC BLOC	50	50 BOX	CORTEX BUX X30	12640	CASE OF 4 BX	\$62.52	Honeywell	122004XA	box of 50	\$34.42
	DISPENSER, TISSUE LENS CLEANING, SIZE SMALL, METAL, GREEN, 3-3/8 IN. X 1-1/2 IN. X 9 IN.	1LCR24D BOUTON	50	50 EA			CASE OF 10	\$94.00			each	\$10.63
13346	TISSUE, LENS CLEANING, PRE-MOISTENED, SIGHT SAVERS, 5 IN. X 8 IN., ANTI-FOG, ANTI-STATIC, SILICONE-FREE, 100 SHEETS PER BOX.	8574GM BAUSCH & LOMB	50	50 BOX	MCR SAFETY	LCT	CASE OF 10 BX	\$44.00			each	\$10.96

NO BID

TOTAL EST. BID

Action Supply Products

Scott Electric

Arbill

Premier Safety & Service

1st Aid Protective Materials

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 1 - 1st Aid - Protective Materials	Rejected Alternate			Magid (Compar	afety Manufa ny, L.L.C. al Lot	acturing
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number		Est Qty (2 yrs)	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number		Bid Price per Ordering UOM
7342	BLANKET, EMERGENCY DISPOSABLE, 60 IN. X 90 IN. CONSTRUCTED WITH FOAM LAMINATION OVER POLY, WATERPROOF, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED IN PLASTIC BAGS.	6090 U.S. LAMINATING CORP.	19	19 EA	TIDI	980043	CASE OF 18	\$157.68
7344	INSECTICIDE, BEE & WASP KILLER 12 TO 15 OZ. AEROSOL CAN, EPA REG. #7754-39 NON-CONDUCTIVE UP TO 26,500 VOLTS REFERENCE BEE BOPPER AS MFG'D BY ARI.	61011ARI BEE BOPPER	1000	1,000 EA	ARI	61011	CASE OF 12	\$56.70
7345	REPELLENT, TICK/INSECT, 5-12 OZ. AEROSOL CAN. MUST CONTAIN BETWEEN 20 TO 30% DEET.	61604ARI BUG BARRIER II	200	200 EA	ARI	61604	CASE OF 12	\$64.80
7346	INSECT REPELLENT, 2 OZ. PUMP SPRAY BOTTLE, 98.11% DEET (DIETHYL-M-TOLUAMIDE).	GF10025 TEC LABS	120	120 EA			EA	\$4.55
7352	HAND CLEANER, WATERLESS, ANTISEPTIC BIO- HAND CLEANER, KILLS 99.9% OF GERMS, NO RINSING REQUIRED, CONTAINS ALOE VERA 12-16 OZ. PUMP BOTTLE, 12 PER CASE.	17354 SAFETEC	2100	2,100 EA			CASE OF 12	\$82.20
7353	WATERLESS GERM KILLING AGENT, SUPPLIED TOWELETTE FORM, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED, FOR ONE TIME USE. ACTIVE INGRED- IENT PCMX COMBINED WITH NON- OXYNOL-9 TO EFFECTIVELY DESTROY TB, STAPH, E-COLI, STREP AND OTHER MICRO-ORGAN- ISMS, 50-100 TOWELETTES/BOX.	V25100 VIONEX	120	120 BX			BOX OF 50	\$12.60
10883	FIRST AID KIT, COMPACT, LATEX FREE. KIT INCLUDES: SCISSORS, FIRST AID GUIDE, ADHESIVE TAPE 1/2 IN. X 2 1/2 YDS, 2 STERILE GAUZE PADS 3 X 3 IN., 2 PLASTIC ADHESIVE BANDAGE EXTRA LARGE, 6 PVP IODINE WIPES, 4 FIRST AID/BURN CREAM WITH ALOE, ROLLER BANDAGE 2 IN. X 4.1 YDS, 8 PLASTIC ADHESIVE BANDAGE 1 X 3 IN., 1 ANTIBIOTIC OINTMENT POUCH KIT IS NOT TO CONTAIN ANY DRUGS, SUCH	019733-0020L NORTH SAFETY	19	19 EA	MAGID	FAKGP	EA	\$21.15

1st Aid Protective Materials

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 1 - 1st Aid - Protective Materials	Rejected Alternate			Magid Glove and Safety Manufacturing Company, L.L.C. Partial Lot						
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number		, ,	Alternate Manufacturer Name			Bid Price per Ordering UOM			
10913	BLOODBORNE PATHOGEN/BODILY FLUID SPILL KIT - PLASTIC CASE CONTAINS THE FOLLOWING: 3 BZK ANTISEPTIC TOWELETTES, 1 DISPOSABLE GOWN W/FULL SLEEVES, 2 DISPOSABLE SHOE COVERS, 1 EYE SHIELD WITH EAR LOOP MASK, 1 FLUID CONTROL SOLIDIFIER PACK 21 GM, 1 BIOHAZARD SCOOP, 2 - 24 IN. X 24 IN. BIOHAZARD BAGS, 2 - 8 IN. X 12 IN. CLEAR PLASTIC BAGS, 2 TWISTIES, 2 - 5 IN. X 8 IN. GERMICIDAL (KILLS GERMS) WIPES, 3 DISPOSABLE CLEAN-UP TOWELS, 2 EXAM QUALITY VINYL GLOVES 1 PAIR, 1 BODILY FLUID PICK-UP GUIDE MEETS FEDERAL OSHA	214-U/FAO FIRST AID ONLY	63	63 EA	SPILLTECH	FLKITST	EA	\$272.15			
12755	REPELLENT, TICK/INSECT, 9 OZ. AERSOL CAN, CONTAINS THE ACTIVE INGEDIENT PERMETHRIN. 12 CANS PER CASE.	SP602 SAWYER	500	500 EA							
13115	CLEANSER, SKIN, OAK-N-IVY CLEANSING CREAM, 0.5 OZ PACKET, TECNU.	25333 TEC LABORATORIES	50	50 BOX							
13116	REPELLENT, INSECT, TOWELETTES, CROC BLOC, REPELS BLACK FLIES, BITING MIDGES, DEER FLIES, STABLE FLIES, TICKS AND CHIGGERS, CONTAINS 52.25% DEET.	12-4000 CROC BLOC	50	50 BOX	CORETEX	12644	BOX OF 50	\$28.55			
13273	DISPENSER, TISSUE LENS CLEANING, SIZE SMALL, METAL, GREEN, 3-3/8 IN. X 1-1/2 IN. X 9 IN.	1LCR24D BOUTON	50	50 EA	RADIANS	ILCR24D	CASE OF 20	\$184.00			
13346	TISSUE, LENS CLEANING, PRE-MOISTENED, SIGHT SAVERS, 5 IN. X 8 IN., ANTI-FOG, ANTI-STATIC, SILICONE-FREE, 100 SHEETS PER BOX.	8574GM BAUSCH & LOMB	50	50 BOX	MAGID	M100D	BOX OF 100	\$6.20			

NO BID

TOTAL EST. BID

Action Supply Products

Scott Electric

Arbill

Premier Safety & Service

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 2 - Gloves	Rejected Alternate		S	tauffer Glov	e and Safet	у		WESCO D	istributio	n Inc (Vendo	r# 4007)	
Materia	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number	Est Qty (2 yrs)	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM	EST TOTAL	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM	EST TOTAL
7220	GLOVES, MECHANICS WORK, SMALL COLOR: BLACK, FASTFIT GLOVE, DURABLE SMOOTH SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM, WITH BREATHABLE MESH BACK, INDEX FINGER KNUCKLE REINFORCEMENT BANDS FOR STRENGTH AND PROTECTION, CONCEALED SEAMS FOR SNAG RESISTANCE, LYCRA PANELS BETWEEN FINGERS ULTRA THIN TPR (THERMAL PLASTIC RUBBER), HOOK AND LOOP CLOSURES, SIZE: 8 SMALL.	MFF-05-008 MECHANIX WEAR	24 PR			PR	\$8.79	\$210.96			1/PR	\$8.33	\$199.92
7221	GLOVES, MECHANICS WORK, MEDIUM COLOR: BLACK, FASTFIT GLOVE, DURABLE SMOOTH SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM, WITH BREATHABLE MESH BACK, INDEX FINGER KNUCKLE REINFORCEMENT BANDS FOR STRENGTH AND PROTECTION, CONCEALED SEAMS FOR SNAG RESISTANCE, LYCRA PANELS BETWEEN FINGERS ULTRA THIN TPR (THERMAL PLASTIC RUBBER),HOOK AND LOOP CLOSURES, SIZE: 9 MEDIUM.	MFF-05-009 MECHANIX WEAR	150 PR			PR	\$8.79	\$1,318.50			1/PR	\$8.33	\$1,249.50
7222	GLOVES, MECHANICS WORK, LARGE COLOR: BLACK, FASTFIT GLOVE, DURABLE SMOOTH SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM, WITH BREATHABLE MESH BACK, INDEX FINGER KNUCKLE REINFORCEMENT BANDS FOR STRENGTH AND PROTECTION, CONCEALED SEAMS FOR SNAG RESISTANCE, LYCRA PANELS BETWEEN FINGERS ULTRA THIN TPR (THERMAL PLASTIC RUBBER), HOOK AND LOOP CLOSURES, SIZE: 10 LARGE.	MFF-05-010 MECHANIX WEAR	350 PR			PR	\$8.79	\$3,076.50			1/PR	\$8.33	\$2,915.50
7223	GLOVES, MECHANICS WORK, X-LARGE COLOR: BLACK, FASTFIT GLOVE, DURABLE SMOOTH SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM, WITH BREATHABLE MESH BACK, INDEX FINGER KNUCKLE REINFORCEMENT BANDS FOR STRENGTH AND PROTECTION, CONCEALED SEAMS FOR SNAG RESISTANCE, LYCRA PANELS BETWEEN FINGERS ULTRA THIN TPR (THERMAL PLASTIC RUBBER), HOOK AND LOOP CLOSURES, SIZE: 11 X-LARGE.	MFF-05-011 MECHANIX WEAR	500 PR			PR	\$8.79	\$4,395.00			1/PR	\$8.33	\$4,165.00
7224	GLOVES, MECHANICS WORK, XX-LARGE COLOR: BLACK, FASTFIT GLOVE, DURABLE SMOOTH SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM, WITH BREATHABLE MESH BACK, INDEX FINGER KNUCKLE REINFORCEMENT BANDS FOR STRENGTH AND PROTECTION, CONCEALED SEAMS FOR SNAG RESISTANCE, LYCRA PANELS BETWEEN FINGERS ULTRA THIN TPR (THERMAL PLASTIC RUBBER), HOOK AND LOOP CLOSURES, SIZE: 12 XX-LARGE.	MFF-05-012 MECHANIX WEAR	260 PR			PR	\$8.79	\$2,285.40			1/PR	\$8.33	\$2,165.80
7225	GLOVES, 12 IN. GAUNTLET CUFF, WINTER MONKEY GRIP, PVC COATED, VINYL COATING RESISTS CHEMICALS AND ABRASIONS, STAYS SOFT WHEN COLD, FOAM INSULATED WITH SOFT JERSEY LINING.	23-152 ANSELL	24 PR	LIBERTY GLOVE	2520	PR	\$2.04	\$48.96	ANSELL: Ansell Winter Monkey Grip Gloves: Vinyl-	104725	1/PR	\$6.44	\$154.56

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 2 - Gloves	Rejected Alternate		S	Stauffer Glove and Safety				WESCO Distribution Inc (Vendor# 4007)				FOT TOTAL
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number	Est Qty (2 yrs)	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	t Bid Price per Ordering UOM	EST TOTAL	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM	EST TOTAL
7226	GLOVES, NEOPRENE COATED: RESISTANT TO A BROAD RANGE OF CHEMICALS. FLANNEL LINED. FULLY DIPPED. KNIT WRIST, CURVED FINGERS, WING THUMB. SIZE LARGE.	BEST	220 PR			PR	\$3.99	\$877.80			DZ	\$48.80	\$894.67
7229	GLOVES, HEAT RESISTANT: FOR USE WITH TAR KETTLE OPERATIONS AND HEATS UP TO 1000 DEGREE F, MADE OF DUPONT KEVLAR 29 ARAMID FIBER, WOOL LINING, ONE PIECE BACK. 11 INCHES SIZE: EXTRA LARGE.	APPAREL	1 PR			PR	\$31.13	\$31.13			1/PR	\$30.76	\$30.76
7230	GLOVES, WELDERS: "WELDER'S TANNAGE", HEAT RISISTANT, SIDE SPLIT LEATHER, GUNN CUT, WING THUMB, WELTED SEAMS, FULLY LINED FRONT AND BACK WITH FIRE-RETARDANT LINING, FULL FINGER INSERTS, GAUNTLET CUFF, 14 INCHES OVERALL, SIZE X-LARGE. Removed from bid.	S17WCI SEAL GLOVE	0 PR	STAUFFER	411SPJ	PR	\$3.38	\$0.00	CORDOVA: Direct Safety Heavy Side Split Leather Gloves: Gauntlet Cuff, Men's	7650	1/PR	\$4.42	\$0.00
7334	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, 100 % NITRILE, AMBIDEXTROUS, PEBBLED TEXTURE, POWDER FREE, LENGTH 9.5 IN., THICKNESS 5 MIL, COLOR: LT. BLUE SIZE: SMALL, 100 PER BOX.	7500PF-S BEST (BOX - new order unit)	70,000 EA			ВХ	\$7.00	\$4,900.00	,		100/BX	\$4.83	\$3,381.00
7335	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, 100 % NITRILE, AMBIDEXTROUS, PEBBLED TEXTURE, POWDER FREE, LENGTH 9.5 IN., THICKNESS 5 MIL, COLOR: LT. BLUE SIZE: MEDIUM, 100 PER BOX.	7500PF-M BEST (BOX - new order unit)	100,000 EA			ВХ	\$7.00	\$7,000.00			100/BX	\$4.83	\$4,830.00
7336	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, 100% NITRILE, AMBIDEXTROUS, PEBBLED TEXTURE, POWDER FREE, LENGTH 9.5 IN., THICKNESS 5 MIL, COLOR: LT. BLUE SIZE: LARGE, 100 PER BOX.	7500PF-L BEST (BOX - new order unit)	125,300 EA			ВХ	\$7.00	\$8,771.00			100/BX	\$4.83	\$6,051.99
7337	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, 100% NITRILE, AMBIDEXTROUS, PEBBLED TEXTURE, POWDER FREE, LENGTH 9.5 IN., THICKNESS 5 MIL, COLOR: LT. BLUE SIZE: X-LARGE, 100 PER BOX.	7500PF-XL BEST (BOX - new order unit)	155,500 EA			ВХ	\$7.00	\$10,885.00			100/BX	\$4.83	\$7,510.65
7367	GLOVES, SURGICAL LATEX, LARGE, AMBIDEXTROUS, 13 MIL THICK FINGERTIPS PALMS AND CUFFS	SG375L MICROFLEX SAFEGRIP (BOX - new order unit)	21,500 EA			ВХ	\$11.50	\$4,945.00			50/BX	\$10.48	\$4,506.40
7368	GLOVES, SURGICAL LATEX, MEDIUM, AMBIDEXTROUS, 13 MIL THICK FINGERTIPS, PALMS AND CUFFS.	SG375M MICROFLEX SAFEGRIP (BOX - new order unit)	11,300 EA			ВХ	\$11.50	\$2,599.00			50/BX	\$10.48	\$2,368.48
7369	FINGERTIPS, PALMS AND CUFFS.	SG375S MICROFLEX SAFEGRIP (BOX - new order unit)	1,500 EA			BX	\$11.50	\$345.00			50/BX	\$10.48	\$314.40
7370	GLOVES, SURGICAL LATEX, X-LARGE, AMBIDEXTROUS, 13 MIL THICK FINGERTIPS, PALMS AND CUFFS.	SG375XL MICROFLEX SAFEGRIP (BOX - new order unit)	38,000 EA			BX	\$11.50	\$8,740.00			50/BX	\$10.48	\$7,964.80

SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR:TAN/CREAM.

Grain

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 2 - Gloves	Rejected Alternate		Stauffer Glove and Safety			WESCO Distribution Inc (Vendor# 4007)						
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number	Est Qty (2 yrs)	Alternate Manufacturer Name		Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM	EST TOTAL	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM	EST TOTAL
11593	GLOVES, DRIVERS, MEDIUM, CUFF COLOR GREEN, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-M STAUFFER	670 PR			PR	\$2.79	\$1,869.30	CORDOVA: Direct Safety High-Visibility Grain	8211HVM	1/PR	\$4.32	\$2,894.40
11594	GLOVES, DRIVERS, LARGE, CUFF COLOR BROWN, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-L STAUFFER	1,800 PR			PR	\$2.79	\$5,022.00	CORDOVA: Direct Safety High-Visibility Grain	8211HVL	1/PR	\$4.32	\$7,776.00
11595	GLOVES, DRIVER, X-LARGE, CUFF COLOR BLUE, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-XL STAUFFER	2,900 PR			PR	\$2.79	\$8,091.00	CORDOVA: Direct Safety High-Visibility Grain	8211HVXL	1/PR	\$4.53	\$13,137.00
11596	GLOVES, DRIVERS, XX-LARGE, CUFF COLOR BLACK, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-2X STAUFFER	1,400 PR			PR	\$3.34	\$4,676.00	CORDOVA: Direct Safety Grain Cowhide	8210XXL	1/PR	\$4.53	\$6,342.00
11603	GLOVES, DRIVER, XX-LARGE, CUFF COLOR BLACK, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, COTTON FLANNEL LINING INSULATION, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC GUNN CUT PATTERN,STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR:TAN/CREAM.	800LEJ-2X STAUFFER	559 PR			PR	\$4.73	\$2,644.07	CORDOVA: GLOVE GRAIN COWHIDE DRIVERS GLOVES:	8240XXL	DZ	\$62.22	\$2,898.42
11975	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, MICROFLEX SYNETRON, POLYMER COATED, POWDER FREE, LATEX GOLVES, FULLY TEXTURED EXTENDED BEADED CUFF, LENGTH 12 IN., THICKNESS 9 MIL, SIZE 2X LARGE, COLOR NATURAL, 50 PER BOX.	SY-911-XXL MICROFLEX SYNTRON (BOX - new order unit)	6,500 EA			BX	\$12.94	\$1,682.20			500/CS	\$93.56	\$1,216.28
11976	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, MICROFLEX SYNETRON, POLYMER COATED, POWDER FREE, LATEX GOLVES, FULLY TEXTURED EXTENDED BEADED CUFF, LENGTH 12 IN., THICKNESS 9 MIL, SIZE 3X LARGE, COLOR NATURAL, 40 PER BOX.	SY-911-3XL MICROFLEX SYNTRON (BOX - new order unit)	6,400 EA			BX	\$12.94	\$2,070.40			400/CS	\$93.56	\$1,496.96
		TOTAL EST. BID						\$105,048.47	•				\$111,698.17

 TOTAL EST. BID
 \$105,048.47
 \$111,698.17

 EST. SPLIT
 92,161.19
 41,824.51
 50,336.68

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 2 - Gloves	Rejected Alternate		SEAL G	LOVE MFG	INC / ARK SA		Magid Glove and Safety Manufacturing Company, L.L.C.				FOLIOTAL	
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number	Est Qty (2 yrs)	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number		per Ordering UOM	EST TOTAL	Alternate Manufacturer Name		Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM	EST TOTAL
11593	GLOVES, DRIVERS, MEDIUM, CUFF COLOR GREEN, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-M STAUFFER	670 PR	WEST CHESTER GEAR	994-M	DOZEN	\$36.00	\$2,010.00	MAGID	B941EM	DZ	\$47.76	\$2,666.60
11594	GLOVES, DRIVERS, LARGE, CUFF COLOR BROWN, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-L STAUFFER	1,800 PR	WEST CHESTER GEAR	994-L	DOZEN	\$36.00	\$5,400.00	MAGID	B941EL	DZ	\$47.76	\$7,164.00
11595	GLOVES, DRIVER, X-LARGE, CUFF COLOR BLUE, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-XL STAUFFER	2,900 PR	WEST CHESTER GEAR	994-XL	DOZEN	\$38.40	\$9,280.00	MAGID	B941EXL	DZ	\$47.76	\$11,542.00
11596	GLOVES, DRIVERS, XX-LARGE, CUFF COLOR BLACK, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-2X STAUFFER	1,400 PR	WEST CHESTER GEAR	994-2XL	DOZEN	\$43.00	\$5,016.67	MAGID	B6741EXXL	DZ	\$50.28	\$5,866.00
11603	GLOVES, DRIVER, XX-LARGE, CUFF COLOR BLACK, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, COTTON FLANNEL LINING INSULATION, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC GUNN CUT PATTERN,STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR:TAN/CREAM.	800LEJ-2X STAUFFER	559 PR	WEST CHESTER GEAR	994KF-2XL	DOZEN	\$60.50	\$2,818.29	MAGID	B742EXXL	DZ	\$63.36	\$2,951.52
11975	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, MICROFLEX SYNETRON, POLYMER COATED, POWDER FREE, LATEX GOLVES, FULLY TEXTURED EXTENDED BEADED CUFF, LENGTH 12 IN., THICKNESS 9 MIL, SIZE 2X LARGE, COLOR NATURAL, 50 PER BOX.	SY-911-XXL MICROFLEX SYNTRON (BOX - new order unit)	6,500 EA			CASE OF 10 E	\$107.56	\$1,398.28			ВХ	\$12.55	\$1,631.50
11976	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, MICROFLEX SYNETRON, POLYMER COATED, POWDER FREE, LATEX GOLVES, FULLY TEXTURED EXTENDED BEADED CUFF, LENGTH 12 IN., THICKNESS 9 MIL, SIZE 3X LARGE, COLOR NATURAL, 40 PER BOX.	SY-911-3XL MICROFLEX SYNTRON (BOX - new order unit)	6,400 EA			CASE OF 10 E	\$107.56	\$1,720.96			ВХ	\$12.55	\$2,008.00

TOTAL EST. BID \$104,703.20 \$111,325.06

EST. SPLIT 92,161.19

Lot	2 -	page	19
-01	_	PUDC	

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 2 - Gloves	Rejected Alternate		Ewing Safety and Industrial Inc Alternate Alternate Ordering Unit Bid Price				Fastenal Company				
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number	Est Qty (2 yrs)		Alternate Part Number	Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM		Alternate Part Number		Bid Price per Ordering UOM	
7226	GLOVES, NEOPRENE COATED: RESISTANT TO A BROAD RANGE OF CHEMICALS. FLANNEL LINED. FULLY DIPPED. KNIT WRIST, CURVED FINGERS, WING THUMB. SIZE LARGE.	2360 MAGID SHOWA BEST	220 PR	Showa Best	5122-L	Pair	\$3.90	SHOWA BEST	5122-10	EA	\$3.92	
7229	GLOVES, HEAT RESISTANT: FOR USE WITH TAR KETTLE OPERATIONS AND HEATS UP TO 1000 DEGREE F, MADE OF DUPONT KEVLAR 29 ARAMID FIBER, WOOL LINING, ONE PIECE BACK. 11 INCHES SIZE: EXTRA LARGE.	APPAREL	1 PR			Pair	\$35.1600			EA	\$48.38	
7230	GLOVES, WELDERS: "WELDER'S TANNAGE", HEAT RISISTANT, SIDE SPLIT LEATHER, GUNN CUT, WING THUMB, WELTED SEAMS, FULLY LINED FRONT AND BACK WITH FIRE-RETARDANT LINING, FULL FINGER INSERTS, GAUNTLET CUFF, 14 INCHES OVERALL, SIZE X-LARGE.	S17WCI SEAL GLOVE	0 PR	West Chester	930	Pair	\$3.4800	STEINER IND.	2119Y-X	EA	\$12.55	
	Removed from bid.											
7334	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, 100 % NITRILE, AMBIDEXTROUS, PEBBLED TEXTURE, POWDER FREE, LENGTH 9.5 IN., THICKNESS 5 MIL, COLOR: LT. BLUE SIZE: SMALL, 100 PER BOX.	7500PF-S BEST (BOX - new order unit)	70,000 EA			Box of 100 ea	\$6.3900			100	\$7.05	
7335	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, 100 % NITRILE, AMBIDEXTROUS, PEBBLED TEXTURE, POWDER FREE, LENGTH 9.5 IN., THICKNESS 5 MIL, COLOR: LT. BLUE SIZE: MEDIUM, 100 PER BOX.	7500PF-M BEST (BOX - new order unit)	100,000 EA			Box of 100 ea	\$6.3900			100	\$7.05	
7336	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, 100% NITRILE, AMBIDEXTROUS, PEBBLED TEXTURE, POWDER FREE, LENGTH 9.5 IN., THICKNESS 5 MIL, COLOR: LT. BLUE SIZE: LARGE, 100 PER BOX.	7500PF-L BEST (BOX - new order unit)	125,300 EA			Box of 100 ea	\$6.3900			100	\$7.05	
7337	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, 100% NITRILE, AMBIDEXTROUS, PEBBLED TEXTURE, POWDER FREE, LENGTH 9.5 IN., THICKNESS 5 MIL, COLOR: LT. BLUE SIZE: X-LARGE, 100 PER BOX.	7500PF-XL BEST (BOX - new order unit)	155,500 EA			Box of 100 ea	\$6.3900			100	\$7.05	
7367	GLOVES, SURGICAL LATEX, LARGE, AMBIDEXTROUS, 13 MIL THICK FINGERTIPS PALMS AND CUFFS	SG375L MICROFLEX SAFEGRIP (BOX - new order unit)	21,500 EA			Box of 50 ea	\$11.7800			50	\$13.37	
7368	GLOVES, SURGICAL LATEX, MEDIUM, AMBIDEXTROUS, 13 MIL THICK FINGERTIPS, PALMS AND CUFFS.	SG375M MICROFLEX SAFEGRIP (BOX - new order unit)	11,300 EA			Box of 50 ea	\$11.7800			50	\$13.37	
7369	GLOVES, SURGICAL LATEX, SMALL, AMBIDEXTROUS, 13 MIL THICK FINGERTIPS, PALMS AND CUFFS.	SG375S MICROFLEX SAFEGRIP (BOX - new order unit)	1,500 EA			Box of 50 ea	\$11.7800			50	\$13.37	
7370	GLOVES, SURGICAL LATEX, X-LARGE, AMBIDEXTROUS, 13 MIL THICK FINGERTIPS, PALMS AND CUFFS.	SG375XL MICROFLEX SAFEGRIP (BOX - new order unit)	38,000 EA			Box of 50 ea	\$11.7800			50	\$13.37	

	LOT 2 - Gloves										
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number	Est Qty (2 yrs)	Alternate Manufacturer Name			Bid Price per Ordering UOM			Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM
9814	GLOVES, WORK, COLOR: BLACK, SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM WITH STRETCH BACK, NEOPRENE GUARDS OVER KNUCKLES AND FINGERS, WING THUMB, VELCRO WRIST CLOSURE, SIZE: MEDIUM.	PGP40T-M PRO GRADE PLUS HAND MASTER	4 PR	West Chester	86540/M	Pair	\$10.7300	BODY GUARD	1022414	EA	\$20.60
9815	GLOVES, WORK, COLOR: BLACK, SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM WITH STRETCH BACK, NEOPRENE GUARDS OVER KNUCKLES AND FINGERS, WING THUMB, VELCRO WRIST CLOSURE, SIZE: LARGE.	PGP40T-L PRO GRADE PLUS HAND MASTER	12 PR	West Chester	86540/L	Pair	\$10.7300	BODY GUARD	1022413	EA	\$20.60
9816	GLOVES, WORK, COLOR: BLACK, SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM WITH STRETCH BACK, NEOPRENE GUARDS OVER KNUCKLES AND FINGERS, WING THUMB, VELCRO WRIST CLOSURE, SIZE: X-LARGE.	PGP40T-XL PROGRADE PLUS HAND MASTER	24 PR	West Chester	86540/XL	Pair	\$10.7300	BODY GUARD	1022412	EA	\$20.60
10679	GLOVES, BLUE/GREEN, 15 MIL FLOCK-LINED NITRILE, TEXTURED GRIP, CONTOURED PALMS AND CURVED FINGERS, 13 IN LENGTH, REUSABLE SOLD BY DOZEN - MUST ORDER IN MULTIPLES OF 12 EACH SIZE: X-LARGE	151397(XL) GEMPLER'S	60 PR	West Chester	33418/XL	Dozen	\$12.2000	BODY GUARD	600281	EA	\$1.30
11549	GLOVES, DRIVER, SMALL, CUFF COLOR RED, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, COTTON FLANNEL LINING INSULATION, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR:TAN/CREAM.	800LEJ-S STAUFFER	175 PR	West Chester	994KF/S	Pair	\$4.3200	WEST CHESTER	944KF/S	EA	\$5.80
11550	GLOVES, DRIVER, MEDIUM, CUFF COLOR GREEN, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, COTTON FLANNEL LINING INSULATION, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN,STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	800LEJ-M STAUFFER	730 PR	West Chester	994KF/M	Pair	\$4.3200	WEST CHESTER	944KF/M	EA	\$5.80
11551	GLOVES, DRIVER, LARGE, CUFF COLOR BROWN, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, COTTON FLANNEL LINING INSULATION, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	800LEJ-L STAUFFER	1,450 PR	West Chester	994KF/L	Pair	\$4.3200	WEST CHESTER	944KF/L	EA	\$5.80
11552	GLOVES, DRIVER, X-LARGE, CUFF COLOR BLUE, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, COTTON FLANNEL LINING INSULATION, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	800LEJ-XL STAUFFER	2,000 PR	West Chester	994KF/XL	Pair	\$4.5200	WEST CHESTER	944KF/XL	EA	\$6.05
11572	GLOVES, DRIVERS, SMALL, CUFF COLOR RED, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR:TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-S STAUFFER	210 PR	West Chester	995KOT/S	Pair	\$3.9500	WEST CHESTER	944/S	EA	\$4.15

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 2 - Gloves	Rejected Alternate		Ew	ing Safety aı	nd Industrial	Inc	Fastenal Company			
Material	Description				Alternate Part Number		Ordering		Part Number		Bid Price per Ordering UOM
11593	GLOVES, DRIVERS, MEDIUM, CUFF COLOR GREEN, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-M STAUFFER	670 PR	West Chester	995KOT/M	Pair	\$3.9500	WEST CHESTER	944/M	EA	\$4.15
11594	GLOVES, DRIVERS, LARGE, CUFF COLOR BROWN, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-L STAUFFER	1,800 PR	Chester	995KOT/L	Pair	\$3.9500	CHESTER	944/L	EA	\$4.15
11595	GLOVES, DRIVER, X-LARGE, CUFF COLOR BLUE, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-XL STAUFFER	2,900 PR	West Chester	995KOT/XL	Pair	\$3.9500	WEST CHESTER	944/XL	EA	\$4.40
11596	GLOVES, DRIVERS, XX-LARGE, CUFF COLOR BLACK, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-2X STAUFFER	1,400 PR	West Chester	995KOT/XXL	Pair	\$3.9500	WEST CHESTER	944/XXL	EA	\$4.85
11603	,,,,	800LEJ-2X STAUFFER	559 PR	West Chester	994KF/XXL	Pair	\$4.8900	WEST CHESTER	944KF/XXL	EA	\$6.50
11975	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, MICROFLEX SYNETRON, POLYMER COATED, POWDER FREE, LATEX GOLVES, FULLY TEXTURED EXTENDED BEADED CUFF, LENGTH 12 IN., THICKNESS 9 MIL, SIZE 2X LARGE, COLOR NATURAL, 50 PER BOX.	SY-911-XXL MICROFLEX SYNTRON (BOX - new order unit)	6,500 EA			Box of 50 eac	\$12.0400			50	\$13.67
11976	, , , -	SY-911-3XL MICROFLEX	6,400 EA			Box of 50 eac	\$12.0400			40	\$13.67

TOTAL EST. BID

EST. SPLIT

92,161.19

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation	Rejected Alternate		W W Grainger Inc				Supreme Safety, Inc			
	Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017										
	LOT 2 - Gloves										
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number	Est Qty (2 yrs)	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Part Number	Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM
7220	GLOVES, MECHANICS WORK, SMALL COLOR: BLACK, FASTFIT GLOVE, DURABLE SMOOTH SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM, WITH BREATHABLE MESH BACK, INDEX FINGER KNUCKLE REINFORCEMENT BANDS FOR STRENGTH AND PROTECTION, CONCEALED SEAMS FOR SNAG RESISTANCE, LYCRA PANELS BETWEEN FINGERS ULTRA THIN TPR (THERMAL PLASTIC RUBBER), HOOK AND LOOP CLOSURES, SIZE: 8 SMALL.	MFF-05-008 MECHANIX WEAR	24 PR	Wear	MFF-05-008 WWG 16V423	Each	\$10.06			pair	\$12.2200
7221	GLOVES, MECHANICS WORK, MEDIUM COLOR: BLACK, FASTFIT GLOVE, DURABLE SMOOTH SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM, WITH BREATHABLE MESH BACK, INDEX FINGER KNUCKLE REINFORCEMENT BANDS FOR STRENGTH AND PROTECTION, CONCEALED SEAMS FOR SNAG RESISTANCE, LYCRA PANELS BETWEEN FINGERS ULTRA THIN TPR (THERMAL PLASTIC RUBBER),HOOK AND LOOP CLOSURES, SIZE: 9 MEDIUM.	MFF-05-009 MECHANIX WEAR	150 PR	Mechanix Wear	MFF-05-009 WWG 16V424	Each	\$10.06			pair	\$12.2200
7222	GLOVES, MECHANICS WORK, LARGE COLOR: BLACK, FASTFIT GLOVE, DURABLE SMOOTH SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM, WITH BREATHABLE MESH BACK, INDEX FINGER KNUCKLE REINFORCEMENT BANDS FOR STRENGTH AND PROTECTION, CONCEALED SEAMS FOR SNAG RESISTANCE, LYCRA PANELS BETWEEN FINGERS ULTRA THIN TPR (THERMAL PLASTIC RUBBER),HOOK AND LOOP CLOSURES, SIZE: 10 LARGE.	MFF-05-010 MECHANIX WEAR	350 PR	Mechanix Wear	MFF-05-010 WWG 16V425	Each	\$10.06			pair	\$12.2200
7223	GLOVES, MECHANICS WORK, X-LARGE COLOR: BLACK, FASTFIT GLOVE, DURABLE SMOOTH SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM, WITH BREATHABLE MESH BACK, INDEX FINGER KNUCKLE REINFORCEMENT BANDS FOR STRENGTH AND PROTECTION, CONCEALED SEAMS FOR SNAG RESISTANCE, LYCRA PANELS BETWEEN FINGERS ULTRA THIN TPR (THERMAL PLASTIC RUBBER), HOOK AND LOOP CLOSURES, SIZE: 11 X-LARGE.	MFF-05-011 MECHANIX WEAR	500 PR	Mechanix Wear	MFF-05-011 WWG 16V426	Each	\$10.06			pair	\$12.2200
7224	GLOVES, MECHANICS WORK, XX-LARGE COLOR: BLACK, FASTFIT GLOVE, DURABLE SMOOTH SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM, WITH BREATHABLE MESH BACK, INDEX FINGER KNUCKLE REINFORCEMENT BANDS FOR STRENGTH AND PROTECTION, CONCEALED SEAMS FOR SNAG RESISTANCE, LYCRA PANELS BETWEEN FINGERS ULTRA THIN TPR (THERMAL PLASTIC RUBBER), HOOK AND LOOP CLOSURES, SIZE: 12 XX-LARGE.	MFF-05-012 MECHANIX WEAR	260 PR	Mechanix Wear	MFF-05-012 WWG 16V427	Each	\$10.06			pair	\$12.2200
7225	GLOVES, 12 IN. GAUNTLET CUFF, WINTER MONKEY GRIP, PVC COATED, VINYL COATING RESISTS CHEMICALS AND ABRASIONS, STAYS SOFT WHEN COLD, FOAM INSULATED WITH SOFT JERSEY LINING.	23-152 ANSELL	24 PR	Ansell	23-491 WWG 6AJ76	Pair	\$8.25	23-152 discontinued use part number 23-	Ansell 23-173	pair	\$7.3300

(BOX - new order unit)

Lot 2 -	page	25
---------	------	----

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 2 - Gloves	Rejected Alternate		W W Grainger Inc				Supreme Safety, Inc			
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number		Alternate Manufacturer Name		Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM	Alternate Manufacturer Name			Bid Price per Ordering UOM
11593	GLOVES, DRIVERS, MEDIUM, CUFF COLOR GREEN, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-M STAUFFER	670 PR	Condor	WWG 3AW80	Pair	\$5.66	Global Glove	3100P-M	pair	\$4.3500
11594	GLOVES, DRIVERS, LARGE, CUFF COLOR BROWN, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-L STAUFFER	1,800 PR	Condor	WWG 5AC74	Pair	\$5.66	Global Glove	3100P-L	pair	\$4.3500
11595	GLOVES, DRIVER, X-LARGE, CUFF COLOR BLUE, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-XL STAUFFER	2,900 PR	Condor	WWG 1AD52	Pair	\$5.83	Global Glove	3100P-XL	pair	\$4.4700
11596	GLOVES, DRIVERS, XX-LARGE, CUFF COLOR BLACK, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-2X STAUFFER	1,400 PR	Condor	WWG 2MCZ4	Pair	\$6.53	Global Glove	3100P-XXL	pair	\$4.5400
11603	GLOVES, DRIVER, XX-LARGE, CUFF COLOR BLACK, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, COTTON FLANNEL LINING INSULATION, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC GUNN CUT PATTERN,STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR:TAN/CREAM.	800LEJ-2X STAUFFER	559 PR	Condor	WWG 2MCZ6	Pair	\$5.55	Global Glove	994KF/2XL	pair	\$5.1000
11975	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, MICROFLEX SYNETRON, POLYMER COATED, POWDER FREE, LATEX GOLVES, FULLY TEXTURED EXTENDED BEADED CUFF, LENGTH 12 IN., THICKNESS 9 MIL, SIZE 2X LARGE, COLOR NATURAL, 50 PER BOX.	SY-911-XXL MICROFLEX SYNTRON (BOX - new order unit)	6,500 EA	Microflex	SY-911 WWG 49CD36	Pack of 50	\$12.85			box of 50	\$12.5500
11976	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, MICROFLEX SYNETRON, POLYMER COATED, POWDER FREE, LATEX GOLVES, FULLY TEXTURED EXTENDED BEADED CUFF, LENGTH 12 IN., THICKNESS 9 MIL, SIZE 3X LARGE, COLOR NATURAL, 40 PER BOX.	SY-911-3XL MICROFLEX	6,400 EA	Microflex	SY-911 WWG 49CD37	Pack of 40	\$12.85			box of 50	\$12.5500

TOTAL EST. BID

EST. SPLIT

92,161.19

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 2 - Gloves	Rejected Alternate		Veritiv - Partial Lot			
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number	Est Qty (2 yrs)	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM
7220	GLOVES, MECHANICS WORK, SMALL COLOR: BLACK, FASTFIT GLOVE, DURABLE SMOOTH SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM, WITH BREATHABLE MESH BACK, INDEX FINGER KNUCKLE REINFORCEMENT BANDS FOR STRENGTH AND PROTECTION, CONCEALED SEAMS FOR SNAG RESISTANCE, LYCRA PANELS BETWEEN FINGERS ULTRA THIN TPR (THERMAL PLASTIC RUBBER), HOOK AND LOOP CLOSURES, SIZE: 8 SMALL.	MFF-05-008 MECHANIX WEAR	24 PR				
7221	GLOVES, MECHANICS WORK, MEDIUM COLOR: BLACK, FASTFIT GLOVE, DURABLE SMOOTH SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM, WITH BREATHABLE MESH BACK, INDEX FINGER KNUCKLE REINFORCEMENT BANDS FOR STRENGTH AND PROTECTION, CONCEALED SEAMS FOR SNAG RESISTANCE, LYCRA PANELS BETWEEN FINGERS ULTRA THIN TPR (THERMAL PLASTIC RUBBER),HOOK AND LOOP CLOSURES, SIZE: 9 MEDIUM.	MFF-05-009 MECHANIX WEAR	150 PR				
7222	GLOVES, MECHANICS WORK, LARGE COLOR: BLACK, FASTFIT GLOVE, DURABLE SMOOTH SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM, WITH BREATHABLE MESH BACK, INDEX FINGER KNUCKLE REINFORCEMENT BANDS FOR STRENGTH AND PROTECTION, CONCEALED SEAMS FOR SNAG RESISTANCE, LYCRA PANELS BETWEEN FINGERS ULTRA THIN TPR (THERMAL PLASTIC RUBBER),HOOK AND LOOP CLOSURES, SIZE: 10 LARGE.	MFF-05-010 MECHANIX WEAR	350 PR				
7223	GLOVES, MECHANICS WORK, X-LARGE COLOR: BLACK, FASTFIT GLOVE, DURABLE SMOOTH SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM, WITH BREATHABLE MESH BACK, INDEX FINGER KNUCKLE REINFORCEMENT BANDS FOR STRENGTH AND PROTECTION, CONCEALED SEAMS FOR SNAG RESISTANCE, LYCRA PANELS BETWEEN FINGERS ULTRA THIN TPR (THERMAL PLASTIC RUBBER), HOOK AND LOOP CLOSURES, SIZE: 11 X-LARGE.	MFF-05-011 MECHANIX WEAR	500 PR				
7224	GLOVES, MECHANICS WORK, XX-LARGE COLOR: BLACK, FASTFIT GLOVE, DURABLE SMOOTH SYNTHETIC LEATHER PALM, WITH BREATHABLE MESH BACK, INDEX FINGER KNUCKLE REINFORCEMENT BANDS FOR STRENGTH AND PROTECTION, CONCEALED SEAMS FOR SNAG RESISTANCE, LYCRA PANELS BETWEEN FINGERS ULTRA THIN TPR (THERMAL PLASTIC RUBBER), HOOK AND LOOP CLOSURES, SIZE: 12 XX-LARGE.	MFF-05-012 MECHANIX WEAR	260 PR				
7225	GLOVES, 12 IN. GAUNTLET CUFF, WINTER MONKEY GRIP, PVC COATED, VINYL COATING RESISTS CHEMICALS AND ABRASIONS, STAYS SOFT WHEN COLD, FOAM INSULATED WITH SOFT JERSEY LINING.	23-152 ANSELL	24 PR				

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 2 - Gloves	Rejected Alternate		Veritiv - Partial Lot					
Material	Description		Est Qty (2 yrs)	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number		Bid Price per Ordering UOM		
7226	*	2360 MAGID SHOWA BEST	220 PR						
7229	GLOVES, HEAT RESISTANT: FOR USE WITH TAR KETTLE OPERATIONS AND HEATS UP TO 1000 DEGREE F, MADE OF DUPONT KEVLAR 29 ARAMID FIBER, WOOL LINING, ONE PIECE BACK. 11 INCHES SIZE: EXTRA LARGE.	G45RTRF12010 NATIONAL SAFETY APPAREL	1 PR						
7230	GLOVES, WELDERS: "WELDER'S TANNAGE", HEAT RISISTANT, SIDE SPLIT LEATHER, GUNN CUT, WING THUMB, WELTED SEAMS, FULLY LINED FRONT AND BACK WITH FIRE-RETARDANT LINING, FULL FINGER INSERTS, GAUNTLET CUFF, 14 INCHES OVERALL, SIZE X-LARGE.	S17WCI SEAL GLOVE	0 PR						
	Removed from bid.								
7334	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, 100 % NITRILE, AMBIDEXTROUS, PEBBLED TEXTURE, POWDER FREE, LENGTH 9.5 IN., THICKNESS 5 MIL, COLOR: LT. BLUE SIZE: SMALL, 100 PER BOX.	7500PF-S BEST (BOX - new order unit)	70,000 EA	TRADEX	NSM5201 - 1000/CS	CASE	\$39.68 CS		
7335	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, 100 % NITRILE, AMBIDEXTROUS, PEBBLED TEXTURE, POWDER FREE, LENGTH 9.5 IN., THICKNESS 5 MIL, COLOR: LT. BLUE SIZE: MEDIUM, 100 PER BOX.	7500PF-M BEST (BOX - new order unit)	100,000 EA	TRADEX	NMD5201 - 1000/CS	CASE	\$39.68 cs		
7336	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, 100% NITRILE, AMBIDEXTROUS, PEBBLED TEXTURE, POWDER FREE, LENGTH 9.5 IN., THICKNESS 5 MIL, COLOR: LT. BLUE SIZE: LARGE, 100 PER BOX.	7500PF-L BEST (BOX - new order unit)	125,300 EA	TRADEX	NLG5201 - 1000/CS	CASE	\$39.68 CS		
7337	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, 100% NITRILE, AMBIDEXTROUS, PEBBLED TEXTURE, POWDER FREE, LENGTH 9.5 IN., THICKNESS 5 MIL, COLOR: LT. BLUE SIZE: X-LARGE, 100 PER BOX.	7500PF-XL BEST (BOX - new order unit)	155,500 EA		NXL5201 - 1000/CS	CASE	\$39.68 CS		
7367	GLOVES, SURGICAL LATEX, LARGE, AMBIDEXTROUS, 13 MIL THICK FINGERTIPS PALMS AND CUFFS	SG375L MICROFLEX SAFEGRIP (BOX - new order unit)	21,500 EA		LLG620- 500/CS	CASE	\$35.19 CS		
7368	GLOVES, SURGICAL LATEX, MEDIUM, AMBIDEXTROUS, 13 MIL THICK FINGERTIPS, PALMS AND CUFFS.	SG375M MICROFLEX SAFEGRIP (BOX - new order unit)	11,300 EA	TRADEX	LMD620 - 500/CS	CASE	\$35.19 CS		
7369	GLOVES, SURGICAL LATEX, SMALL, AMBIDEXTROUS, 13 MIL THICK FINGERTIPS, PALMS AND CUFFS.	SG375S MICROFLEX SAFEGRIP (BOX - new order unit)	1,500 EA	TRADEX	LSM620 - 500/CS	CASE	\$35.19 CS		
7370	GLOVES, SURGICAL LATEX, X-LARGE, AMBIDEXTROUS, 13 MIL THICK FINGERTIPS, PALMS AND CUFFS.	SG375XL MICROFLEX SAFEGRIP (BOX - new order unit)	38,000 EA	TRADEX	LXL620 - 500.CS	CASE	\$35.19 CS		

Lo	t 2	_	pag	e	20
			P	•	

	PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation Bid 632000-636000-2017, Due 1/27/2017 LOT 2 - Gloves	Rejected Alternate		Veritiv - Partial Lot			
Material	Description	PRIME Manufacturer Part Number	Est Qty (2 yrs)	Alternate Manufacturer Name	Alternate Part Number	Ordering Unit of Measure (UOM)	Bid Price per Ordering UOM
11593	GLOVES, DRIVERS, MEDIUM, CUFF COLOR GREEN, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-M STAUFFER	670 PR				
11594	GLOVES, DRIVERS, LARGE, CUFF COLOR BROWN, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-L STAUFFER	1,800 PR				
11595	GLOVES, DRIVER, X-LARGE, CUFF COLOR BLUE, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-XL STAUFFER	2,900 PR				
11596	GLOVES, DRIVERS, XX-LARGE, CUFF COLOR BLACK, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, UNLINED, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC, GUNN CUT PATTERN, STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR: TAN/CREAM.	85EJ-2X STAUFFER	1,400 PR				
11603	GLOVES, DRIVER, XX-LARGE, CUFF COLOR BLACK, PREMIUM GRADE GRAIN PIG SKIN LEATHER, COTTON FLANNEL LINING INSULATION, COTTON BINDING SLIP ON CUFF, INSIDE ELASTIC GUNN CUT PATTERN,STRAIGHT THUMB, SEAMLESS INDEX FINGER, COLOR:TAN/CREAM.	800LEJ-2X STAUFFER	559 PR				
11975	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, MICROFLEX SYNETRON, POLYMER COATED, POWDER FREE, LATEX GOLVES, FULLY TEXTURED EXTENDED BEADED CUFF, LENGTH 12 IN., THICKNESS 9 MIL, SIZE 2X LARGE, COLOR NATURAL, 50 PER BOX.	SY-911-XXL MICROFLEX SYNTRON (BOX - new order unit)	6,500 EA				
11976	GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, MICROFLEX SYNETRON, POLYMER COATED, POWDER FREE, LATEX GOLVES, FULLY TEXTURED EXTENDED BEADED CUFF, LENGTH 12 IN., THICKNESS 9 MIL, SIZE 3X	SY-911-3XL MICROFLEX SYNTRON	6,400 EA				

(BOX - new order unit)
TOTAL EST. BID

EST. SPLIT

LARGE, COLOR NATURAL, 40 PER BOX.

92,161.19