
Bid No
5766 3676 50

Awarded overall low bidder
Item Qty Unit Material/Description Unit Price Total Price Other 

Charges
Unit Price Total Price Freight costs Unit Price Total Price Other 

Charges

CORE ITEMS
A 5000 EA RIPTIDE Pen 0.436$        2,180.00$          0.36$           1,800.00$          $115.00 0.35$           1,750.00$          
B  100 EA Safety Glove 5.99$           599.00$             5.50$           550.00$             $30.00 3.87$           387.00$             
C 5000 EA Emery Board 0.148$        740.00$             0.36$           1,800.00$          $115.00 0.18$           900.00$             
D 3000 EA PENCIL 0.22$           660.00$             0.18$           540.00$             $75.00 0.17$           510.00$             
E 1000 EA Grocery Tote 1.75$           1,750.00$          1.10$           1,100.00$          230.00$        1.84$           1,840.00$          
F 1000 EA Hand fan 1.234$        1,234.00$          0.99$           990.00$             $150.00 1.16$           1,160.00$          

RETIREMENT PLATE
A 200 EA Plate 17.60$        3,520.00$          18.00$        3,600.00$          26.00$        5,200.00$          
B  200 EA Stand 5.11$           1,022.00$          0.95$           190.00$             3.89$           778.00$             
C 200 EA Gift box 0.85$           170.00$             1.55$           310.00$             0.80$           160.00$             

4,712.00$         4,100.00$         6,138.00$         
SAFETY COINS

A 600 EA COIN 3.23$           1,938.00$          3.50$           2,100.00$          $95.00 2.90$           1,740.00$          
B 600 EA CASE 0.81$           486.00$             0.45$           270.00$             no price

TOTAL 14,299.00$  13,250.00$  $810.00 14,425.00$  
Additional Freight Costs

No Bids: EMP Sales              

Brenneman Printing Inc
Lancaster PA 

Alan Skulsky & Assoc, Levin Promotional
Harrisburg PA

10/1/2018, 2:00 PM

PA Turnpike Commission - Bid Tabulation
582000-2018

Bulldog Office Products Inc
Pittsburgh PA 15205

Promotional Items Program & Services
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Bid No

Item Qty Unit Material/Description

CORE ITEMS
A 5000 EA RIPTIDE Pen
B  100 EA Safety Glove
C 5000 EA Emery Board
D 3000 EA PENCIL
E 1000 EA Grocery Tote
F 1000 EA Hand fan

RETIREMENT PLATE
A 200 EA Plate
B  200 EA Stand
C 200 EA Gift box

SAFETY COINS
A 600 EA COIN
B 600 EA CASE

TOTAL

No Bids: EMP Sales

10/1/2018, 2:00 PM

PA Turnpike Commission - Bid Tabulation
582000-2018
Promotional Items Program & Services 647 6911 179

Unit Price Total Price Other 
Charg
es

Unit Price Total Price Set-up Fee Freight Unit Pric Total Price Freight 
costs

0.42$           2,100.00$          0.44$           2,200.00$          40.00$       $275 0.37$    1,850.00$        $95.00
5.60$           560.00$             5.00$           500.00$             75.00$       $159 4.22$    422.00$            $22.00
0.16$           800.00$             0.18$           900.00$             35.00$       $39 0.11$    550.00$            $55.00
0.20$           600.00$             0.20$           600.00$             20.00$       $51 0.12$    360.00$            $85.00
2.00$           2,000.00$          1.75$           1,750.00$          72.00$       $313 1.50$    1,500.00$        $495.00
0.79$           790.00$             0.76$           760.00$             20.00$       $68 0.29$    290.00$            $110.00

Fan = 1-color

20.00$        4,000.00$          21.85$        4,370.00$          298.00$     $90 NO BID
5.00$           1,000.00$          5.50$           1,100.00$          $42 NO BID
1.00$           200.00$             0.90$           180.00$             NO BID

5,200.00$         5,650.00$         

3.67$           2,202.00$          4.78$           2,868.00$          7.93$    4,758.00$        
0.95$           570.00$             0.58$           348.00$             included

14,822.00$  15,576.00$  9,730.00$   $862.00

Hummelstown PA
Proforma Destiny PromotionsApex Advertising

Lancaster PA
Majestic Alliance Promotional Marketing

Harrisburg
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Bid No

Item Qty Unit Material/Description

CORE ITEMS
A 5000 EA RIPTIDE Pen
B  100 EA Safety Glove
C 5000 EA Emery Board
D 3000 EA PENCIL
E 1000 EA Grocery Tote
F 1000 EA Hand fan

RETIREMENT PLATE
A 200 EA Plate
B  200 EA Stand
C 200 EA Gift box

SAFETY COINS
A 600 EA COIN
B 600 EA CASE

TOTAL

No Bids: EMP Sales

10/1/2018, 2:00 PM

PA Turnpike Commission - Bid Tabulation
582000-2018
Promotional Items Program & Services 885

Unit Price Total Price Other 
Charges

0.62$           3,100.00$          
NO BID

0.55$           2,750.00$          
0.69$           2,070.00$          
2.45$           2,450.00$          
4.50$           4,500.00$          

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

14,870.00$  

Scott Electric
Greensburg PA
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	Bid Tab

