
Bid No
357 269 5766

LINE Qty Unit Material/Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1 1 HR Artwork/Design 40.00$             45.00$             78.00$             

1 LS Digital Press 8-page (100) 84.00$             115.00$           235.00$           
1 LS Digital Press 8-page (500) 359.00$           515.00$           705.00$           

1 LS Digital Press 8-page (1000) 688.00$           918.00$           868.00$           
1 LS Digital Press 16-page (500) 648.00$           315.00$           1,264.00$        
1 LS Digital Press 16-page (1000) 1,169.00$        1,110.00$        1,465.00$        

1 LS Digital Press 16-page (3000) 3,432.00$        2,050.00$        2,380.00$        

1 EA Scan 4 x 6 photo 6.00$               6.00$               43.00$             
1 EA scan 11 x 15 photo 6.00$               6.25$               78.00$             
1 EA Banner 8' x 3 ' 105.00$           80.00$             210.00$           *Additional pricing for quantities
1 EA Banner 5' x 5' 125.00$           99.00$             493.00$           *Additional pricing for quantities

1 EA Sign, ultramount 9.00$               6.00$               42.00$             *Additional pricing for quantities
1 EA Sign Polystyrene 26.00$             16.00$             90.00$             *Additional pricing for quantities
1 EA Sign, PVC 10.80$             5.90$               50.00$             *Additional pricing for quantities

LAMINATING SERVICES per piece (50) per piece (100) per piece (50) per piece (100) per piece (50) per piece (100)

1 EA 8.5 x 11, 1.5 mil 0.43$               0.43$                 0.76$               0.65$                 0.69$               0.59$                 

1 EA 8.5 x 11, 3 mil 0.32$               0.32$                 0.87$               0.75$                 0.77$               0.67$                 
1 EA 8.5 x 11, 5 mil 2.00$               2.00$                 0.93$               0.83$                 0.84$               0.74$                 

1 EA 22 x 36, 3 mil 2.90$               2.90$                 2.25$               2.15$                 1.98$               1.89$                 
1 EA 22 x 36, 5 mil 8.00$               8.00$                 3.18$               3.07$                 2.78$               2.69$                 

1 EA 24 x 36, 3 mil 2.90$               2.90$                 2.25$               2.16$                 2.03$               1.93$                 
1 EA 19 x 36, 3 mil 2.90$               2.90$                 2.25$               2.16$                 2.03$               1.93$                 

PRINTING SERVICES per piece (500) per piece (5000) per piece (50,000) per piece (500) per piece (5000) per piece (50,000) per piece (500) per piece (5000) per piece (50,000)

1 EA 8.5 x 11, B&W 1-side $0.024 $0.022 $0.020 0.02$               0.019$               0.018$                  $0.186 $0.062 $0.02836
1 EA 8.5 x 11, B&W 2-side $0.038 $0.035 $0.034 0.039$             0.036$               0.034$                  $0.210 $0.0726 $0.0313

1 EA 8.5 x 11, Color 1-side $0.079 $0.074 $0.042 0.18$               0.096$               0.042$                  $0.300 $0.0978 $0.035
1 EA 8.5 x 11, Color 2-side $0.148 $0.133 $0.058 0.34$               0.104$               0.049$                  $0.440 $0.111 $0.04176

1 EA 11 x 17, B&W 1-side $0.042 $0.042 $0.042 0.039$             0.037$               0.036$                  $0.220 $0.0854 $0.0459
1 EA 11 x 17, B&W 2-side $0.054 $0.054 $0.054 0.071$             0.067$               0.066$                  $0.270 $0.0966 $0.05

1 EA 11 x 17, Color 1-side $0.148 $0.133 $0.090 0.265$             0.117$               0.061$                  $0.454 $0.126 $0.06
1 EA 11 x 17, Color 2-side $0.266 $0.220 $0.130 0.386$             0.180$               0.082$                  $0.704 $0.163 $0.075

POSTER OUTPUT per piece (10) per piece (100) per piece (10) per piece (100) per piece (10) per piece (100)

1 EA 30 x 40 40.00$             38.00$               20.50$             10.00$               59.00$             42.30$               
1 EA 42 x 54 60.00$             57.50$               40.00$             36.50$               46.00$             36.30$               

WORK SAMPLES Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

2 250 EA Rack Card 0.098$             24.50$               0.30$               75.00$               0.56$               140.00$             
3500 EA Mileposts 1.386$             4,851.00$          0.79$               2,765.00$          1.05140$         3,679.90$          

50000 EA E-Zpass Brochure 0.0525$           2,625.00$          0.046$             2,300.00$          0.06396$         3,198.00$          
BULK MAILING   Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

3 3500 EA Bulk Mailing (Mileposts) 0.106$             371.00$             0.05$               175.00$             0.0937$           327.95$             
Additional services Yes No Yes No Yes No

4 Design Business Card Yes Yes Yes

Design Stationery Yes Yes Yes

Design for Promotional Yes Yes Yes

Create Proofs Yes Yes Yes

Printing & Graphic Design

Awarded Commercial Printing, Marketing, 
Promotional Material

Awarded Publication Printing: Mileposts & 
employee communications

10/1/2018, 2:00 PM

PA Turnpike Commission - Bid Tabulation
958400-2018

Intelliprint Solutions
Harrisburg PA

Brenneman Printing Inc
City, State

PrintWorks on Demand Inc
Harrisburg PA
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Bid No
357 269 5766Printing & Graphic Design

PA Turnpike Commission - Bid Tabulation
958400-2018

Intelliprint Solutions
Harrisburg PA

Brenneman Printing Inc
City, State

PrintWorks on Demand Inc
Harrisburg PA

Create Digital Proofs Yes Yes Yes

Web-ready PDFs Yes Yes Yes

Laminate Posters Yes Yes Yes

Design Silkscreen Yes No Yes

Wide Format Printing Yes Yes Yes

Polystyrene/PVC printing Yes Yes Yes

Trade-show displays Yes Yes Yes

Lobby Displays Yes Yes Yes

Photo Plaques Yes Yes Yes

POP Displays Yes No Yes
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Bid No

LINE Qty Unit Material/Description
1 1 HR Artwork/Design

1 LS Digital Press 8-page (100)
1 LS Digital Press 8-page (500)

1 LS Digital Press 8-page (1000)
1 LS Digital Press 16-page (500)
1 LS Digital Press 16-page (1000)

1 LS Digital Press 16-page (3000)

1 EA Scan 4 x 6 photo
1 EA scan 11 x 15 photo
1 EA Banner 8' x 3 '
1 EA Banner 5' x 5'

1 EA Sign, ultramount
1 EA Sign Polystyrene
1 EA Sign, PVC

LAMINATING SERVICES
1 EA 8.5 x 11, 1.5 mil

1 EA 8.5 x 11, 3 mil
1 EA 8.5 x 11, 5 mil

1 EA 22 x 36, 3 mil
1 EA 22 x 36, 5 mil

1 EA 24 x 36, 3 mil
1 EA 19 x 36, 3 mil

PRINTING SERVICES

1 EA 8.5 x 11, B&W 1-side
1 EA 8.5 x 11, B&W 2-side

1 EA 8.5 x 11, Color 1-side
1 EA 8.5 x 11, Color 2-side

1 EA 11 x 17, B&W 1-side
1 EA 11 x 17, B&W 2-side

1 EA 11 x 17, Color 1-side
1 EA 11 x 17, Color 2-side

POSTER OUTPUT

1 EA 30 x 40
1 EA 42 x 54

WORK SAMPLES

2 250 EA Rack Card
3500 EA Mileposts

50000 EA E-Zpass Brochure
BULK MAILING   

3 3500 EA Bulk Mailing (Mileposts)
Additional services

4 Design Business Card

Design Stationery

Design for Promotional

Create Proofs

Printing & Graphic Design

10/1/2018, 2:00 PM

PA Turnpike Commission - Bid Tabulation
958400-2018

2710 5246 754

Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
65.00$             48.00$             40.00$             

294.81$           132.71$           195.00$           
398.74$           429.02$           425.00$           

1,066.42$        768.06$           725.00$           
1,029.71$        768.06$           725.00$           
1,880.43$        1,490.37$        1,100.00$        

5,077.53$        2,223.00$        2,100.00$        

1.25$               5.00$               8.00$               
1.25$               5.00$               10.00$             

62.00$             112.00$           72.00$             
172.00$           120.00$           125.00$           

2.45$               11.00$             18.00$             
27.50$             28.00$             35.00$             

7.75$               9.74$               15.00$             
per piece (50) per piece (100) per piece (50) per piece (100) per piece (50) per piece (100)

2.97$               1.79$                 1.30$               1.30$                 3.00$               No addendum attached

2.99$               1.90$                 0.81$               0.81$                 3.50$               
3.10$               2.07$                 2.60$               2.60$                 5.50$               

4.63$               3.57$                 6.88$               6.88$                 45.00$             
5.55$               4.48$                 12.00$             12.00$               55.00$             

4.95$               3.98$                 7.50$               7.50$                 48.00$             
3.93$               3.56$                 6.50$               6.50$                 40.00$             

per piece (500) per piece (5000) per piece (50,000) per piece (500) per piece (5000) per piece (50,000) per piece (500) per piece (5000) per piece (50,000)

0.09$               0.07$                 0.06$                        0.023$             0.0200$             0.015$                     0.035$             
0.16$               0.08$                 0.07$                        0.046$             0.0400$             0.025$                     0.06$               

0.39$               0.13$                 0.06$                        0.21$               0.1800$             0.1200$                   0.18$               
0.53$               0.19$                 0.08$                        0.42$               0.3600$             0.2600$                   0.25$               

0.23$               0.10$                 0.08$                        0.10$               0.0800$             0.0600$                   0.07$               
0.31$               0.12$                 0.10$                        0.16$               0.1400$             0.1000$                   0.12$               

0.67$               0.19$                 0.08$                        0.36$               0.3200$             0.2600$                   0.25$               
0.93$               0.29$                 0.10$                        0.64$               0.6000$             0.5300$                   0.35$               

per piece (10) per piece (100) per piece (10) per piece (100) per piece (10) per piece (100)

48.00$             28.00$               42.00$             36.00$               38.00$             
102.00$           46.00$               48.00$             35.50$               42.00$             

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

0.48$               120.00$             0.43$               107.50$             0.168$             42.00$               
1.34$               4,690.00$          0.85$               2,975.00$          0.785$             2,747.50$          

0.075$             3,750.00$          0.06$               3,000.00$          0.063$             3,150.00$          
Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

0.06$               210.00$             Postage additional 0.59$               2,065.00$          0.14$               490.00$             
Yes No Yes No Yes No

Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes

Dillsburg PA
Unity Printing Co Inc

Latrobe PA 
SpeedPro Imaging

Camp Hill PA
DRS Printing Services Inc
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Bid No
Printing & Graphic Design

PA Turnpike Commission - Bid Tabulation
958400-2018

Create Digital Proofs

Web-ready PDFs

Laminate Posters

Design Silkscreen

Wide Format Printing

Polystyrene/PVC printing

Trade-show displays

Lobby Displays

Photo Plaques

POP Displays

2710 5246 754
Dillsburg PA

Unity Printing Co Inc
Latrobe PA 

SpeedPro Imaging
Camp Hill PA

DRS Printing Services Inc

Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes
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Bid No

LINE Qty Unit Material/Description
1 1 HR Artwork/Design

1 LS Digital Press 8-page (100)
1 LS Digital Press 8-page (500)

1 LS Digital Press 8-page (1000)
1 LS Digital Press 16-page (500)
1 LS Digital Press 16-page (1000)

1 LS Digital Press 16-page (3000)

1 EA Scan 4 x 6 photo
1 EA scan 11 x 15 photo
1 EA Banner 8' x 3 '
1 EA Banner 5' x 5'

1 EA Sign, ultramount
1 EA Sign Polystyrene
1 EA Sign, PVC

LAMINATING SERVICES
1 EA 8.5 x 11, 1.5 mil

1 EA 8.5 x 11, 3 mil
1 EA 8.5 x 11, 5 mil

1 EA 22 x 36, 3 mil
1 EA 22 x 36, 5 mil

1 EA 24 x 36, 3 mil
1 EA 19 x 36, 3 mil

PRINTING SERVICES

1 EA 8.5 x 11, B&W 1-side
1 EA 8.5 x 11, B&W 2-side

1 EA 8.5 x 11, Color 1-side
1 EA 8.5 x 11, Color 2-side

1 EA 11 x 17, B&W 1-side
1 EA 11 x 17, B&W 2-side

1 EA 11 x 17, Color 1-side
1 EA 11 x 17, Color 2-side

POSTER OUTPUT

1 EA 30 x 40
1 EA 42 x 54

WORK SAMPLES

2 250 EA Rack Card
3500 EA Mileposts

50000 EA E-Zpass Brochure
BULK MAILING   

3 3500 EA Bulk Mailing (Mileposts)
Additional services

4 Design Business Card

Design Stationery

Design for Promotional

Create Proofs

Printing & Graphic Design

10/1/2018, 2:00 PM

PA Turnpike Commission - Bid Tabulation
958400-2018

5656 885
*Delivery is additional cost for all items

Unit Price Unit Price
65.00$             NO BID

220.00$           NO BID
395.00$           NO BID

695.00$           NO BID
695.00$           NO BID

1,095.00$        NO BID

2,895.00$        NO BID

9.99$               NO BID
12.99$             NO BID
95.00$             NO BID

NO BID NO BID

25.00$             3/16" foamcore NO BID
125.00$           .03 polystyrene NO BID
150.00$           *Additional Pricing with quantities NO BID

per piece (50) per piece (100) per piece (50) per piece (100)

2.00$               1.90$                 NO BID

2.20$               2.00$                 NO BID
2.50$               2.25$                 NO BID

16.00$             15.00$               NO BID
17.00$             16.00$               NO BID

17.00$             16.00$               NO BID
15.00$             14.00$               NO BID

per piece (500) per piece (5000) per piece (50,000) per piece (500) per piece (5000) per piece (50,000)

0.06$               0.050$               0.022$                     0.07$               0.05$                 0.048
0.100$             0.060$               0.032$                     0.10$               0.08$                 0.062

0.20$               0.080$               0.061$                     0.15$               0.12$                 n/a
0.28$               0.1324$             0.1003$                   0.20$               0.18$                 n/a

0.16$               0.070$               0.045$                     0.09$               0.07$                 0.06
0.18$               0.085$               0.055$                     0.12$               0.10$                 0.08

0.32$               0.150$               0.120$                     0.13$               0.115$               n/a
0.49$               0.240$               0.200$                     0.22$               0.19$                 n/a

per piece (10) per piece (100) per piece (10) per piece (100)

62.50$             36.00$               NO BID
65.00$             39.00$               satin NO BID

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

0.22$               55.00$               NO BID
0.8242$           2,884.70$          NO BID

0.054$             2,700.00$          NO BID
Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

0.11$               394.80$             postage additional NO BID
Yes No Yes No

Yes No

Yes No

Yes No

Yes No

Express Business Center Inc
Trexlertown PA Greensburg PA

Scott Electric Company
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Bid No
Printing & Graphic Design

PA Turnpike Commission - Bid Tabulation
958400-2018

Create Digital Proofs

Web-ready PDFs

Laminate Posters

Design Silkscreen

Wide Format Printing

Polystyrene/PVC printing

Trade-show displays

Lobby Displays

Photo Plaques

POP Displays

5656 885

Express Business Center Inc
Trexlertown PA Greensburg PA

Scott Electric Company

Yes No

Yes No

Yes No

Yes No

Yes No

Yes No

Yes No

Yes No

No No

Yes No
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