Pennsylvania Turnpike Commission \

Bid Tabulation

Office Paper

Bid Number 501015-2020
Due Date 7/8/2020 Awarded
Item |Description Est Qty‘ I WB Mason Co
1Year UOM Unit Min  |Total Price Product Number |Case Price
Price Order
6844|CANARY, 19.54M VELLUM 8|PKG $4.58 8 $36.64|Wausau 82331 $36.64
6846|GREEN, 19.54M VELLUM 8|PKG $4.58 8 $36.64|Wausau 82351 $36.64
6847|BLUE, 19.54M VELLUM 8|PKG $4.58 8 $36.64|Wausau 82321 $36.64
6852|IVORY, 19.54M VELLUM 8|PKG $4.58 8 $36.64|Wausau 82361 $36.64
6854|GRAY, 19.54M VELLUM 8|PKG $4.58 8 $36.64|Wausau 82341 $36.64
6857|WHITE, INDEX BRISTOL 80|PKG $5.82 8 $465.60| Wausau 40411 $46.56
6863|COLOR COPY LETTER 8|RM S7.44 8 $59.52|Hammermill 10246 $59.52
7
6871|WHITE, 20 LB BOND 6400(RM $2.57| 10 $16,448.00|Mason Flagship $25.70
21200
6874|GREEN, 20 LB BOND 10|RM $3.72| 10 $37.20|Mason Circus $37.20
22201GN
6877|CANARY, 20 LB BOND 10|RM $3.72| 10 $37.20|Mason Circus $37.20
22201CY
6880|WHITE, 20 LB, 11X17 235|RM $6.13 5 $1,440.55[Mason Brand $30.65
28110
6883|WHITE, 20 LB LEGAL 200|RM $3.84 10 $768.00|Mason Brand $38.40
24200
10816(WHITE CARBONLESS 200|PKG NO BID
10817|CANARY CARBONLESS 200|PKG NO BID
10818|PINK CARBONLESS 10|PKG NO BID
10891|GREEN CARBONLESS 10|PKG NO BID
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