
Pennsylvania Turnpike Commission 
Bid Tabulation Office Paper

501015-2019-REBID

Item Description Est Qty
2 Years UOM Unit 

Price
Min 
Order

Total Price Product Number Unit 
Price

Min 
Order

Total Price Product Number Unit 
Price

Min 
Order

Total Price Product Number

6844 CANARY, 19.54M VELLUM 30 PKG $2.275 8 $68.25 Springhill 036000 $4.50 8 $135.00 Wausau 822331 $4.21 8 $126.30 10002309

6846 GREEN, 19.54M VELLUM 30 PKG $2.275 8 $68.25 Springhill 046000 $4.50 8 $135.00 Wausau 82351 $4.21 8 $126.30 10002312

6847 BLUE, 19.54M VELLUM 30 PKG $2.275 8 $68.25 Springhill 026000 $4.50 8 $135.00 Wausau 82321 $4.21 8 $126.30 10002311

6852 IVORY, 19.54M VELLUM 30 PKG $2.275 8 $68.25 Springhill 056000 $4.50 8 $135.00 Wausau 82361 $4.21 8 $126.30 10002305

6854 GRAY, 19.54M VELLUM 30 PKG $2.275 8 $68.25 Springhill 066000 $4.50 8 $135.00 Wausau 82341 $4.21 8 $126.30 10002310

6857 WHITE, INDEX BRISTOL 360 PKG $2.930 8 $1,054.80 Springhill 015300 $5.79 8 $2,084.40  Wausau 40411 $6.59 8 $2,372.40 10002196

6863 COLOR COPY LETTER 30 RM $8.700 8 $261.00 Hammermill 
10246-7

$7.41 8 $222.30 Hammermill 
10246-7

$8.65 8 $259.50 Hammermill 
10003501

6871 WHITE, 20 LB BOND 16000 RM $3.090 10 $49,440.00 Am Eagle 
31600501

$2.82 10 $45,120.00 Mason Flagship 
21200

$3.33 10 $53,280.00 10802527 iomel

6874 GREEN, 20 LB BOND 30 RM $5.450 10 $163.50 Hammermill Fore 
10336-6

$3.61 10 $108.30 Mason Circus 
22201GN

$4.35 10 $130.50 10003555 Fore 
MP

6877 CANARY, 20 LB BOND 30 RM $15.450 10 $463.50 Hammermill 
10334-1

$3.61 10 $108.30 Mason Circus 
22201CY

$4.35 10 $130.50 10003541002 
Fore MP

6880 WHITE, 20 LB, 11X17 1100 RM $7.170 5 $7,887.00 Am Eagle 
31600503

$6.10 5 $6,710.00 Mason Flagship 
28110

$7.56 5 $8,316.00 10782776 
Glatfelter 

6883 WHITE, 20 LB LEGAL 620 RM $4.560 10 $2,827.20 Am Eagle 
31600502

$3.82 10 $2,368.40 Mason Flagship 
24200

$4.81 10 $2,982.20 10302549 Econo

10816 WHITE CARBONLESS 750 PKG $10.94 10 $8,205.00 Appvion NCR 
5805

NO BID $12.71 1 $9,532.50 10559008 Excel

10817 CANARY CARBONLESS 600 PKG $12.94 10 $7,764.00 Appvion NCR 
5830N

NO BID $15.28 1 $9,168.00 10559022 Excel

10818 PINK CARBONLESS 50 PKG $7.71 10 $385.50 Appvion NCR 
5868

NO BID $9.90 1 $495.00 10559034 Excel

10891 GREEN CARBONLESS 150 PKG $12.94 10 $1,941.00 Appvion NCR 
5845N

NO BID $16.03 1 $2,404.50 10560297 Excel

2-YR Estimate $80,733.75 $57,396.70 $89,702.60
Split Totals (2 yr) $19,691.55 $54,637.30
Split Award (1 yr) $10,000.00 $30,000.00

Veritiv Operating Co. 

$74,328.85

WB Mason Co

$40,000.00

Bid Number
Due Date 6/11/2019

Lindenmyer Munroe
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