
PA Turnpike Commission Bid Tabulation

427000-2016, Due 7/6/2016

PTC 

Material
Description Prime Mf r Part Number Proposed Manuf acturer

Proposed Part 

Number
Unit Conv ersion

Inv oicing 

Unit of  

Measure

 Inv oicing 

Unit Price 
Proposed Manuf acturer

Proposed Part 

Number
Unit Conv ersion

Inv oicing Unit 

of  Measure

 Inv oicing 

Unit Price 
Proposed Manuf acturer Proposed Part Number Unit Conv ersion

Inv oicing Unit 

of  Measure

 Inv oicing Unit 

Price 

Proposed 

Manuf acturer

Proposed Part 

Number
Unit Conv ersion

Inv oicing Unit 

of  Measure

 Inv oicing Unit 

Price 
Proposed Manuf acturer

Proposed Part 

Number
Unit Conv ersion

Inv oicing Unit of  

Measure

 Inv oicing Unit 

Price 
Proposed Manuf acturer Proposed Part Number Unit Conv ersion

Inv oicing Unit of  

Measure

 Inv oicing Unit 

Price 
Proposed Manuf acturer Proposed Part Number Unit Conv ersion

Inv oicing Unit of  

Measure

 Inv oicing Unit 

Price 
Proposed Manuf acturer Proposed Part Number Unit Conv ersion

Inv oicing Unit of  

Measure

 Inv oicing Unit 

Price 
Proposed Manuf acturer Proposed Part Number Unit Conv ersion

Inv oicing Unit of  

Measure

 Inv oicing Unit 

Price 
Proposed Manuf acturer Proposed Part Number Unit Conv ersion

Inv oicing Unit of  

Measure

 Inv oicing Unit 

Price 
Proposed Manuf acturer Proposed Part Number Unit Conv ersion

Inv oicing Unit of  

Measure

 Inv oicing Unit 

Price 
Proposed Manuf acturer Proposed Part Number Unit Conv ersion

Inv oicing Unit of  

Measure

 Inv oicing Unit 

Price 

LOT 1 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES/CHEMICALS

5452

 BROOM, GARAGE, 18 IN., W/O HANDLE, PALMYRA 

FILL, LACQUERED HARDWOOD BLOCK, W/TWO 

THREADED HANDLE HOLES.

42022 WEILER HB SMITH HBC6318H EA EA  $5.85 Tough Guy  1A844 Each  $          4.59 Carlisle 5352489 12 ea/cs cs $71.89 Boardwalk
Weiler 

42023/BWK20218
EA EA $8.53 WEILER 804-42022 EACH  $                7.50 

5453

 BROOM, OFFICE, 18 IN., W/O HANDLE, BLACK 

TAMPICO CENTER W/BORDER OF BLACK 

HORSEHAIR <(>&<)> PLASTIC MIX, LACQUERED 

HARDWOOD W/TWO THREADED HANDLE HOLES.

42016 WEILER HB SMITH HBC9201S EA EA  $7.10 Tough Guy  1A842 Each  $          5.67 Carlisle 5352510 12 ea/cs cs $132.62  $                -   WEILER 804-42016 6/CASE CASE  $               89.40 

5454
 BROOM, HOUSEHOLD, CORN FIBRE, 4 SEWS 

HARDWOOD HANDLE.
10150 HAMBURG HBC 2022 EA EA  $          4.45 Tough Guy  1VAB6 Each  $          8.36 Carlisle 5135628 ea $5.75 Boardwalk

BWK926CEA 42" 

wood handle
EA EA $6.94 NO BID

5455

 BROOM, STREET, 16 IN., W/O HANDLE, WOOD 

BLOCK W/TWO TAPERED HANDLE HOLES, 7-1/4 IN. 

TRIM, FILL MATERIAL BASS AND PALMYRA BLEND.

42099 WEILER HB SMITH SB1614 EA EA  $6.05 Ability  One 5LG66 Each  $        10.39 Carlisle 5352497 ea  $                5.75 Boardwalk BWK71160/ EA EA $7.24 WEILER 804-42099 6/CASE CASE  $               90.90 

5456
 BRUSH, DUST PAN, 8 IN. - 9 IN., BRUSH, COLOR 

GRAY OR GREEN.
44365 WEILER HBC LBA1 EA EA  $          1.85 Tough Guy  3U788 Each  $          1.90 GoldenStar 6052714 ea $3.00  $                -   NO BID

5457
 BROOM, WHISK, CORN FIBRE, 3 SEWS, 10 IN., 

WIRE WRAPPED.
44266 WEILER HBC #761 EA EA  $          2.75 Ability  One 5MM88 Each  $          4.75 Carlisle 5147405 12 ea/cs cs $41.61 Boardwalk BWK951WC - DZ EA EA $3.45 WEILER 804-44266 12/CASE CASE  $               66.60 UniqueSource 18952819 12 each/cs. cs.  $               33.18 

5458

 BRUSH, CAR WASH, 9-1/2 IN. TO 10 IN., WITHOUT 

HANDLE, WHITE FLAGGED POLYSTYRENE, GREY 

OR GREEN FIBERFILL.

44318 WEILER HBC #50066 EA EA  $          5.10 Tough Guy  5A171 Each  $          5.48 Carlisle 5435697 12 ea/cs cs $112.88 Rubbermaid RCP9B72GRE - EA EA EA $19.00 WEILER 804-44318 12/CASE CASE  $             139.20 

5459

 BRUSH, WINDOW, 5 IN., W/O HANDLE, 

PORTSMOUTH SILVER ROUND WITH FLAGGED TIP 

AND 3 HANDLE HOLES.

73003 WEILER HBC #50666 EA EA  $5.10 Tough Guy  1VAE8 Each  $          3.50 Carlisle 45350 ea $10.20  $                -   WEILER 804-73003 12/CASE CASE  $             147.60 

5460  BRUSH, SCRUB, 6 INCH HAND GRIP, PLASTIC. PF85 HBC SB4213 EA EA  $1.75 Tough Guy  1VAD9 Each  $          1.56 carlisle 5146451 ea $2.10 Rubbermaid RCP6482COB EA EA $2.43 NO BID

5461
 BRUSH, SCRUB, 9 IN., WOOD BLOCK HANDLE 

WHITE TAMPICO FILL.
44023 WEILER HBC SB203 EA EA  $1.90 Tough Guy  2PYV9 Each  $          2.43 Carlisle 5148112 12 ea/cs cs $34.19  $                -   WEILER 804-44023 12/CASE CASE  $               39.60 UniqueSource 18767625 12 each/cs. cs.  $               36.87 

5462
 CLOTH, CHAMOIS, 19 IN X 25 IN OR EQUIVALENT 

SIZE, SYNTHETIC MATERIAL.
TW222 TURTLE WAX ABSORBER ABS27+17 EA EA  $13.70 Autospa 39R437 Each  $          8.24 Acme Chamois as350 50 ea cs cs  $300.00  $                -   NO BID

5465
 HANDLE, STREET BROOM, TAPERED, 1-1/8 IN. X 60 

IN.
44020 WEILER HBC TA50 EA EA  $2.65 Tough Guy  3A326 Each  $2.58 Carlisle 5052369 ea $3.33 Boardwalk BWK125 EA EA $2.70 WEILER 804-44020 12/CASE CASE  $               56.16 UniqueSource 18790825 12 each/cs. cs.  $               34.65 

5466
 HANDLE, MULTI PURPOSE, WOOD, 60 IN. X 1-1/8 

IN., THREADED LACQUER.
44019 WEILER HBBC THM50 EA EA  $2.50 Tough Guy  3U790 Each  $          3.60 Rubbermaid 2137018 ea  $1.88 Boardwalk BWK136 EA EA $2.84 WEILER 804-44019 12/CASE CASE  $               60.60 

5468  SPONGE, CELLULOSE, 4 IN. X 6 IN. C31-3M IMPACT IMP7170P EA EA  $14.50 3M 3U163 Each  $          1.44 3m 5355222 24 ea/cs cs $31.85 Boardwalk BWKCS2 - CT/24 24/CT CT  $19.53 NO BID

5470

 SQUEEGEE, WINDOW, 14 INCH. COMPLETE, 

SOLID BRASS CONSTRUCTION, INCLUDES 

HANDLE, CHANNEL AND SOFT RUBBER BLADE.

GS350 UNGER ETTORE STC017 EA EA  $12.40 Unger 38HY05 Each  $        14.51 Unger 5212008  ea  $12.37  $                -   NO BID

5471  STRIP, RUBBER REPLACEMENT, 14 IN. RT350 UNGER UNGER UNGRT350 DZ DZ  $24.00 Unger 3U431 Each  $0.89 Unger 5387131 12 ea/cs $27.50 Unger UNGRT35 EA EA $2.26 UNGERQ RT350 12/CASE CASE  $               31.92 

5476

 BUCKET, MOP WITH SIDE PRESSURE WRINGER, 

35 QT., POLY- PROPYLENE, WITH 3 NON-MARKING 

CASTERS AND POWDER COATED METAL HANDLE.

7580-88 RUBBERMAID HBC HBC35QTW EA EA  $49.95 Rubbermaid 5NY79 Each  $        51.81 Rubbermaid
5265419 brn 2055584 

y ellow
ea  $46.00 Rubbermaid RCP758088YW EA EA $66.56 RUBBERMAID RCP758088YWW EACH  $               75.95 

5478
 BUCKET, WATER, 14 QUART, PLASTIC COLOR: 

GRAY.
2614 RUBBERMAID IMPACT IMP5514 EA EA  $11.15 Rubbermaid 3U660 Each  $6.51 Rubbermaid 2031178 ea $7.50 Rubbermaid RCP261400GY EA EA $14.07 RUBBERMAID RCP2614GRAY EACH  $               16.20 

5479

 WASTEBASKET, MEDIUM, SOFT PLASTIC, ROLLED 

RIMS, 14-3/8 IN. L X 10-1/4 IN. W X 15 IN. H, 28-1/8 

QT. CAP. COLOR: BEIGE.

2956BG RUBBERMAID IMPACT IMP7715 EA EA  $5.20 Rubbermaid 4HC00 Each  $          4.78 Rubbermaid 2030505 ea  $4.50 Rubbermaid RCP295600BG EA EA $5.48 RUBBERMAID RCP295600BG 12/CASE CASE  $               84.60 

5481
 CAN, WASTEPAPER, 30 INCH, PLASTIC, BEIGE, 23 

GAL. SLIM JIM.
3540 RUBBERMAID IMPACT IMP702375 EA EA  $33.55 Tough Guy  4PGV1 Each  $        29.55 Rubbermaid 2030376 ea  $26.52 Rubbermaid RCP354000BG EA EA $46.39 RUBBERMAID RCP354000BG 4/CASE CASE  $             221.40 

5482  DUST PAN, METAL, 12 INCH. 2069526 XPEDX IMPACT IMP4212 EA EA  $3.80 Tough Guy  5W639 Each  $          3.03 Impact 2069526 ea  $2.90 Boardwalk BWK04212EA EA EA $5.74 IMPACT IMP4212 EACH  $                5.45 

5483  HANDLE, MOP, SPRING AND LEVER, 54 IN. 6514 HAMBURG MARINO MARMH700F54 EA EA  $8.50 Ability  One 5MM87 Each  $7.48  no bid Boardwalk BWK609(60") EA EA  $           11.96 NO BID UniqueSource 18780760 12 each/cs. cs.  $               59.49 

5485  MOP HEAD, COTTON, 24 OZ. F218 REGENCY GOLDEN STAR AWM75245 DZ DZ  $39.10 Ability  One 5LG55 Each  $          5.56 Golden Star 4601920 ea  $2.37 Golden Star GSS24NCC5WCT 12/CT CT $2.85 RUBBERMAID RCP21800 12/CASE CASE  $               81.05 UniqueSource 18780721 12 each/cs. cs.  $               65.08 

5486

 MOP, WET, WEB FOOT, SHRINKLESS, 

ANTIMICROBIAL, MEDIUM, 16 OZ., 6 PER CASE, 

COLOR: BLUE.

A252-06BL RUBBERMAID GOLDEN STAR AST3487 DZ DZ  $47.85 Rubbermaid 3U676 Each  $          8.97 Golden Star AST34BM5_UF 12 ea/cs  cs $83.37 RUBBERMAID RCPA252BLU - 6/CT 6/CT CT $13.80 RUBBERMAID 640-A252-06-BL 6/CASE CASE  $             106.50 

5487

 MOP, WET, WEB FOOT, SHRINKLESS, 

ANTIMICROBIAL, MEDIUM, 16 OZ., 6 PER CASE, 

COLOR: GREEN.

A252-06GR RUBBERMAID GOLDEN STAR AST3467 DZ DZ  $47.85 Rubbermaid 3U675 Each  $          7.83 Golden Star AST34GM5_UF 12 ea/cs cs $83.37  $                -   RUBBERMAID 640-A252-06-GR 6/CASE CASE  $             106.50 

5489

 MOP, WET, WEB FOOT SHRINKLESS, 

ANTIMICROBIAL MEDIUM, 16 OZ., 6 PER CASE, 

COLOR: ORANGE.

A252-06O RUBBERMAID GOLDEN STAR AST340M5 DZ DZ  $47.85 Rubbermaid 3U677 Each  $          8.94 Golden Star AST34OM5-UF 12 ea/cs cs $83.37 RUBBERMAID RCPA252ORA - 6/CT 6/CT CT $13.80 RUBBERMAID 640-A252-06-0 6/CASE CASE  $             106.50 

5490
 MOP, SPONGE, STEEL ROLLER, WITH CELLULOSE 

HEAD, FRONT PULL LEVER ON HANDLE.
6435 RUBBERMAID IMPACT IMP7412 6EA / CS CS  $155.00 Rubbermaid 2U671 Each  $18.55 Rubbermaid 2028781 6 ea/cs cs $120.50 RUBBERMAID RCP6435BZE EA EA $29.30 RUBBERMAID  RCP6435BZE  6/CASE CASE  $35.30 

5491

 REPLACEMENT SPONGE MOP HEAD, STEEL 

ROLLER, CELLULOSE (FITS RUBBERMAID 6435 

MOP).

6436 RUBBERMAID IMPACT IMP741212 EA EA  $17.55 Rubbermaid 2U672 Each  $5.83 Rubbermaid 2028782 ea $7.63 RUBBERMAID RCP6436YEL EA EA $13.06 RUBBERMAID RCP6436YEL 12/CASE CASE  $             187.20 

5492
 MOP HEAD, DRY, DUST, 36 IN. LENGTH, 5 IN. 

WIDTH, RUBBERMAID TUFTED.
J155 RUBBERMAID ODELL ODEE365 EA EA  $7.45 Rubbermaid 3U896 Each  $        14.04 Golden Star 4602540 ea  $4.88  $                -   RUBBERMAID RCP15500YEL EACH  $               26.45 

5494

 SOAP, HAND CLEANER, GO-JO, NATURAL 

ORANGE WITH PUMICE, PETROLEUM FREE, 

CITRUS FORMULA, 1 GAL. WITH PUMP.

0955 GO-JO GOJO GJO0955 EA EA  $13.75 GOJO 12V409 Each  $        15.38 Gojo 2205914 4 ea/cs cs  $40.05 GOJO GOJ095504EA GAL GAL $14.99 GOJO GPJ-0955-04 4-GAL;/CASE CASE  $               67.85 

5495
 SOAP, DISHWASHING DETERGENT, 38-50 OZ. 

BOTTLE.
37000-45112 P/G DAWN PROCTOR & GAMBLE PRG45112 8QT / CS CS  $34.25 Dawn 1JYZ5 8 ea/CS Case  $        43.91 Proctor Gamble Dawn 5199978 8 ea/cs cs $33.91 PROCTOR&GAMBLE PGC45112CT - 8/CT  8/CT  CT  $4.15 DAWN RGC-45112 8-32 OZ/CS CASE  $               39.85 

5499  BLEACH, CHLORINE, 1/2 TO 1 GAL. CONTAINER. 33440 AUSTIN AFFLAB AFB12860 6GL/CS CS  $9.05 Tough Guy  33NT68 3 ea/CS Case  $          5.22 KIK 6326660 6 ea/cs cs $9.10 KIK KIK11008635042 6/CS CS  $8.59 BLEACH BLEACH 6 GAL/CS CASE  $               72.00 

5503
 CLEANER PADS, SOS, 4 PAD BOX , 96 PADS PER 

CASE.
2170756 XPEDX CLOROX CLR88320 12-15S/CS CS  $37.40 S.O.S. 40JD72 48 ea/CS Case  $        22.73 Clorox 2170756 96 ea/cs cs  $23.18 CLOROX CLO98041 96/CASE CASE $23.87 NO BID

5506

 CLEANER, WINDOW, AMMONIATED DETERGENT 

BLEND, FOR GLASS AND MIRROR, WITH SPRAYER 

FOR EACH BOTTLE, 22 TO 32 OZ., 12 PER CASE, 

READY FOR USE. *NO SUBSTITUTE*

90135 WINDEX DIVERSY WINDEX 90135 EA EA  $4.15 Windex 3JW49 12 ea/CS Case  $        50.56 Windex 5097217 12 ea/cs cs  $50.00 DIVERSEY DVO90135CT - 12/CT 12/CT CT  $46.81 WINDEX DV090125CT 12/CT CARTON  $               60.40 State Chemical 107567 Qt 5.06  $         27,324.00 

5511
 CLEANER, CREAM, INTENSE, QUART, 12 PER 

CASE.
6140806 XPEDX MISCO MIPBULLY CS CS  $26.10 Tough Guy  2LEF8 Each  $1.85 Reliable 6140806 12 ea/cs cs $25.93 RELIABLE SLD6140806 12/CS CS $28.65 RELIABLE 6140806 12/CS CASE  $               30.65 State Chemical 25195 Qt 6.99  $          2,516.40 

5522

 DISPENSER, LIQUID SOAP, WITH BREAK 

RESISTANT BOTTLE FOR DISPENSING BULK SOAP, 

SIZE: 10-1/2 IN. H X 4-1/2 IN. W X 4-3/8 IN. D, 

COLOR: BLACK PEARL, MODEL OCEANS.

S890TBK SAN JAMAR SAN JAMAR S890TBK 6/CS CS  $106.25 Tough Guy  18E939 Each  $13.61 San Jamar 5249768 ea $20.00 SAN JAMAR SJM890TBK EA EA $20.91 SAN JAMAR S890TBK EACH  $               23.50 

5523
 DISPENSER, SOAP, PUSH LEVER, USES 

CARTRIDGE TYPE REFILLS.
9021/9034 SPARKLE GOJO 5W626 Each  $        10.36 Gojo 2029043 ea  $5.00  $                -   NO BID

5525
 SOAP, HAND 2-1/2 OZ., UNWRAPPED, 200 PER 

CASE.
HPC2058856 DIAL DILE DIL98 CS CS  $50.95 Dial 41D339 200 ea/ CS Case  $        65.80 Dial 2058856 200 ea/cs cs $52.00 DIAL DIA00098 - 200/CT 200/CT CT $54.35 NO BID

5526  SOAP, GRIT HAND, PUMICE. 5011193 XPEDX Lav a 32V427 48 ea/CS Case  $        48.27 Veritiv  Lav a 5011193 48 ea/cs cs $41.00 WD40 ELB10383 48/CT CT  $37.16 LAVA WD40 48/CS CASE  $               42.30 

5527
 SOAP, WATERLESS, HAND, GO-JO, 18 OZ. CAN, 12 

PER CASE.
1109-12 GO-JO GOJO GJO1109-12 12EA/CS CS  $24.20 GOJO 5FX83 12 ea/CS Case  $        23.81 GoJo 5329649 12 ea/cs cs  $23.80 GOJO GOJ1109 - EACH 12/CS CS $24.24 GOJO GOJ-1109 12 - 18 OZ/CS CASE  $               34.45 

5529
 SOAP, LOTION, HAND CLEANER, 1 GALLON 

BOTTLE.
RELIABLE PINK AUSTIN AUS90001900 4GL/CS CS  $16.00 Tough Guy  34TC37 4 ea/CS Case  $        22.89 Reliable 6287522 4 ea/cs cs $16.50 GOJO CALIGJ180704 - CT/4 4/CT CT $18.23 RELIABLE 444009 4/CS CASE  $               24.60 

5621
 INSECTICIDE, MULTIPURPOSE, AEROSOL 15 OZ. 

TO 19 OZ. CAN.
CB016605 RAID CLAIRE CLRC-271 CS CS  $67.45 Hot Shot 48LR73 Each  $4.25 Raid Div ersey 6223983 12 ea/cs cs $56.00 Div ersey DVOCB016605 12/CT CT $51.77 RAID DVOCB016605 12/CT CARTON  $               65.15 

5626
 POLISH, FURNITURE, 12 OZ. TO 20 OZ. AEROSOL 

CAN, 12 PER CASE.
415849 REGENCY LEMON CLAIRE CLR65232 CS CS  $25.50 Tough Guy  2DBY8 Each  $          2.15 Reliable 4158490 12 ea/cs cs $27.36 Reliable SLD4158490 12/CS CS $31.54 NO BID

5631  DUST CLOTH, TEE SHIRT, WHITE 10 LB BOX. 2133669 XPEDX HOSPECO HOS390-10 BOX BOX  $12.50 Tough Guy  13Y360 Each  $        18.56 Value Wholesale Wiper 2133669 10 lb cs $17.20 Value Wholesale Wiper SLD2133669 10lb box box $21.78 
Action Supply  Products, 

Inc
RWKMC-10 BOX  $                9.35 

5632
 GLASS-WIPING CLOTH, ABSORBENT FABRIC, 10 

LB. BOX.
#10 DIAPER MATERIAL HOSPECO HOS55505 5#/BOX BOX  $15.00 Buf f alo 5LVA6 Each  $13.49 Value Wholesale Wiper 2133672 10 lb cs $18.40  $                -   

Action Supply  Products, 

Inc
NDP1420 BOX  $               29.40 

5662
 URINAL SCREEN, WITH DEODORANT BLOCK, 

100% BIODEGRADABLE.
18770302 UNIQUESOURCE HBC HBC4548 EA EA  $1.25 Tough Guy  15F538 12 ea/CS Case  $        15.08 Fresh Products 5412021 12 ea/ box box $8.44  $                -   NO BID UniqueSource 18770302 12 each/cs. cs. $19.29 

10284

 TRASH PICKUP TOOL, HEAVY DUTY STEEL 

CONSTRUCTION WITH POWERFUL CLAWS AND 

PISTOL GRIP, 28-36 IN. LONG SQUEEZE HANDLE 

FOR PICKING UP BOTTLES, CANS AND 

MISCELLANEOUS DEBRIS.

NT090 UNGER IMPACT IMP3706 EA EA  $19.50 Unger 2NDR3 Each $14.16 Unger 6184040 5 ea/ cs cs $111.27  $                -   UNGERQ 861-NT090 EACH  $               22.25 

11622

 HANDLE, DUST MOP HEAD, CLIP ON, WOOD, 

SIZE: 1 INCH DIAMETER X 60 INCHES LENGTH, 

COLOR: NATURAL.

4602661 XPEDX GOLDEN STAR GOLHQC160 EA EA  $6.25 Tough Guy  1TZG8 Each $4.41 Golden Star 4602661 ea $5.73 BOARDWALK BWK1490 EA EA $9.58 NO BID

11633

 MOP HEAD, DRY, DUST, 5 INCHES WIDE X 18 

INCHES LENGTH, MATERIAL: 

COTTON/RAYON/POLYESTER BLEND.

4602470 XPEDX GOLDEN STAR GOLAJU18ITW EA EA $4.50 Tough Guy  1TZC4 Each  $          4.67 Golden star 4602470 ea $4.66 SAALFELD SLD4602470 - 12/CT 12/CT CT $59.03 NO BID

11634
 FRAME, DUST MOP HEAD, METAL, SIZE: 5 INCHES 

WIDE X 18 INCHES LENGTH , COLOR: GRAY.
4602621 XPEDX GOLDEN STAR GOLHGC160 EA EA  $2.10 Tough Guy  1TZG2 Each  $          2.18 Golden Star 4602621 ea $1.52 UNISAN UNS1418 EA EA $2.99 NO BID

12175

 KIT, WATERLESS URINAL CARTRIDGE, KIT 

INCLUDES CARTRIDGE, INSTALLATION/REMOVAL 

KEY, PROTECTIVE GLOVE AND DISPOSAL BAG.

4FB39 GRAINGER Sloan 4FB39 Each $40.55  no bid  no bid  $                -   ZORO 4FB39 EACH  $               79.75 

12553
 DISINFECTANT SPRAY, GENERAL PURPOSE, 16 

OZ CAN, BOUQUET.
2DBX6 GRAINGER CLAIRE CLRC5238 CS CS $23.55 Tough Guy  2DBX6 Each  $          2.54 Reliable 4161100 12 ea/ cs cs $30.00 SPRING GROVE SLD6192693 - 12/CT 12/CT CT $34.52 ZORO 2DBX6 EACH  $                7.25 

13317

 HANDLE, BROOM, METAL, HEAVY DUTY, 60 IN., 

WITH REIN- FORCED THREADED METAL TIP FOR 

USE WITH HEAVY/COARSE FLOOR SWEEPS, 15/16 

IN. DIAMETER, POWDER COATED, BLACK, WITH 

PLASTIC HANGING CLIP.

5147043 XPEDX HBC HBCTHM50 EA EA $2.35 Tough Guy  1VAJ9 Each  $          3.79 Carlisle 5147043 ea $2.73 CARLISLE SLD5147043 - 12/CT 12/CT CT $41.48 NO BID

13346

 TISSUE, LENS CLEANING, PRE-MOISTENED, 

SIGHT SAVERS, 5 IN. X 8 IN., ANTI-FOG, ANTI-

STATIC, SILICONE-FREE, 100 SHEETS PER BOX.

8574GM BAUSCH & LOMB Bausch and Lomb 2AR69 100 Sheets/Box Box $7.69  no bid  no bid BAUSCH&LOMB BAL8574GM 100/BOX BOX  $           10.37 RADIAN LCD100 1/BX/CS CASE  $               44.00 

13433
 SCREEN, URINAL, WAVE, SPICED APPLE, 10 

EACH/PACK.

6EPA2 TOUGH 

GUY/GRAINGER
FRESH FRS72SA 10EA/BOX BX $15.50 Tough Guy  6EPA2 10 Each/Pack Pack  $        18.93 Fresh Products 6275297 10 ea/box box $16.20  $                -   ZORO 6EPA2 1/PKG PKG  $               36.25 State Chemical 122056 Ea 3.45  $          1,104.00 

5536
 PAD, STRIPPING, 20 IN., BLACK, 5 PADS PER 

CASE.
20014 GLIT 3M NOR20BK 5E/CS CS  $15.95 Tough Guy  4RU87 5 Each/Pack Pack  $        12.41 3m 2030605 5 ea/cs cs $12.14 ACS ACS7220 - 5/CT 5/CT CT $11.02 NO BID

5538  PAD, STRIPPING, 15 IN., 5 PER PACKAGE. 20009 GLIT 3M NOR15BL 5E/CS CS  $8.75 Tough Guy  4RU84 5 Each/Pack Pack  $          8.34 3M 2030599 5 ea/cs cs $13.25 ACS ACS7215 - 5/CT 5/CT CT $7.36 NO BID

5540  PAD, STRIPPING, 13 INCH, 5 PER PACKAGE. 20007 GLIT 3M NOR13BK 5E/CS CS  $6.95 Tough Guy  4RU83 5 Each/Pack Pack  $          6.68 Reliable 2152744 5 ea/ cs cs $6.55 ACS ACS7213 - 5/CT 5/CT CT $5.82 NO BID

5543  PAD, SCRUBBING, 15 IN, 5 PER CASE. NT15GR 3M NOR15GR 5E/CS CS  $8.75 Tough Guy  4RY12 5 Each/Pack Pack  $          9.88 3M 2030621 5 ea/ cs cs $12.94 ACS ACS5515 - 5/CT 5/CT CT $7.36 NO BID

5544  PAD, SCRUBBING, 13 IN., 5 PER PACKAGE. 20124 GLIT 3M NOR13GR 5E/CS CS  $6.95 Tough Guy  4RY11 5 Each/Pack Pack $6.45 3M 5335346 5 ea/cs cs $7.40 ACS ACS5513 - 5/CT 5/CT CT $5.82 NO BID

5546
 PAD, SPRAY BUFFING, 20 IN., RED, 5 PADS PER 

PACKAGE.
20053 GLIT 3M NOR20R 5E/CS CS $3.55 Tough Guy  4RY21 5 Each/Pack Pack  $        11.44 Reliable 2152736 5 ea/cs cs $12.27 ACS ACS5120 - 5/CT 5/CT CT $11.02 NO BID

5547  PAD, BUFFING, 15 IN, 5 PER CASE. NT15RD 3M NOR15R 5E/CS CS $1.90 Tough Guy  4RY18 5 Each/Pack Pack  $          9.28 3M 2030652 5 ea/cs cs $13.75 ACS ACS5115 - 5/CT 5/CT CT $7.36 NO BID

5548  PAD, BUFFING, 13 IN., 5 PER PACKAGE. 20046 GLIT 3M NOR13R 5E/CS CS $1.55 Tough Guy  4RY17 5 Each/Pack Pack  $          6.39 Reliable 2152726 5 ea/cs cs $6.20 ACS ACS5113 - 5/CT 5/CT CT $5.82 NO BID

5552  PAD, POLISHING, 13 IN., 5 PER PACKAGE. 14413 GLIT 3M NOR13W 5E/CS CS $1.55 Tough Guy  4RY23 5 Each/Pack Pack  $          5.59 Reliable 2152737 5 ea/cs cs $6.20 ACS ACS4113 - 5/CT 5/CT CT $5.82 NO BID

5554
 PAD, POLISHING, 20 IN., SUPER POLISH PAD, 

COLOR: WHITE, 5 PADS PER PACKAGE.
14420 GLIT 3M NOR20W 5E/CS CS $2.80 Tough Guy  4RY27 5 Each/Pack Pack  $        10.57 Reliable 2152741 5 ea/cs cs $12.27 ACS ACS4120 - 5/CT 5/CT CT $11.02 NO BID

5559
 FLOOR MAINTAINER, "SNAPBACK" SPRAY BUFF, 

JOHNSON WAX PROFESSIONAL. *NO SUBSTITUTE*
4116 JOHNSON WAX MISCO MIPFLS EA/GAL EA  $10.50 Div ersey 10C421 Each  $        23.45 Johnson Wax 6271955 4 ea/cs cs $66.73  $                -   NO BID

5564
 WAX, FLOOR, JOHNSON COMPLETE, 1 GALLON 

CAN, 4 PER CASE.
4649 COMPLETE DESCO DESENC-G 4GL/CS CS $41.35 Ability  One/Johnson 5LH21 4 Each/Case Case  $        61.18 Johnson Wax 2096866 4 ea/cs cs $47.00  $                -   NO BID State Chemical 123070 Gal 15.39  $          4,617.00 

5567  WAX REMOVER, 1 GAL. CAN, 4 PER CASE. 045830 BRAVO DESCO DESULT-G 4GL/CS GAL  $9.50 Tough Guy  2CYJ2 Each  $        14.16 Johnson Wax 6254816 4 ea/cs cs $36.24  $                -   NO BID State Chemical 124466 Gal 9.07  $          1,342.36 

5579
 FLOOR PAD, RED, BUFFING PAD, 16 IN., 5 PER 

PACKAGE.
5100 3M 3M MMM5100-16 5E/CS CS  $23.30 3M 4WC88 5 Each/Pack Pack  $        20.15 3M 2030653 5 ea/cs cs $13.60 ACS ACS5116 - 5/CT 5/CT CT $7.85 3M MMM08391 EACH  $               28.60 

5640

 BAG, DISPOSABLE, VACUUM CLEANER, FOR 

WINDSOR VERSAMATIC VS18, 10 BAGS PER 

PACKAGE - *NO SUBSTITUTION*

W2003 WINDSOR APD/WINDSOR WIN2003 10EA/PK PK  $8.95 Tough Guy  3ZJH6 10 Each/Pack Pack  $          8.73 APC f iltration 5416056 10 ea/ pkg pkg $8.00  $                -   NO BID

5648
 BAG, DISPOSABLE, VACUUM CLEANER, FOR 

EUREKA UPRIGHT STYLE F <(>&<)> G.
52320 EUREKA APD EUK52320 3EA/PK PK  $2.75 Tough Guy  3ZJK3 10 Each/Pack Pack  $          7.12 Eureka 6051827 6 ea/pkg pkg $1.83  $                -   EUREKA 52320

3PER PK/6 

PK/CASE
CASE  $               85.50 

5649
 BAG, PAPER DUST, FOR WET/DRY VACUUM 

MODEL WV-375 NUMATIC, 10 BAGS PER PKG.
NVM-2B NUMATIC  No Quote  no bid  no bid  $                -   NO BID

5650

 BAG, DISPOSABLE, VACUUM CLEANER, FOR 

EUREKA MIGHTY MITE, 3670-3695 SERIES, M/M 

STYLE. EUREKA #60295C PACKAGED 3/PKG, 

GRAINGER #3ZJK1 PACKAGED 10/PKG.

60295C  EUREKA Tough Guy  3ZJK1 10 Each/Pack Pack  $          6.96 Eureka 6096357 6 ea/pkg pkg $1.66  $                -   EUREKA 60295 EACH  $               17.95 

11698

 BAG, DISPOSABLE, VACUUM CLEANER, FOR 

NOBLES MODEL # V-SMU-14, INCLUDES 12 

VACUUM BAGS.

9007744 TENNANT Tennant 12H378 12 Each/Pack Pack  $        14.51 Tennant 5555643 12 ea/pkg pkg $14.45  $                -   NO BID

12954

 EXHAUST MICROFILTER, VACUUM CLEANER, FOR 

NOBLES MODEL # V-SMU-14. PACK INCLUDES 6 

FILTERS.

9007743 TENNANT Tennant 12H377 6 Each/Pack Pack $8.04 Tennant 5542211 6 ea /pkg pkg $11.55  $                -   NO BID

1363
 FILTER, AIR, 2W435 DRY VAC FOR SHOP 

VACUUM.
2W435 GRAINGER Day ton 2W435 Each $5.29  no bid  no bid  $                -   ZORO 2W435 EACH  $               17.95 

5184

 CLEANER, DRAIN, THRIFT AS MFG'D BY JR2D 

INC., GRANULAR, ODORLESS, NET WT 1 LB. 

BOTTLE, FOR DRAINS, GREASE TRAPS, SEPTIC 

SYSTEMS, ROOT CONTROL.

T-100 THRIFT Roebic 5TDG0 Each $12.36  no bid  no bid  $                -   NO BID

5596

 AIR FRESHENER, AEROSOL, REFILL, ECO FIRST 

IMPRESSION, 1.8 OZ., DISTRIBUTED BY ECOLAB, 

SCENT - LINEN.

30076 ECOLAB CLAIRE CLRC221 12EA/CS CS $45.45 Tough Guy  2ZXG2 Each  $          5.97 Ecolab 5141099 12 ea/cs cs $118.00  $                -   NO BID

5597

 AIR FRESHENER, AEROSOL, REFILL, ECO FIRST 

IMPRESSION, 1.8 OZ., DISTRIBUTED BY ECOLAB, 

SCENT - SPRING SHOWER.

30077 ECOLAB CLAIRE CLRC224 12EA/CS CS $45.45 Tough Guy  2ZXG5 Each  $          5.97 Ecolab 5141100 12 ea/cs cs $118.00  $                -   NO BID

5598

 AIR FRESHENER, AEROSOL, REFILL, ECO FIRST 

IMPRESSION, 1.8 OZ., DISTRIBUTED BY ECOLAB, 

SCENT - MANDARIN BURST.

30078 ECOLAB CLAIRE CLRC222 12EA/CS CS $45.45 Tough Guy  2ZXG3 Each  $          5.97 Ecolab 5113415 12 ea/cs cs $118.00  $                -   NO BID

5599

 AIR FRESHENER, AEROSOL, REFILL, ECO FIRST 

IMPRESSION, 1.8 OZ., DISTRIBUTED BY ECOLAB, 

SCENT - JUNIPER SPLASH.

30079 ECOLAB CLAIRE MANGO CLRC-223 12EA/CS CS $45.45 Tough Guy  2ZXG4 Each  $          5.97 Ecolab 5032452 12 ea/cs cs $118.00  $                -   NO BID

5601
 BRUSH, TOILET BOWL, PLASTIC FIBER, WOOD 

HANDLE.
27182 HAMBURG HBC HBC50201 12EA/CS CS $18.00 Tough Guy  1VAE9 Each  $          1.72 carlisle 5147999 24 ea/cs cs $79.47  $                -   NO BID

5607
 URINAL MATS, DISPOSABLE, SCENTED, 

ABSORBANT, COLOR: GRAY.
1525 IMPACT IMPACT IMP1525 6EA/CS CS  $36.95 Impact 2LHJ9 6 Each/Pack Pack $30.50 Impact 6293359 6 ea/cs cs $31.00  $                -   IMPACT IMP1525 6/CS CASE  $               45.95 

5613

 DRAIN OPENER, LIQUID, 32 OZ. BOTTLE, 

REGULAR STRENGTH, ELIMINATES CLOGS, 

CLEARS SLOW DRAINS, SAFE FOR SEPTIC 

SYSTEMS, GARBAGE DISPOSALS, AND PVC, 

PLASTIC AND COPPER PIPES.

R02701 ZEP NCL SURGE NAC1760 12QT/CS CS  $28.65 ZEP Prof essional 3HUN2 Each  $          4.86 Reliable 6140823 12 ea/cs cs $29.40 Boardwalk BWK7036CT 36/CT CT $23.12 ZEP R02701 12/CS CASE  $               74.40 

5615  PLUNGER, DRAIN OPENER, RUBBER, 6 IN. 9200 IMPACT HBC HBC502PD EA EA $2.60 Tough Guy  1RLV8 Each  $          5.95 Impact 1361495 ea $5.20 Boardwalk BWK09201EA EA $3.89 IMPACT IMP9200CT 6/CS CASE  $               47.65 

LOT 2 - PAPER PRODUCTS Proposed Manuf Proposed P/N
Unite 

Conversion

Invoicing 

Unit of 

MEAsure

 Invoicing Unit 

Price 

5580
 SHOP TOWEL, STEEL BLUE, KIMBERLY CLARK 

33570 (POP-UP CARTON), 5 BOXES PER CASE.
2226893 XPEDX MDI MDI95118 4-150/CS CS $38.75 Kimberly  Clark 2VHX6 5 boxes/Pack Pack  $        76.19 Kimberly  Clark 2226893 5 box/ cs cs $90.00 Kimberly  Clark KCC33570 5/CS CS $80.70 KC KCC33570 5 BX/CT CARTON  $               88.35 

5581

 WIPERS, BRAWNY, DISPOSABLE, DOUBLE 

RECREPE FABRIC MATERIAL, SHEET SIZE 9-1/4 IN. 

X 16-3/4 IN., POP-UP DISPENSING BOX, 90 WIPERS 

PER BOX, 10 BOXES PER CASE. *NO SUBSTITUTE*

20070/03 GEORGIA-

PACIFIC
GEORGIA PACIFIC FTH20090-03 CS CS $57.70 Georgia Pacif ic 6YE60 10 boxes/Pack Pack  $        69.73 Georgia-Pacif ic 5278512 10 box/ cs cs $76.31 Georgia Pacif ic GPC2007003 10BOX/CASE CS $8.47 GEORGIA PACIFIC GPC2007003CT 10 BX / CT CARTON  $             109.55 

5583
 TOILET TISSUE, 605 SHEETS, 2 PLY, 4 IN. X 4-1/2 

IN., 80 ROLL CASE.
4460-50 KIMBERLY CLARK NOVA NOV4535

4.5X3.5 96-

500/CS
CS $25.05 Tough Guy 31TW73

(500 sheet/roll) 96 

Rolls/Case
Case  $        49.84 Kimberly  Clark 2388020 80 ea/cs cs $39.65 Kimberly  Clark KCC04460 80ROL/CS CS $53.53 KC 04460 8 RLS/CS CASE  $               76.00 

5585
 TOWELS, PAPER, 150 PER PACK, C-FOLD STYLE, 

16 PACKS PER CASE.
150 KIMBERLY CLARK NPS NPS21000 CS CS $16.20 Tough Guy 36P069

(200 per pack)   

12 packs/Case
Case  $        25.80 Kimberly  Clark 5189338 16 boxes/ cs cs $19.86 Kimberly  Clark KCC01500 16PK/CS CS $36.66 KC 01510 CASE  $               40.50 PUTNEY P100B CASE  $               24.90 

5587
 TOILET TISSUE, WHITE 2 PLY, 2000 FT. TO 2640 

FT. ROLL, 12 ROLLS PER CASE.

07827-20 KIMBERLY 

CLARK
VINTAGE 25040 12-2000'/CS CS $23.10 Tough Guy 36P066

(2000 Ft/Roll)        

6 Rolls/Case
Case  $        33.25 Kimberly  Clark 5150710 12 roll /cs cs $36.58 Kimberly  Clark KCC07827 12ROLL/CS CS $61.21 KC 07827 6 RLS/CS CASE  $               70.50 ATLAS A730 CASE OF 6  $               29.30 

5589
 COVER, TOILET SEAT, HALF FOLD, WHITE, 5000 

PER CASE, (20 PKGS /250 EA).

25177673 ROCHESTER 

MIDLAND
CRYSTALWARE SCR202050 CS CS $26.60 Tough Guy 2VEX6

(250 Sheets/Box)  

20 Boxes/Pack
Pack  $        39.67 Rochester Midland 5144191 20 pkgs/ cs cs $28.25 Hospeco HOSDS5000CT 5000/CS CS $28.15 BOARDWALK BWLL5000 CASE  $               36.45 

5590  CUPS, DRINKING, PAPER, 7 OZ., 100 PER BOX. R7N-J8000 SOLO Solo 13C002 pk/2000 Pack  $       110.31 Solo 5385632 20 sleev es/ cs cs $69.20 Solo SCCR7NJ 20/PK 100 CT CT $68.25 SOLO 8J8 1000/CS CASE  $               20.80 

5591

 FACIAL TISSUE 100-2 PLY PER BOX, BOX SIZE 8 

IN. X 8.3 IN. ONLY, 30 BOXES PER CASE, 

SURPASS.

21340 KIMBERLY CLARK 

SURPASS
GEORGIA PACIFIC FTH48100 CS CS $18.05 Tough Guy 22UY40

Case= 30 Boxes 

(100 2 Ply /Box)
Case  $        24.43 Kimberly  Clark 6292892 30 box/cs cs $20.52 Kimberly  Clark KCC21340 - 30/CT 30/CT CT $24.08 KC 21430

100/BX - 30 

BX/CS
CASE  $               41.35 CRYSTALWARE T100VAP 317 CASES CASE OF 30  $               19.66 

5593
 TAMPONS, PLAYTEX GENTLE GUIDE, BULK PACK 

500 PER CASE.
3U822 GRAINGER HOSPECO HOST500 CS CS  $54.00 Hospeco 3U822 500 Each/Case Case  $        56.25 Rochester Midland 5074023 500 ea/cs cs $55.00 Hospeco HOSTAMPAX 500/CS CS $50.86 GRAINGER T-500-34822 500/PKG PKG  $             163.90 

5594
 SANITARY NAPKINS, MODESS 8 STAYFREE, 250 

PER CASE.
3U819 GRAINGER HOSPECO HOST48 CS CS  $35.05 Hospeco 3U819 250 Each/Case Case $33.54 Hospeco 2028077 250 ea/cs cs $36.00 Hospeco HOSMT8 250/CS CS $47.13 GRAINGER MT-8-30819 250/PKG PKG  $             122.20 

5595
 SANITARY NAPKINS, MAXI, FOLDED, 4 IN BOX, 250 

PER CASE.

4-147 HOSPITAL 

SPECIALTY
HOSPICO HOS140 CS CS  $29.95 Hospeco 3U818 250 Each/Case Case  $        31.69 Hospeco 2028079 250 ea/cs cs $31.50 Hospeco HOS147A 250/CS CS $26.36 GRAINGER MT-4-30818 250/PKG PKG  $               94.65 

5634
 DISPENSER, TOILET SEAT COVER, HALF FOLD, 

WHITE STYRENE, (CAPACITY 2 PKGS./250 EA.).
9247 PROTECTO GEORGIA PACIFIC FTH57740 EA EA $5.95 Tough Guy 2VEX8 Each  $          7.13 Hospeco 2058801 ea $7.07 Hospeco HOSHG12 2PK/250EA 2PK $11.30 NO BID

5635

 TISSUE DISPENSER, JUMBO ROLL, PLASTIC 

SMOKE/GREY, WITH LOCKING MECHANISM, 

HOLDS A 2000 FT. 2-PLY ROLL, DIMENSIONS: 13.88 

IN. X 16 IN. X 5.75 IN.

09612 KIMBERLY-CLARK Tough Guy 4YRE3 Each  $        16.59 Kimberly  Clark 5208969 ea $8.00 Kimberly  Clark KCC09612 EA EA $31.60 KC 09612 EACH  $               43.85 

5636

 DISPENSER, PAPER TOWEL, TRANSLUCENT 

PLASTIC, SMOKE GREY, IN-SIGHT SERIES, 

UNIVERSAL TOWEL DISPENSER, 18.85 IN. X 13.31 

IN. X 5.85 IN.

09905 KIMBERLY CLARK GEORGIA PACIFIC FTH566-50 EA EA  $15.50 Tough Guy 22LC62 Each  $        15.52 Kimberly  Clark 5042151 ea $9.00 Kimberly  Clark KCC09905 EA EA $36.07 KC 09905 EACH  $               43.85 

LOT 3 - TRASH BAGS
NO SAMPLES 

PROVIDED

NO SAMPLES 

PROVIDED

NO SAMPLES 

PROVIDED

NO SAMPLES 

PROVIDED

NO SAMPLES 

PROVIDED

NO SAMPLES 

PROVIDED

NO SAMPLES 

PROVIDED

5618
 TRASH BAG, PLASTIC 2 MIL, 250 BAGS PER 

CARTON, 16 INCH X 14 INCH X 36 INCH, BLACK.
COLONIAL T66-36X CS CS  $18.40 Tough Guy 31DK54 125 Bags/Pack Pack  $        18.58 Berry PGR3036x3B 250 ea/cs cs $28.15 HERITAGE HERX6639QK 100/CT CT $27.16 NORTH AMERICAN PGB3761 20-30 GAL - 2 MIL CASE  $               43.55 All American Poly 3036XXH-AAP 250/case case  $               23.92 Calico 9910232SP 250/cs 250/cs  $               23.84 CENTRAL POLY CP161436K2 CASE  $               22.90 Dy na Pak 16143620B 250/case CS $30.80 ORLY INDUSTRY ORLY30X36 2MIL CS  $               20.55 

5623
 TRASH BAG, PLASTIC, 1.5 MIL, 20 INCH X 13 INCH 

X 39 INCH, BLACK, 250 BAGS PER CASE.
COLONIAL T66-39X CS CS  $21.75 Tough Guy 31DK55 125 Bags/Pack Pack  $        20.65 Berry 6337726 100 ea/cs cs $13.39 HERITAGE HERX6639AK 250/CS CS $14.87 NORTH AMERICAN PGB3771

20-30 GAL - 1.5 

MIL
CASE  $               15.30 All American Poly 3339XXH-AAP 250/case case  $               21.99 Calico 9910347S 250/cs 250/cs  $               22.04 CENTRAL POLY CP201339K1.5 CASE  $               19.40 Dy na Pak 20133915B 250/case CS $27.59 ORLY INDUSTRY ORLY33X39 1.5MIL CS  $               23.85 

5624
 TRASH BAG, PLASTIC, 2 MIL., BLACK, 44 INCH X 48 

INCH, 100 BAGS PER CASE.
COLONIAL T66-47XX CS CS  $22.50 Tough Guy 31DK60 100 Bags/Pack Pack  $        35.42 Berry 6337683 100 ea/cs cs $28.05 HERITAGE HERX8647QK 100/CS CS $31.01 ESSENDANT PNL-523 60 GAL - 2 MIL CASE  $               34.15 All American Poly 4448XXH-AAP 100/case case  $               18.99 Calico 9910398 100/cs 100/cs  $               20.69 CENTRAL POLY CP4448K2 CASE  $               19.10 Dy na Pak 44004820B 100/case CS $24.21 ORLY INDUSTRY ORLY44X48 2MIL CS  $               25.15 

5625

 TRASH BAG, PLASTIC, 22 INCH X 16 INCH X 58 

INCH, 3 MIL., POLYETHLENE, BLACK, 75-100 BAGS 

PER CASE.

COLONIAL T66-58XXH CS CS  $24.85 Tough Guy 15E503 50 Bags/Pack Pack  $        27.97 Reliable 6337642 100 ea/cs cs $15.29 HERITAGE HERX7658QK (2 MIL) 100/CS CS $33.70 NO BID All American Poly 3858XXH-AAP 75/case case  $               22.30 Calico 9911061MSP 75/cs 75/cs  $               22.24 CENTRAL POLY CP221658K3 CASE  $               28.10 Dy na Pak 22165830B 75/case CS $27.33 ORLY INDUSTRY ORLY38X58 3MIL CS  $               25.65 

11106

 LINER, LAMINATED, ALUMINUM/POLY, FOR 

CIGARETTE BUTT DISPOSAL, 18 IN. HIGH, 20 IN. 

WIDE, COLOR: GRAY TO FIT 11-3/4 IN. WIDE X 10 

IN. HIGH BUCKET. 10 LINERS PER PACKAGE.

26827 JUSTRITE JUSTNITE PXD39XH 100/CS CS  $35.50 Justrite 5LTR2 10/pack Pack  $        15.16 Justrite 6182659 pkg $30.00 $0.00 JUSTRITE 26827 10/PKG PKG  $               21.90 Justrite 26827 10/pkg 10/pkg  $               28.94 Dy na Pak 18200000X 10/case CS $65 ORLY INDUSTRY ORLY18X20 CS  $               10.00 

12216

 TRASH BAG, PLASTIC, 1.5 MIL, RECYCLING, 20 

INCH X 13 INCH X 39 INCH, CLEAR, 250 BAGS PER 

CASE.

20133915CLEAR COLONIAL PXD39XH 100/CS CS  $13.35 Tough Guy 31DK42 200 Bags/Pack Pack  $        24.08 Reliable 6337657 250 ea/cs cs $31.50 HERITAGE HERH6639AC 100/CS CS $33.98 NORTH AMERICAN PGB4051 33 GAL - 1.5 MIL CASE  $               15.30 All American Poly 3339XXH-AAP 250/case case  $               26.91 Calico 9911394SP 250/cs 250/cs  $               27.88 CENTRAL POLY CP201339N1.5 CASE  $               26.90 Dy na Pak 20133915C 250/case CS $30.51 ORLY INDUSTRY ORLYCL33X39 1.5MIL CS  $               27.00 

12516

 TRASH BAG, PLASTIC, 1.5 MIL, RECYCLING, 33 

INCH X 18 INCH X 44 INCH, CLEAR, 250 BAGS PER 

CASE.

331844CLEAR SIGMA 12516 CS CS  $53.85 Tough Guy 15E502 100 Bags/Pack Pack  $        31.61 Pitt 6061498 100 ea/cs cs $35.00 HERITAGE HERH56 100/CS CS $31.94 NORTH AMERICAN PGB6171 60 GAL - 1.5 MIL PKG  $               21.85 All American Poly 5144XXH-AAP 125/case case  $               23.46 Calico 99SP331844C 250/cs 250/cs  $               51.18 CENTRAL POLY CP331844N1.5 CASE  $               19.80 Dy na Pak 33184415C 250/case CS $53.34 ORLY INDUSTRY ORLYCL51X44 1.5MIL CS  $               40.00 

CS

LOT 4 - MATTING

5671

 MATTING, RIBBED OLEFIN, 36 IN. WIDE, 3/8 IN. 

THICKNESS, 60 FT. ROLL, SLIP RESISTANT VINYL 

BACKING. *COLOR; CHARCOAL*

117 HERITAGE RIB 

SUPERIOR MFG
CROWN #235 3X60 ROLL ROLL  $275.00 Notrax 40K173 60 Foot/Roll Roll  $       368.71 Superior or Crown

5135541  or 235 needle 

rib 
mat

$642 Superior or 

$369.00 crown

117 HERITAGE RIB 

SUPERIOR MFG
FT FT $97,632.00 SUPERIOR 117 ROLL  $             634.50 

5672

 MATTING, ANTI-FATIGUE, PREMIUM CLOSED CELL 

VINYL SPONGE, RIBBED SURFACE, 3/8 IN. THICK, 

36 IN. WIDE, 60 FT. PER ROLL. COLOR: BLACK.

SS3BK MATS INC. CROWN #410 3X60 ROLL ROLL  $230.00 Notrax 5Z056 60 Foot/Roll Roll  $       212.87 Mats Inc  or Crown
SS3BK or 410/411 Tuf f  

spun
mat

$423.00 f or Matts 

Inc or $303.00 f or 

Crown

SS3BK MATS INC. FT FT $4,881.60 CROWN TS33836BK ROLL  $204.75 

5673

 MAT, INDOOR/OUTDOOR, DELUXE OLEFIN, 3 FT. X 

6 FT., 3/8 IN. THICKNESS, VINYL BACKING WITH 

VINYL BORDER ON 4 SIDES, COLOR; CHARCOAL.

3672 DELUXE OLEFIN CROWN #315 EA EA  $28.25 Crown Matting Tech 30CM11 4 f t x 6 f t Each  $        72.83 Superior or Crown
6256621 or 315 Rely  

on Oelf in Crown
ea

 $54.45 Superior or 

$36.90 f or Crown 
3672 DELUXE OLEFIN EA EA  $          528.84 SUPERIOR 109CH EACH  $               45.90 

5674

 MAT, INDOOR/OUTDOOR, DELUXE OLEFIN, 3 FT. X 

4 FT., 3/8 IN. THICKNESS, VINYL BACKING WITH 

VINYL BORDER ON 4 SIDES, COLOR; CHARCOAL.

3648 DELUXE OLEFIN CROWN #315 EA EA  $19.35 Crown Matting Tech 30CM07 3 f t x 4 f t Each  $        31.71 Superior or Crown
6212325 or 315 Rely  

on Olef in Crown
ea

 $36.30 Superior or 

$24.60 Crown 
3648 DELUXE OLEFIN EA EA  $          528.84 SUPERIOR 109CH EACH  $               30.60 

5675

 MAT, ANTI-FATIGUE, 5/8 IN., 2 FT. X 3 FT., 

ARMSTRONG, STANDER'S CHOICE HEALTH MAT, 

COLOR: BLACK.

CROWN MATTING SUPER 

SPONGE
CROWN #430 EA EA  $23.00 Notrax 5W712 2 f t x 3 f t Each  $12.01 Crown 430 or 431 Tuf f  Spun ea $24.55 

CROWN MATTING 

SUPER SPONGE 
EA EA $3,024.00 SUPERIOR 109BK EACH  $               15.30 

5676

 MAT, INDOOR/OUTDOOR, DELUXE OLEFIN, 4 FT. X 

8 FT., 3/8 IN. THICKNESS, VINYL BACKING WITH 

VINYL BORDER ON 4 SIDES, COLOR; CHARCOAL.

4896 DELUXE OLEFIN CROWN #315 EA EA  $48.95 Crown Matting Tech 30CM12 4 f t x 8 f t Each  $       103.12 Superior or Crown
6255170 or 315 Rely  

on Olef in Crown
ea

 $96.78 Superior or 

$65.60 Crown 
4896 DELUXE OLEFIN EA EA  $          795.52 SUPERIOR 109CH EACH  $               81.60 

9680

 MAT, INDOOR/OUTDOOR, DELUXE OLEFIN, 4 FT. X 

6 FT., 3/8 IN. THICKNESS, VINYL BACKING WITH 

VINYL BORDER ON 4 SIDES.

*SPECIFY AVAILABLE COLORS*

109 SUPERIOR MAT CROWN #315 EA EA  $36.70 Notrax 5Z176 4 f t x 6 f t Each  $        51.77 Superior or Crown

Superior 130 Hunter 

Green, Red/Black, 

Brown, Charcoal, slate 

Blue, Nav y  , Burgundy -

-- Crown 315 , Black, 

Casteean Red, 

Charcoal, Ev ergreen, 

Marlin Blue, Nav y  Blue, 

Pebble Brown, Walnut

ea
 $145.17 Superior 

or Crown $49.20 
109 SUPERIOR MAT EA EA  $           54.24 SUPERIOR

109-AVAIL COLORS - 

BURGUNDY, 

HUNTER GREEN, 

BROWN, 

CHARCOAL, SLATE 

BLUE

EACH  $               61.20 

9855

 MATTING, OLEFIN, 48 IN. WIDE, 3/8 IN. 

THICKNESS, 60 FT. ROLL, SLIP RESISTANT VINYL 

BACKING. *SPECIFY AVAILABLE COLORS*

ANDERSEN MAT 

IMPRESSIONIST 871
CROWN #315 4X60' ROLL ROLL  $352.00 Notrax 25PP50 3 f t x 60 f t/Roll Roll  $       811.23 Anderson or Crown

Andersen 871 

Academy  Blue, 

Burgundy , Cardinal red, 

Black, Forest Green, 

Nav y  Blue, Sable, Salt 

and Pepper--- Crown 

Black, Castellan Red, 

Charcoal, Ev ergreen., 

Marlin Blue, Nav y  Blue, 

Pebble Brown , walnut

mat
$714.50 Andersen 

$432.00 Crown

ANDERSEN MAT 

IMPRESSIONIST 871
FT FT $13,017.60 SUPERIOR

109-AVAIL COLORS - 

BURGUNDY, 

HUNTER GREEN, 

BROWN, 

CHARCOAL, SLATE 

BLUE

ROLL  $             459.00 

9856

 MAT, INDOOR/OUTDOOR, DELUXE OLEFIN, 3 FT. X 

5 FT., 3/8 IN. THICKNESS, VINYL BACKING WITH 

VINYL BORDER ON 4 SIDES. 

*SPECIFY AVAILABLE COLORS*

3660 DELUXE OLEFIN CROWN #315 EA EA  $23.50 Crown Matting Tech 30CM08 3 f t x 5 f t Each  $        43.27 Superior or Crown

Superior 130, 

Red/Black, Charcoal, 

Brown, Nav y , Hunter 

Green, slate Blue, 

Burgundy ---Crown 315, 

Black, Castellan Red, 

Charcoal, Ev ergreen, 

Marlin Blue, Nav y  Blue, 

Pebble Brown, Walnut

ea
 $45.40 Superior or 

Crown $30.75 
3660 DELUXE OLEFIN EA EA  $          118.65 SUPERIOR

109-AVAIL COLORS - 

BURGUNDY, 

HUNTER GREEN, 

BROWN, 

CHARCOAL, SLATE 

BLUE

EACH  $               37.90 
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