Pennsylvania Turnpike Commission
Tabulation of Bids
Sealed Bid
Liquid Calcium Chloride ENVIROTECH INNOVATIVE SURFACE
851002-2016 SERVICES, INC JET STREAM FUELS SOLUTIONS
OPENING DATE: 5/26/16, 11:00 AM EVANS, CO ORLANDO, FL GLENMONT, NY
STORAGE | UNIT SURCHARGE/ UNIT SURCHARGE/ UNIT SURCHARGE/
TANK SIZE | PRICE/ GALLON PRICE/ GALLON PRICE/ GALLON
GALLON GALLON GALLON
LOCATION UoOM
HOMEWOOD GAL 10000 0.77 0.25 0.82 0.25 1.06 0.25
BEAVER VALLEY EXPRESSWAY GAL 10000 0.77 0.25 0.83 0.25 1.06 0.25
GIBSONIA GAL 10000 0.77 0.25 0.81 0.25 1.02 0.25
HARRISON CITY GAL 10000 0.77 0.25 0.80 0.25 1.00 0.25
DONEGAL GAL 10000 0.77 0.25 0.80 0.25 1.01 0.25
LAUREL HILL GAL 10000 0.77 0.25 0.83 0.25 1.04 0.25
GREENSBURG MAINT. GAL 10000 0.77 0.25 0.80 0.25 1.00 0.25
JEFFERSON HILLS MAINT. GAL 10000 0.77 0.25 0.82 0.25 1.02 0.25
CALIFORNIA INTERCHANGE GAL 10000 0.77 0.25 0.82 0.25 1.02 0.25
SEARIGHTS MAINT. BLDG. GAL 10000 0.77 0.25 0.82 0.25 1.02 0.25
SMITHFIELD SALT STORAGE SHED GAL 10000 0.77 0.25 0.83 0.25 1.04 0.25
ROUTE 22 SALT STORAGE SHED GAL 10000 0.80 0.25 0.83 0.25 1.04 0.25
SOMERSET GAL 50000 0.80 0.25 0.79 0.25 0.99 0.25
ALLEGHENY TUNNEL GAL 10000 0.80 0.25 0.80 0.25 0.99 0.25
KEGG GAL 5000 0.80 0.25 0.79 0.25 0.96 0.25
EVERETT GAL 10000 0.80 0.25 0.80 0.25 0.93 0.25
SIDELING HILL GAL 10000 0.80 0.25 0.80 0.25 0.92 0.25
BURNT CABINS GAL 10000 0.80 0.25 0.79 0.25 0.91 0.25
NEWVILLE GAL (1) 5000 0.88 0.25 0.81 0.25 0.85 0.25
(1) 10000
PTC CARLISLE SALT STORAGE MP 226.3-RT | GAL (2) 5000 0.88 0.25 0.82 0.25 0.85 0.25
&lle CUMBERLAND GAL 10000 0.88 0.25 0.86 0.25 0.85 0.25
MT. GRETNA GAL 10000 0.88 0.25 0.85 0.25 0.85 0.25
BOWMANSVILLE GAL 10000 0.88 0.25 0.86 0.25 0.85 0.25
DEVAULT GAL 10000 1.02 0.25 0.89 0.25 0.89 0.25
PLYMOUTH MEETING GAL 10000 1.02 0.25 0.91 0.25 0.89 0.25
TREVOSE GAL (2) 5000 1.02 0.25 0.92 0.25 0.89 0.25
QUAKERTOWN GAL 10000 1.02 0.25 0.89 0.25 0.89 0.25
SLATINGTON GAL 10000 1.02 0.25 0.87 0.25 0.89 0.25
POCONO GAL 10000 1.02 0.25 0.84 0.25 0.89 0.25
WYOMING VALLEY GAL 10000 1.02 0.25 0.85 0.25 0.89 0.25
TRUCK CAPACITY 4500 4200 4000
NO BIDS:CARGILL DEICING TECHNOLOGY
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Pennsylvania Turnpike Commission

Tabulation of Bids

Sealed Bid

Liquid Calcium Chloride

ENVIRONMENTAL RECON
851002-2016 CALCIUM CHLORIDE |ENERGY SOLUTIONS|  CONSTRUCTION
OPENING DATE: 5/26/16, 11:00 AM GROVE CITY, PA SEWARD, PA YORK, PA

UNIT |SURCHARGE/| UNIT |SURCHARGE/| UNIT SURCHARGE/
PRICE/ GALLON PRICE/ GALLON PRICE/ GALLON
GALLON GALLON GALLON

LOCATION UOM
HOMEWOOD GAL 0.86 0.45 1.07 0.40 NOBID NO BID
BEAVER VALLEY EXPRESSWAY GAL 0.86 0.45 1.05 0.40 NOBID NO BID
GIBSONIA GAL 0.86 0.45 1.03 0.40 NOBID NO BID
HARRISON CITY GAL 0.86 0.45 1.02 0.40 NOBID NO BID
DONEGAL GAL 0.86 0.45 1.01 0.40 NOBID NO BID
LAUREL HILL GAL 0.86 0.45 1.02 0.40 NOBID NO BID
GREENSBURG MAINT. GAL 0.86 0.45 1.01 0.40 NOBID NO BID
JEFFERSON HILLS MAINT. GAL 0.86 0.45 1.04 0.40 NOBID NO BID
CALIFORNIA INTERCHANGE GAL 0.86 0.45 1.03 0.40 NOBID NO BID
SEARIGHTS MAINT. BLDG. GAL 0.86 0.45 1.04 0.40 NOBID NO BID
SMITHFIELD SALT STORAGE SHED GAL 0.86 0.45 1.05 0.40 NOBID NO BID
ROUTE 22 SALT STORAGE SHED GAL 0.86 0.45 1.05 0.40 NOBID NO BID
SOMERSET GAL 0.86 0.45 1.02 0.40 NOBID NO BID
ALLEGHENY TUNNEL GAL 0.89 0.47 1.03 0.40 NOBID NO BID
KEGG GAL 0.89 0.47 1.03 0.40 NO BID NO BID
EVERETT GAL 0.89 0.47 1.03 0.40 NO BID NO BID
SIDELING HILL GAL 0.89 0.47 1.05 0.40 NO BID NO BID
BURNT CABINS GAL 0.89 0.47 1.05 0.40 1.205 0.225
NEWVILLE GAL 1.36 0.60 1.09 0.40 1.155 0.175
PTC CARLISLE SALT STORAGE MP 226.3 - RT | GAL 1.36 0.60 1.10 0.40 1.145 0.165
&IJI_EW CUMBERLAND GAL 1.36 0.60 1.11 0.40 1.13 0.15
MT. GRETNA GAL 1.36 0.60 1.12 0.40 1.135 0.155
BOWMANSVILLE GAL 1.36 0.60 1.14 0.40 1.17 0.19
DEVAULT GAL NO BID NO BID 1.17 0.40 NOBID NO BID
PLYMOUTH MEETING GAL NO BID NO BID 1.18 0.40 NOBID NO BID
TREVOSE GAL NO BID NO BID 1.19 0.40 NOBID NO BID
QUAKERTOWN GAL NO BID NO BID 1.20 0.40 NOBID NO BID
SLATINGTON GAL NO BID NO BID 1.18 0.40 NOBID NO BID
POCONO GAL NO BID NO BID 1.14 0.40 NOBID NO BID
WYOMING VALLEY GAL NO BID NO BID 1.16 0.40 NOBID NO BID

TRUCK CAPACITY 4000 - 4400 4000 4400
NO BIDS:CARGILL DEICING TECHNOLOGY
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Pennsylvania Turnpike Commission

Tabulation of Bids

*Alternate product

Sealed Bid

Liquid Calcium Chloride
851002-2016

POLYDYNE INC.

RENTAL

CONSULTANTS, INC.

OPENING DATE: 5/26/16, 11:00 AM

RICEBORO, GA

PIKESVILLE, KY

UNIT SURCHARGE/ UNIT SURCHARGE/
PRICE/ GALLON PRICE/ GALLON
GALLON GALLON

LOCATION UOM

HOMEWOOD GAL 1.22 0.35 0.75 0.20
BEAVER VALLEY EXPRESSWAY GAL 1.22 0.35 0.75 0.20
GIBSONIA GAL 1.22 0.35 0.75 0.20
HARRISON CITY GAL 1.22 0.35 0.75 0.20
DONEGAL GAL 1.22 0.35 0.75 0.20
LAUREL HILL GAL 1.22 0.35 0.75 0.20
GREENSBURG MAINT. GAL 1.22 0.35 0.75 0.20
JEFFERSON HILLS MAINT. GAL 1.22 0.35 0.75 0.20
CALIFORNIA INTERCHANGE GAL 1.22 0.35 0.75 0.20
SEARIGHTS MAINT. BLDG. GAL 1.22 0.35 0.75 0.20
SMITHFIELD SALT STORAGE SHED GAL 1.22 0.35 0.75 0.20
ROUTE 22 SALT STORAGE SHED GAL 1.22 0.35 0.75 0.20
SOMERSET GAL 1.22 0.35 0.77 0.20
ALLEGHENY TUNNEL GAL 1.22 0.35 0.77 0.20
KEGG GAL 1.22 0.35 0.77 0.20
EVERETT GAL 1.22 0.35 0.77 0.20
SIDELING HILL GAL 1.22 0.35 0.77 0.20
BURNT CABINS GAL 1.22 0.35 0.77 0.20
NEWVILLE GAL 1.22 0.35 0.84 0.35
PTC CARLISLE SALT STORAGE MP 226.3 - RT | GAL 1.22 0.35 0.84 0.35
iﬁEW CUMBERLAND GAL 1.22 0.35 0.84 0.35
MT. GRETNA GAL 1.22 0.35 0.84 0.35
BOWMANSVILLE GAL 1.22 0.35 0.84 0.35
DEVAULT GAL 1.22 0.35 0.92 0.35
PLYMOUTH MEETING GAL 1.22 0.35 0.92 0.35
TREVOSE GAL 1.22 0.35 0.92 0.35
QUAKERTOWN GAL 1.22 0.35 0.94 0.35
SLATINGTON GAL 1.22 0.35 0.94 0.35
POCONO GAL 1.22 0.35 0.94 0.35
WYOMING VALLEY GAL 1.22 0.35 0.94 0.35

TRUCK CAPACITY 4000 4500

NO BIDS:CARGILL DEICING TECHNOLOGY

Page 3 of 3



