Pennsylvania Turnpike Commission |

Tabulation of Bids

Sealed Bid

Award: District 2

Award: District 5

Calcium Chloride 851001-851002-2018

CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP.

SAL CHEMICAL

MAIN POOL & CHEMICAL CO., INC.

OPENING DATE: 4/25/18, 2:00 PM ELMIRA, NY WEIRTON, WV DUPONT, PA

Annual | # of Bags/ |Unit Price Est. Total # of Bags/ |Unit Price Est. Total # of Bags/ |Unit Price Est. Total
LOT 1-FLAKED CALCIUM CHLORIDE UOM | Usage pallet |/bag Price pallet /bag Price pallet /bag Price
LOCATION

. . . . NO BID
District 1 - Gibsonia Maint. Warehouse BAG 55 55 $13.25 $728.75 55 $12.40 $682.00
District 2 - Everett Maint. Warehouse BAG 275 55 $13.25 $3,643.75 55 $13.40 $3,685.00 60 $13.48 $3,707.00
District 2 Fare Collection Warehouse BAG 250 55 $13.25 $3,312.50 55 $13.40 $3,350.00 60 $13.48 $3,370.00
District 5 - Slatington Maint. Bldg. BAG 200 55 $13.25 $2,650.00 55 $13.40 $2,680.00 60 $12.48 $2,496.00
EVALUATION TOTAL $10,335.00 $10,397.00
CONTRACT TARGET VALUES] | $10,000 | $3,000
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Pennsylvania Turnpike Commission

Tabulation of Bids

Sealed Bid

Award: District 2

Award: District 3,4,5

Award: District 1

Calcium Chloride 851001-851002-2018

HARMONEY DEICING

INNOVATIVE MUNICIPAL

ENVIRONMENTAL

PRODUCTS PRODUCTS, INC. CALCIUM CHLORIDE ENERGY SOLUTIONS
OPENING DATE: 4/25/18, 2:00 PM ST. CHARLES, IL GLENMONT, NY GROVE CITY, PA INDIANA, PA
STORAGE UNIT |SURCHARGE| UNIT | SURCHARG UNIT  SURCHARGE/] UNIT | SURCHARG
TANK SIZE| PRICE/ / GALLON PRICE/ | E/ GALLON | PRICE/ GALLON PRICE/ | E/ GALLON
LOT 2 - LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE UoMm GALLON GALLON GALLON GALLON
LOCATION
HOMEWOOD GAL 10000 0.90 0.30 1.08 0.25 0.86 0.40 1.10 0.40
BEAVER VALLEY EXPRESSWAY GAL 10000 0.90 0.30 1.08 0.25 0.86 0.40 1.08 0.40
GIBSONIA GAL 10000 0.90 0.30 1.06 0.25 0.86 0.40 1.06 0.40
HARRISON CITY GAL 10000 0.90 0.30 1.02 0.25 0.86 0.40 1.05 0.40
DONEGAL GAL 10000 0.92 0.30 1.02 0.25 0.86 0.40 1.04 0.40
LAUREL HILL GAL 10000 0.92 0.30 1.07 0.25 0.86 0.40 1.05 0.40
GREENSBURG MAINT. GAL 10000 0.92 0.30 1.02 0.25 0.86 0.40 1.04 0.40
JEFFERSON HILLS MAINT. GAL 10000 0.92 0.30 1.06 0.25 0.86 0.40 1.07 0.40
CALIFORNIA INTERCHANGE GAL 10000 0.92 0.30 1.06 0.25 0.86 0.40 1.06 0.40
SEARIGHTS MAINT. BLDG. GAL 10000 0.92 0.30 1.06 0.25 0.86 0.40 1.07 0.40
SMITHFIELD SALT STORAGE SHED GAL 10000 0.90 0.30 1.08 0.25 0.86 0.40 1.08 0.40
ROUTE 22 SALT STORAGE SHED GAL 10000 0.90 0.30 1.06 0.25 0.86 0.40 1.08 0.40
SOMERSET GAL 50000 0.93 0.32 1.01 0.25 0.93 0.40 1.05 0.40
ALLEGHENY TUNNEL GAL 10000 0.93 0.32 1.02 0.25 0.93 0.40 1.06 0.40
KEGG GAL 5000 0.93 0.32 1.01 0.25 0.93 0.40 1.06 0.40
EVERETT GAL 10000 0.94 0.35 0.96 0.25 0.93 0.40 1.06 0.40
SIDELING HILL GAL 10000 0.94 0.35 0.96 0.25 0.93 0.40 1.08 0.40
BURNT CABINS GAL 10000 0.94 0.35 0.90 0.25 1.00 0.40 1.08 0.40
NEWVILLE GAL (1) 5000 0.98 0.37 0.87 0.25 NO BID NO BID 1.12 0.40
(1) 10000
CARLISLE SALT STORAGE GAL (2) 5000 0.98 0.37 0.87 0.25 NO BID NO BID 1.13 0.40
NEW CUMBERLAND GAL 10000 0.98 0.37 0.86 0.25 NO BID NO BID 1.14 0.40
MT. GRETNA GAL 10000 1.00 0.38 0.86 0.25 NO BID NO BID 1.15 0.40
BOWMANSVILLE GAL 10000 1.03 0.39 0.87 0.25 NO BID NO BID 1.17 0.40
DEVAULT GAL 10000 1.08 0.48 0.94 0.25 NO BID NO BID 1.20 0.40
PLYMOUTH MEETING GAL 10000 1.11 0.49 0.94 0.25 NO BID NO BID 1.21 0.40
TREVOSE GAL (2) 5000 1.11 0.49 0.94 0.25 NO BID NO BID 1.22 0.40
QUAKERTOWN GAL 10000 1.12 0.53 0.94 0.25 NO BID NO BID 1.23 0.40
SLATINGTON GAL 10000 1.12 0.53 0.94 0.25 NO BID NO BID 1.21 0.40
POCONO GAL 10000 1.12 0.53 0.94 0.25 NO BID NO BID 1.17 0.40
WYOMING VALLEY GAL 10000 1.12 0.53 0.94 0.25 NO BID NO BID 1.19 0.40
TRUCK CAPACITY 4000 - 4500 4000 4000 - 4200 4000
NO BIDS:

Page 2 of 2




	Bid Tab-LOT 1
	Bid Tab-LOT2

