Pennsylvania Turnpike Commission

Bid Tabulation

RFx Number 6100005455

Split award / Partial Rebid Glacial Sand & Gravel Co Hempt Bros Inc

Awarded 7000009718 7000009719

Net Value $43,625.00 USD $7,425.00 USD
Line Item # Description Qty Unit Net Price Net Value Currency Net Price Net Value Currency

1 ANTI-SKID TYPE AS1 8669 250 TON $26.90 $6,725.00 usb $0.00 $0.00 usD
2 ANTI-SKID TYPE AS1 8669 250 TON Re-Bid 6100005462
3 ANTI-SKID TYPE AS1 8669 500 TON $29.80 $14,900.00 usb $0.00 $0.00 usD
4 ANTI-SKID TYPE AS1 8669 500 TON Re-Bid 6100005462
5 ANTI-SKID TYPE AS1 8669 500 TON $22.20 $11,100.00 usb $0.00 $0.00 usD
6 ANTI-SKID TYPE AS1 8669 500 TON Re-Bid 6100005462
7 ANTI-SKID TYPE AS1 8669 500 TON $21.80 $10,900.00 usb $0.00 $0.00 usD
8 ANTI-SKID TYPE AS1 8669 100 TON Re-Bid 6100005462
9 ANTI-SKID TYPEAS1 8669 750 TON Re-Bid 6100005462
10 ANTI-SKID TYPE AS1 8669 100 TON Re-Bid 6100005462
11 ANTI-SKID TYPEAS1 8669 500 TON Re-Bid 6100005462
12 ANTI-SKID TYPEAS1 8669 100 TON $0.00 $0.00 usb $17.25 $1,725.00 usD
13 ANTI-SKID TYPE AS1 8669 300 TON $0.00 $0.00 usb $19.00 $5,700.00 usD
14 ANTI-SKID TYPE AS1 8669 350 TON Re-Bid 6100005462
15 ANTI-SKID TYPE AS1 8669 400 TON Re-Bid 6100005462

No Bid - Harmoney Deicing
No Bid - Hansen Aggregates BMC, Inc

No Bid - Glasgow Inc.
No Bid - HK Group




