PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

REJECTED/DELETED ITEM Supplies Hotline Corp Beyond Technology
Line TONER CONTRACT 7/1/2014-6/30/2015 Prime MPN Est Usage JVendor Stock | OEM Unit Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price
# # Price # Price
1 5788 | Brother |PRINT CARTRIDGE INTELLIFAX PPF-4750E ' TN460 BROTHER 18 TN460 $57.00 $ 1,026.00 JTN460 $64.21 $ 1,155.78
2 5815 [Canon | TONER CANON C3380I MAGENTA 0454B003AA 1 J0454B003AA |$114.00 $ 114.00 J0454B0O03AA | $127.66 $ 127.66
CANON
3 5816 Canon |TONER CANON C3380I YELLOW 0455B003AA 1 JO455B003AA | $114.00 $ 114.00 J0455B003AA $127.66 $ 127.66
CANON
4 5817 [Canon | TONER CANON C3380I BLACK 0452B003AA 1 0452BO03AA  |$45.00 $ 45.00 J0452B003AA | $54.89 $ 54.89
CANON
5 | 10205 Canon |BOTTLE, WASTE TONER CANON C3380I FM2-5533-000 1 FM-5533-000 |$16.00 $ 16.00 JFM2-5533-000 | $22.37 $ 22.37
CANON
6 | 11094 [Canon |PRINT CARTRIDGE, LBP7660CDN, BLACK |BLK-LBP7200CDN 35 2662B001AA | $108.00 $ 3,780.00 J2662B001AA |$111.52 $ 3,903.20
CANON
7 | 11095 [Canon |PRINT CARTRIDGE, LBP7660CDN, MAGN- 30 2660BO01AA | $106.00 $ 3,180.00 J2660B001AA $108.30 $ 3,249.00
MAGENTA LBP7200CDN
CANON
8 | 11096 Canon |PRINT CARTRIDGE, LBP7660CDN, CYAN CYAN- 27 2661BO01AA | $106.00 $ 2,862.00 J2661B001AA | $108.30 $ 2,924.10
LBP7200CDN
CANON
9 | 11097 Canon PRINT CARTRIDGE, LBP7660CDN, YELLOW|YLW-LBP7200CDN 30 2659B001AA |$106.00 $ 3,180.00 J2659B001AA |$108.30 $ 3,249.00
CANON
10 | 5789 |Epson |[PRINT CARTRIDGE EPSON 1280 BLACK T007201 EPSON 32 T007201 $23.00 $ 736.00 §T007201 $23.78 $ 760.96
11 | 5790 Epson | PRINT CARTRIDGE EPSON 1280 COLOR T009201 EPSON 1 T009201 $28.00 $ 28.00 JT009201 $28.71 $ 28.71
12 | 5821 [Epson |PRINT CARTRIDGE EPSON 1520 INK JET S189108 EPSON 1 5189108 $28.00 $ 28.00 §S189108 $27.11 $ 27.11
13 | 5822 Epson | CARTRIDGE, COLOR INK FOR EPSON 1520 'S191089 EPSON 1 S191089 $27.00 $ 27.00 §S191089 $27.11 $ 27.11
INK
14 || 5713 |HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP LASERJET 4L, 4ML |HP92274A 1 92274A $35.00 HP NO LONG ($25.00
HEWLETT- MAKES
ITEM DELETED FROM CONTRACT PACKARD PRODUCT
USE #500-
92274A
15 | 5723 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 850/970/990/995 51645A HEWLETT 16 51645A $29.50 $ 472.00 f51645A $30.06 $ 480.96
BLACK PACKARD
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

REJECTED/DELETED ITEM Supplies Hotline Corp Beyond Technology
Line TONER CONTRACT 7/1/2014-6/30/2015 Prime MPN Est Usage JVendor Stock | OEM Unit Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price
# # Price # Price
16 | 5745 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 4000 HP C4127X 1 C4127X $89.00 $ 89.00 JC4127X $115.78 $ 115.78
HEWLETT
PACKARD
17 | 5750 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 970/990/995 TRI- C6578AN 16 C6578AN $54.00 $ 864.00 JC6578AN $51.20 $ 819.20
COLOR HEWLETT-
PACKARD
18 | 5754 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 3200 C4092A HEWLETT 2 C4092A $55.00 $ 110.00 JC4092A $56.11 $ 112.22
PACKARD
19 | 5763 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 4100TN & 4100MFP | C8061X HEWLETT 11 C8061X $88.00 $ 968.00 JC8061X $115.78 $ 1,273.58
PACKARD
20 | 5791 HP FUSER KIT HP 4600 COLOR LASER JET C9725A HEWLETT 1 C9725A $138.00 $ 138.00 JC9725A $284.95 $ 284.95
PACKARD
21 | 5792 HP TRANSFER KIT HPLJ4600 & 4650DN Q3675A HEWLETT 1 JQ3675A $217.00 $ 217.00 JQ3675A $244.47 $ 244 .47
PRINTERS PACKARD
22 | 5794 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 4600/4650DN BLACK | C9720A HEWLETT 17 C9720A $139.00 $ 2,363.00 JC9720A $140.49 $ 2,388.33
PACKARD
23 | 5795 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 4600/4650DN CYAN | C9721A HEWLETT 12 C9721A $149.00 $ 1,788.00 JC9721A $201.78 $ 2,421.36
PACKARD
24 | 5796 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 4600/4650DN C9723A HEWLETT 14 C9723A $149.00 $ 2,086.00 JC9723A $201.78 $ 2,824.92
MAGENTA PACKARD
25 | 5797 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 4600/4650DN C9722A HEWLETT 11 C9722A $149.00 $ 1,639.00 JC9722A $201.78 $ 2,219.58
YELLOW PACKARD
26 | 5800 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 3330MFP C7115X HEWLETT 1 C7115X $53.00 $ 53.00 JC7115X $60.40 $ 60.40
PACKARD
27 | 5806 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 2605DN BLACK Q6000A HEWLETT 16 JQ6000A $59.00 $ 944.00 JQ6000A $64.43 $ 1,030.88
PACKARD
28 | 5807 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 2605DN CYAN Q6001A HEWLETT 11 JQ6001A $67.00 $ 737.00 JQ6001A $71.64 $ 788.04
PACKARD
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29 | 5808 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 2605DN YELLOW Q6002A HEWLETT 13 JQ6002A $67.00 $ 871.00 JQ6002A $71.64 $ 931.32
PACKARD
30 | 5809 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 2605DN MAGENTA | Q6003A HEWLETT 14 JQ6003A $67.00 $ 938.00 JQ6003A $71.64 $ 1,002.96
PACKARD
31 | 5852 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 2550N BLACK Q3960A HEWLETT 8 JQ3960A $59.00 $ 472.00 JQ3960A $67.32 $ 538.56
PACKARD
32 | 5853 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 2550N CYAN Q3961A HEWLETT 11 JQ3961A $68.00 $ 748.00 JQ3961A $81.18 $ 892.98
PACKARD
33 | 5854 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 2550N YELLOW Q3962A HEWLETT 11 JQ3962A $68.00 $ 748.00 JQ3962A $81.18 $ 892.98
PACKARD
34 | 5855 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 2550N MAGENTA Q3963A HEWLETT 11 JQ3963A $68.00 $ 748.00 JQ3963A $81.18 $ 892.98
PACKARD
35 | 5856 HP IMAGING DRUM HP 2550N PRINTER Q3964A HEWLETT 6 JQ3964A $158.00 $ 948.00 JQ3964A $192.33 $ 1,153.98
PACKARD
36 | 5857 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 4730X MFP BLACK | Q6460A HEWLETT 13 JQ6460A $121.00 $ 1,573.00 JQ6460A $114.36 $ 1,486.68
PACKARD
37 | 5858 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 4730X MFP CYAN Q6461A HEWLETT 3 JQ6461A $261.00 $ 783.00 JQ6461A $246.45 $ 739.35
PACKARD
38 | 5859 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 4730X MFP YELLOW | Q6462A HEWLETT 1 JQ6462A $261.00 $ 261.00 JQ6462A $246.45 $ 246.45
PACKARD
39 | 5860 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 4730X MFP Q6463A HEWLETT 1 JQ6463A $261.00 $ 261.00 JQ6463A $246.45 $ 246.45
MAGENTA PACKARD
40 | 5885 HP IMAGE TRANSFER KIT HP 4730 MFP Q7504A HEWLETT 1 JQ7504A $218.00 $ 218.00 JQ7504A $226.39 $ 226.39
PACKARD
41 | 5886 HP IMAGE FUSER KIT HP 4730 MFP 110V-Q7502A 1 JQ7502A $245.00 $ 245.00 JQ7502A $160.00 $ 160.00
HEWLETTPACKAR
D

Bid # 501022-2014




PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

REJECTED/DELETED ITEM Supplies Hotline Corp Beyond Technology
Line TONER CONTRACT 7/1/2014-6/30/2015 Prime MPN Est Usage JVendor Stock | OEM Unit Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price
# # Price # Price
42 | 5887 HP MAINTENANCE KIT HP 4250/4350 MFP Q5421A HEWLETT 1 JQ5421A $218.00 $ 218.00 gQ5421 $236.00 $ 236.00
PACKARD
43 | 5888 HP DOCUMENT FEEDER KIT HP LASERJET Q5997A HEWLETT 13 JQ5997A $68.00 $ 884.00 Q5997 $68.39 $ 889.07
4345 MFP PACKARD
44 | 5896 HP MAINTENANCE KIT HP 4345 MFP Q5998A HEWLETT 3 JQ5958A $217.00 $ 651.00 Q5998 $230.55 $ 691.65
PACKARD
45 | 5898 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP K550 BLACK C9385AN 21 C9385AN $18.40 $ 386.40 JC9385AN $17.46 $ 366.66
HEWLETT
PACKARD
46 | 5899 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP K550 CYAN C9386AN 1 C9386AN $13.50 $ 13.50 JC9386AN $12.57 $ 12.57
HEWLETT
PACKARD
47 | 5900 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP K550 MAGENTA C9387AN 6 C9387AN $13.50 $ 81.00 JC9387AN $12.57 $ 75.42
HEWLETT
PACKARD
48 | 5901 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP K550 YELLOW C9388AN 5 C9388AN $13.50 $ 67.50 JC9388AN $12.57 $ 62.85
HEWLETT
PACKARD
49 | 5903 HP MAINTENANCE KIT HP 4100TN C8057A HEWLETT 1 C8057A $189.00 $ 189.00 JC8057A $193.20 $ 193.20
PACKARD
50 | 5904 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 9050DN BLACK C8543X HEWLETT 1 C8543X $198.00 $ 198.00 JC8543X $217.45 $ 217.45
PACKARD
51 | 5905 HP MAINTENANCE KIT HP 9050DN PRINTER C9152A HEWLETT 1 C9152A $485.00 $ 485.00 JC9152A $500.46 $ 500.46
PACKARD
52 | 5906 |HP FUSER KIT HP 9050DN PRINTER C4155A HEWLETT 1 C4155A $57.00 HP NO LONG [$160.00
PACKARD MAKES
ITEM DELETED FROM CONTRACT PRODUCT
USE
PRODUCT
RG5-5750NC
53 | 9144 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP CP3505 BLACK Q6470A HEWLETT 2 JQ6470A $107.00 $ 214.00 JQ6470A $104.38 $ 208.76
PACKARD
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54 | 9146 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP CP3505 CYAN Q7581A HEWLETT 1 JQ7581A $132.00 $ 132.00 JQ7581A $147.66 $ 147.66
PACKARD
55 | 9147 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP CP3505 YELLOW Q7582A HEWLETT 1 JQ7582A $132.00 $ 132.00 JQ7582A $147.66 $ 147.66
PACKARD
56 | 9148 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 5550DTN BLACK C9730A HEWLETT 5 C9730A $170.00 $ 850.00 JC9730A $194.80 $ 974.00
PACKARD
57 | 9149 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 5550DTN CYAN C9731A HEWLETT 5 C9731A $264.00 $ 1,320.00 JC9731A $289.56 $ 1,447.80
PACKARD
58 | 9150 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 5550DTN YELLOW | C9732A HEWLETT 5 C9732A $264.00 $ 1,320.00 JC9732A $289.56 $ 1,447.80
PACKARD
59 | 9151 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 5550DTN MAGENTA | C9733A HEWLETT 5 C9733A $264.00 $ 1,320.00 JC9733A $289.56 $ 1,447.80
PACKARD
60 | 9166 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP CP3505 MAGENTA | Q7583A HEWLETT 1 JQ7583A $132.00 $ 132.00 JQ7583A $147.66 $ 147.66
PACKARD
61 | 9435 HP FUSER KIT HP4650DN PRINTER Q3676A HEWLETT 1 JQ3676A $247.00 $ 247.00 JQ3676A $251.32 $ 251.32
PACKARD
62 | 10153 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 3015DN BLACK CE255X HEWLETT 29 CE255X $166.50 $ 4,828.50 JCE255X $161.16 $ 4,673.64
PACKARD
63 | 10230 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP PRO 8500 BLACK C4906AN 14 C4906AN $30.00 $ 420.00 JC4906AN $32.61 $ 456.54
HEWLETT
PACKARD
64 | 10231 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP PRO 8500 CYAN C4907AN 15 C4907AN $19.95 $ 299.25 JC4907AN $21.73 $ 325.95
HEWLETT
PACKARD
65 | 10232 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP PRO 8500 MAGENTA C4908AN 16 C4908AN $19.95 $ 319.20 JC4908AN $21.73 $ 347.68
HEWLETT
PACKARD
66 | 10243 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP PRO 8500 YELLOW | C4909AN 15 C4909AN $19.95 $ 299.25 JC4909AN $21.73 $ 325.95
HEWLETT
PACKARD
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67 | 11306 Kyocera TONER, BLACK, KYOCERA FS1135MFP TK-1142 KYOCERA 28 TK-1142 $59.00 $ 1,652.00 JTK-1142 $62.68 $ 1,755.04
PRINTER MITA
68 | 5782 Troy TONER CARTRIDGE TROY MICR TONER 02-81081-001 1 J02-81081-001 | $289.00 $ 289.00 §02-81081-001 |$507.96 $ 507.96
SECURE TROY
69 | 5893 |Xerox [PRINT CARTRIDGE XEROX PE120I BLACK |013R00606 XEROX 5 JO013R00606 $87.00 $ 435.00 JO13R00606 $92.14 $ 460.70
70 | 9429 Xerox | PRINT CARTRIDGE XEROX 6180DN BLACK |113R00726 XEROX 45 113R00726 $188.00 $ 8,460.00 J113R00726 $171.02 $ 7,695.90
71 | 9430 |Xerox |[PRINT CARTRIDGE XEROX 6180DN CYAN | 113R00723 XEROX 18 113R00723 $188.00 $ 3,384.00 J113R00723 $188.07 $ 3,385.26
72 | 9431 Xerox |PRINT CARTRIDGE XEROX 6180DN 113R00724 XEROX 26 113R00724 $188.00 $ 4,888.00 §113R00724 $188.07 $ 4,889.82
MAGENTA
73 | 9432 | Xerox |[PRINT CARTRIDGE XEROX 6180DN 113R00725 XEROX 26 113R00725 $188.00 $ 4,888.00 §113R00725 $188.07 $ 4,889.82
YELLOW
74 | 9443 Xerox | PRINT CARTRIDGE XEROX 6360DN BLACK |106R01221 XEROX 4 106R01221 $154.00 $ 616.00 J106R01221 $153.98 $ 615.92
75 | 9444 Xerox |[PRINT CARTRIDGE XEROX 6360DN CYAN | 106R01218 XEROX 1 106R01218 $244.00 $ 244.00 §106R01218 $256.25 $ 256.25
76 | 9445 Xerox | PRINT CARTRIDGE XEROX 6360DN 106R01219 XEROX 8 106R01219 $244.00 $ 732.00 J106R01219 $256.25 $ 768.75
MAGENTA
77 | 9446 Xerox |PRINT CARTRIDGE XEROX 6360DN 106R01220 XEROX 1 106R01220 $244.00 $ 244.00 §106R01220 $256.25 $ 256.25
YELLOW
78 | 9595 Xerox |PRINT CARTRIDGE XEROX 3635 MFP/X 108R00795 XEROX 61 108R00795 $150.00 $ 9,150.00 J108R00795 $155.37 $ 9,477.57
BLACK
79 | 9596 |Xerox |[STAPLE CARTRIDGE XEROX PHASER3635 |108R00823 XEROX 4 108R00823 $38.75 $ 155.00 §108R00823 $40.17 $ 160.68
MFP/X
80 | 9630 Xerox (TRANSFER KIT XEROX PHASER 6360 108R00646 XEROX 2 108R00646 $75.00 $ 150.00 J108R00646 $79.77 $ 159.54
81 | 9631 [Xerox |IMAGING UNIT XEROX PHASER 6360 108R00645 XEROX 3 108R00645 $239.00 $ 717.00 §108R00645 $253.81 $ 761.43
82 | 9632 Xerox FUSER KIT XEROX PHASER 6360 115R00055 XEROX 1 115R00055 $154.00 $ 154.00 §115R00055 $162.30 $ 162.30
83 | 10200 [Xerox |FUSER 110V XEROX PHASER 3635MFP 126N00326 XEROX 1 126N00326 $235.00 $ 235.00 J126N00326 $334.53 $ 334.53
84 | 10201 Xerox MEA ROLLER PICKUP XEROX PHASER 022N02345 XEROX 1 J022N02345 $24.00 $ 24.00 J022N02345 $25.50 $ 25.50
3635MFP
85 | 10202 | Xerox |MEA RACK EXIT ROLLER XEROX 022N02344 XEROX 1 022N02344 $15.00 $ 15.00 §022N02344 $28.43 $ 28.43
PHASER3635MFP I I
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86 | 10203 | Xerox |MEA TRANSFER ROLLER XEROX PHASER [002N02788 XEROX 1 JO02N02788 $28.00 $ 28.00 JO02N02788 $32.64 $ 32.64
3635MFP
87 | 11530 (Xerox |CARTRIDGE,TONER,H/CAPACITY,CYAN,XE |106R1594 25 106R1594 $101.00 $ 2,525.00 J106R1594 $88.07 $ 2,201.75
R6505 XEROX
88 | 11531 Xerox |CARTRIDGE,TONER,HIGH 106R1596 25 106R1596 $101.00 $ 2,525.00 J106R1596 $88.07 $ 2,201.75
CAP,YELLOW,XER6505 XEROX
89 | 11532 Xerox |CARTRIDGE,TONER,H/CAPACITY,BLACK,X '106R1597 30 106R1597 $97.00 $ 2,910.00 J106R1597 $85.23 $ 2,556.90
ER6505 XEROX
90 | 11533 Xerox |CARTRIDGE, TONER,HIGH 106R1595 23 106R1595 $101.00 $ 2,323.00 J106R1595 $88.07 $ 2,025.61
CAP,MAGENTA,XER6505 XEROX
91 | 11915 Xerox |FUSER ASSEMBLY, XEROX 6180DN 675K92001 XEROX 10 J675K92001 $143.00 $ 1,430.00 J675K92001 $140.59 $ 1,405.90
PRINTER
92 | 11916 Xerox |TRANSFER UNIT, XEROX 6180DN PRINTER |675K47088 XEROX 10 675K47088 $139.00 $ 1,390.00 j675K47088 $140.59 $ 1,405.90
93 | 5787 Brother [ DRUM INTELLIFAX PPF-4750E FAX DR400 BROTHER 3 DR400 $108.00 $ 324.00 JDR400 $121.67 $ 365.01
94 | 5727 HP PRINT CARTRIDGE HP 4345MFP Q5945A HEWLETT 42 Q5945A $168.00 $ 7,056.00 | Q5945A $160.58 $ 6,744.36
PACKARD
95 | 9418 PitneyB PRINT CARTRIDGE P/BOWES DM100/200 793-5 PITNEY 8 793-5 $34.00 $ 272.00 § 793-5 $91.00 $ 728.00
owes RED BOWES
96 | 12153 Xerox |FUSER ASSEMBLY, XEROX 6505 PHASER | 604K64582 XEROX 5 604K64582 $89.00 $ 445.00 | 604K64582 $84.35 $ 421.75
WRKCTR
97 | 12209 Kyocera TONER, BLACK, KYOCERA FS-C2126MFP | TK-590K KYOCERA 10 TK590K $67.00 $ 670.00 f§ TK-592K $55.00 $ 550.00
98 | 12210 | Kyocera TONER, CYAN, KYOCERA FS-C2126MFP TK-590C 10 TK590C $69.00 $ 690.00 § TK-592C $64.21 $ 642.10
KYOCERA
99 | 12211 Kyocera TONER, MAGENTA, KYOCERA FS- TK-590M 10 TK590M $69.00 $ 690.00 § TK-592M $64.21 $ 642.10
C2126MFP KYOCERA
100 | 12212 |Kyocera TONER, YELLOW, KYOCERA FS-C2126MFP | TK-590Y KYOCERA 10 TK590Y $69.00 $ 690.00 § TK-592Y $64.21 $ 642.10
NO BID Global Gov/Ed Solutions $ 111,824.60 $ 114,886.37
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

Rasix Computer Center Office Pal Star Data OPG Co City Toner
$ 118,359.49 | $ 129,039.67 | $ 133,034.00| $ 111,234.13
Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor OEM Unit Total Price Vendor OEM Unit Total Price
# # Price Stock # |Price Stock # |Price Stock # Price
1 5788 IBRTTN460 $63.11 $ 1,135.98 $60.04 $ 1,080.72 $60.00 $ 1,080.00 §TN460 $75.84 $ 1,365.12
2 5815 JCNMO0454B003 |$117.18 $ 117.18 $70.00 $ 70.00 $139.00 $ 139.00 JGPR23M $124.27 $ 124.27
AA
3 5816 JCNMO0455B003 |$117.18 $ 117.18 $70.00 $ 70.00 $139.00 $ 139.00 JGPR23Y $124.27 $ 124.27
AA
4 5817 JCNM0452B003 | $50.05 $ 50.05 $40.00 $ 40.00 $60.00 $ 60.00 [GPR23BK |$59.96 $ 59.96
AA
5 10205 JCNMFM255330/$17.25 $ 17.25 $10.00 $ 10.00 $19.00 $ 19.00 §FM2553300 |$28.69 $ 28.69
J00 0
6 11094 JCNM2662B001 | $109.44 $ 3,830.40 $90.00 $ 3,150.00 $110.00 $ 3,850.00 JCRG118BK |$136.25 $ 4,768.75
7 11095 JCNM2660B001 | $106.27 $ 3,188.10 $95.00 $ 2,850.00 $110.00 $ 3,300.00 JCRG118M | $133.97 $ 4,019.10
8 11096 JCNM2661B001 | $106.27 $ 2,869.29 $95.00 $ 2,565.00 $110.00 $ 2,970.00 JCRG118C | $133.97 $ 3,617.19
9 11097 JCNM2659B001 | $106.27 $ 3,188.10 $95.00 $ 2,850.00 $110.00 $ 3,300.00 JCRG118Y | $133.97 $ 4,019.10
10 | 5789 JEPST007201 [$23.55 $ 753.60 $23.06 $ 737.92 $28.00 $ 896.00 §T007201 $26.09 $ 834.88
11 5790 JEPST009201 | $28.53 $ 28.53 $27.95 $ 27.95 $28.00 $ 28.00 §T009201 $31.75 $ 31.75
12 5821 JEPSS189108 |$26.82 $ 26.82 $26.27 $ 26.27 $17.00 $ 17.00 §S189108 $30.17 $ 30.17
13 | 5822 JEPSS191089 |$26.86 $ 26.86 $26.31 $ 26.31 $17.00 $ 17.00 §S191089 $28.92 $ 28.92
14 | 5713 JHEW92274A [$80.00 $3.00 $60.00 No Bid
15 | 5723 JHEW51645A [$29.06 $ 464.96 $27.34 $ 437.44 $31.00 $ 496.00 j51645A $37.85 $ 605.60
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Rasix Computer Center Office Pal Star Data OPG Co City Toner

$ 118,359.49 | $ 129,039.67 | $ 133,034.00 | $ 111,234.13
Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor OEM Unit Total Price Vendor OEM Unit Total Price
# # Price Stock # |Price Stock # |Price Stock # Price
16 5745 JHEWC4127X $99.00 $ 99.00 $95.00 $ 95.00 $127.00 $ 127.00 JC4127X $112.55 $ 112.55
17 | 5750 JHEWC6578AN |$53.33 $ 853.28 $50.84 $ 813.44 $53.00 $ 848.00 JC6578AN  |$65.28 $ 1,044.48
18 | 5754 JHEWC4092A | $49.00 $ 98.00 $20.00 $ 40.00 $62.00 $ 124.00 JC4092A $47.17 $ 94.34
19 | 5763 JHEWCB8061X |$99.00 $ 1,089.00 $95.00 $ 1,045.00 $127.00 $ 1,397.00 JC8061X $107.10 $ 1,178.10
20 | 5791 JHEWC9725A $333.44 $ 333.44 $150.00 $ 150.00 $410.00 $ 410.00 JC9725A $355.07 $ 355.07
21 | 5792 JHEWQ3675A |$306.51 $ 306.51 $180.00 $ 180.00 $212.00 $ 212.00 JQ3675A $245.70 $ 245.70
22 | 5794 JHEWC9720A $145.00 $ 2,465.00 $1,258.00 | $ 21,386.00 $157.00 $ 2,669.00 JC9720A $136.77 $ 2,325.09
23 | 5795 JHEWC9721A | $165.00 $1,980.00 $165.00 $ 1,980.00 $210.00 $ 2,520.00 JC9721A $167.05 $ 2,004.60
24 | 5796 JHEWC9723A $165.00 $2,310.00 $165.00 $ 2,310.00 $210.00 $ 2,940.00 JC9723A $167.05 $ 2,338.70
25 | 5797 JHEWC9722A | $165.00 $1,815.00 $160.00 $ 1,760.00 $210.00 $ 2,310.00 JC9722A $167.05 $ 1,837.55
26 | 5800 JHEWC7115X |$64.00 $ 64.00 $52.00 $ 52.00 $67.00 $ 67.00 JC7115X $167.05 $ 167.05
27 | 5806 JHEWQ6000A |$61.00 $ 976.00 $60.49 $ 967.84 $70.00 $ 1,120.00 JQ6000A $70.04 $ 1,120.64
28 | 5807 JHEWQ6001A |$66.00 $ 726.00 $66.49 $ 731.39 $74.00 $ 814.00 JQ6001A $73.55 $ 809.05

Bid # 501022-2014




PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

Rasix Computer Center Office Pal Star Data OPG Co City Toner

$ 118,359.49 | $ 129,039.67 | $ 133,034.00 | $ 111,234.13
Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor OEM Unit Total Price Vendor OEM Unit Total Price
# # Price Stock # |Price Stock # |Price Stock # Price
29 | 5808 JHEWQ6002A |$66.00 $ 858.00 $66.49 $ 864.37 $74.00 $ 962.00 JQ6002A $73.55 $ 956.15
30 | 5809 JHEWQ6003A |$66.00 $ 924.00 $66.49 $ 930.86 $74.00 $ 1,036.00 JQ6003A $73.55 $ 1,029.70
31 | 5852 JHEWQ3960A |$69.00 $ 552.00 $61.49 $ 491.92 $75.00 $ 600.00 JQ3960A $68.95 $ 551.60
32 | 5853 JHEWQ3961A |$81.00 $ 891.00 $74.24 $ 816.64 $98.00 $ 1,078.00 JQ3961A $79.85 $ 878.35
33 | 5854 JHEWQ3962A |$81.00 $ 891.00 $74.24 $ 816.64 $98.00 $ 1,078.00 JQ3962A $79.85 $ 878.35
34 | 5855 JHEWQ3963A |$81.00 $ 891.00 $74.24 $ 816.64 $98.00 $ 1,078.00 JQ3963A $79.85 $ 878.35
35 | 5856 JHEWQ3964A |$194.01 $ 1,164.06 $130.00 $ 780.00 $214.00 $ 1,284.00 JQ3964A $128.90 $ 773.40
36 | 5857 JHEWQ6460A |$120.33 $ 1,564.29 $118.00 $ 1,534.00 $130.00 $ 1,690.00 JQ6460A $125.87 $ 1,636.31
37 | 5858 JHEWQ6461A |$247.00 $ 741.00 $185.00 $ 555.00 $280.00 $ 840.00 JQ6461A $210.65 $ 631.95
38 | 5859 JHEWQ6462A |$247.00 $ 247.00 $185.00 $ 185.00 $280.00 $ 280.00 JQ6462A $210.65 $ 210.65
39 | 5860 JHEWQ6463A |$247.00 $ 247.00 $185.00 $ 185.00 $280.00 $ 280.00 JQ6463A $210.65 $ 210.65
40 | 5885 JHEWQ7504A |$283.89 $ 283.89 $200.00 $ 200.00 $292.00 $ 292.00 JQ7504A $339.86 $ 339.86
41 | 5886 JHEWQ7502A |$315.05 $ 315.05 $220.00 $ 220.00 $339.00 $ 339.00 JQ7502A $293.68 $ 293.68

Bid # 501022-2014
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

Rasix Computer Center Office Pal Star Data OPG Co City Toner
$ 118,359.49 | $ 129,039.67 | $ 133,034.00| $ 111,234.13
Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor OEM Unit Total Price Vendor OEM Unit Total Price
# # Price Stock # |Price Stock # |Price Stock # Price
42 5887 JHEWQ5421A |$288.24 $ 288.24 $180.00 $ 180.00 $319.00 $ 319.00 JQ5421A $338.39 $ 338.39
43 | 5888 JHEWQ5997A |$90.98 $ 1,182.74 $70.00 $ 910.00 $100.00 $ 1,300.00 §Q5997A $109.99 $ 1,429.87
44 | 5896 JHEWQ5998A | $305.04 $ 915.12 $180.00 $ 540.00 $324.00 $ 972.00 JQ5998A $319.99 $ 959.97
45 | 5898 JHEWC9385AN | $18.17 $ 381.57 $18.34 $ 385.14 $19.00 $ 399.00 JC9385AN $24.99 $ 524.79
46 | 5899 JHEWC9386AN | $13.09 $ 13.09 $13.22 $ 13.22 $15.00 $ 15.00 JC9386AN $16.99 $ 16.99
a7 5900 JHEWC9387AN | $13.09 $ 78.54 $13.22 $ 79.32 $15.00 $ 90.00 JC9387AN $16.99 $ 101.94
48 | 5901 JHEWC9388AN | $13.09 $ 65.45 $13.22 $ 66.10 $15.00 $ 75.00 JC9388AN $16.99 $ 84.95
49 | 5903 JHEWCB8057A | $314.86 $ 314.86 $180.00 $ 180.00 $390.00 $ 390.00 No Bid
50 | 5904 JHEWC8543X $234.00 $ 234.00 $235.00 $ 235.00 $233.00 $ 233.00 No Bid
51 5905 JHEWC9152A |$682.58 $ 682.58 $350.00 $ 350.00 $749.00 $ 749.00 JC9152A $799.99 $ 799.99
52 5906 JHEWCA4155A |$225.00 $3.00 $199.00 No Bid
53 | 9144 HEWQG6470A | $113.49 $ 226.98 $110.00 $ 220.00 $120.00 $ 240.00 No Bid

Bid # 501022-2014
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

Rasix Computer Center Office Pal Star Data OPG Co City Toner

$ 118,359.49 | $ 129,039.67 | $ 133,034.00 | $ 111,234.13
Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor OEM Unit Total Price Vendor OEM Unit Total Price
# # Price Stock # |Price Stock # |Price Stock # Price
54 | 9146 JHEWQ7581A $139.00 $ 139.00 $135.00 $ 135.00 $155.00 $ 155.00 JQ7581A $139.80 $ 139.80
55 | 9147 JHEWQ7582A |$139.00 $ 139.00 $135.00 $ 135.00 $155.00 $ 155.00 JQ7582A $139.80 $ 139.80
56 | 9148 JHEWQ9730A $205.00 $ 1,025.00 $200.00 $ 1,000.00 $215.00 $ 1,075.00 JC9730A $210.65 $ 1,053.25
57 | 9149 JHEWQ9731A |$285.00 $ 1,425.00 $275.00 $ 1,375.00 $297.00 $ 1,485.00 JC9731A $288.20 $ 1,441.00
58 | 9150 JHEWQ9732A $285.00 $ 1,425.00 $275.00 $ 1,375.00 $297.00 $ 1,485.00 JC9732A $288.20 $ 1,441.00
59 | 9151 JHEWQ9733A |$285.00 $ 1,425.00 $275.00 $ 1,375.00 $297.00 $ 1,485.00 JC9733A $288.20 $ 1,441.00
60 | 9166 JHEWQ7583A $139.00 $ 139.00 $135.00 $ 135.00 $155.00 $ 155.00 JQ7583A $139.80 $ 139.80
61 | 9435 JHEWQ3676A $333.44 $ 333.44 $200.00 $ 200.00 $369.00 $ 369.00 JQ3676A $311.72 $ 311.72
62 | 10153 JHEWCE255X |$175.23 $ 5,081.67 $169.00 $ 4,901.00 $185.00 $ 5,365.00 JCE255X $182.55 $ 5,293.95
63 | 10230 JHEWC4096A |$79.00 $ 1,106.00 $31.81 $ 445.34 $35.00 $ 490.00 JC4906AN | $38.99 $ 545.86
64 | 10231 JHEWC4907AN |$21.00 $ 315.00 $21.20 $ 318.00 $24.00 $ 360.00 JC4907AN | $27.99 $ 419.85
65 | 10232 JHEWC4908AN |$21.00 $ 336.00 $21.20 $ 339.20 $24.00 $ 384.00 JC4908AN | $27.99 $ 447.84
66 | 10243 JHEWC4909AN |$21.00 $ 315.00 $21.20 $ 318.00 $24.00 $ 360.00 JC4909AN | $27.99 $ 419.85

Bid # 501022-2014
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

Rasix Computer Center Office Pal Star Data OPG Co City Toner

$ 118,359.49 | $ 129,039.67 | $ 133,034.00 ] $ 111,234.13

Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor OEM Unit Total Price Vendor OEM Unit Total Price

# # Price Stock # |Price Stock # |Price Stock # Price

67 | 11306 JKYOTK1142 [$59.36 $ 1,662.08 $52.00 $ 1,456.00 $65.00 $ 1,820.00 JTK-1142 $69.04 1,933.12

68 | 5782 JTRS028108100 $493.45 $ 493.45 $200.00 $ 200.00 $475.00 $ 475.00 No Bid
1

69 | 5893 JXER013R0060 |$93.92 $ 469.60 $95.00 $ 475.00 $98.00 $ 490.00 JO13R00606 |$95.00 475.00
16

70 | 9429 PIXER113R0072 |$202.36 $ 9,106.20 $185.00 $ 8,325.00 $202.00 $ 9,090.00 §113R00726 |$159.00 7,155.00
16

71 | 9430 §XER113R0072 |$220.77 $ 3,973.86 $199.00 $ 3,582.00 $220.00 $ 3,960.00 J113R00723 |$164.00 2,952.00
3

72 | 9431 PXER113R0072 |$220.77 $ 5,740.02 $199.00 $ 5,174.00 $220.00 $ 5,720.00 §113R00724 | $164.00 4,264.00
4

73 | 9432 §XER113R0072 |$220.77 $ 5,740.02 $199.00 $ 5,174.00 $220.00 $ 5,720.00 J113R00725 |$164.00 4,264.00
5

74 | 9443 IXER106R0122 |$182.02 $ 728.08 $160.00 $ 640.00 $185.00 $ 740.00 §106R01221 $143.00 572.00
1

75 | 9444 §XER106R0121 |$302.84 $ 302.84 $210.00 $ 210.00 $305.00 $ 305.00 §106R01218 $199.00 199.00
18

76 | 9445 IXER106R0121 |$302.84 $ 908.52 $210.00 $ 630.00 $305.00 $ 915.00 §106R01219 $199.00 597.00
9

77 | 9446 §XER106R0122 |$302.84 $ 302.84 $210.00 $ 210.00 $305.00 $ 305.00 §106R01220 $199.00 199.00
| (0]

78 | 9595 IXER108R0079 |$113.11 $ 6,899.71 $152.00 $ 9,272.00 $160.00 $ 9,760.00 §108R00795 | $149.00 9,089.00
5

79 | 9596 JXER108R0082 |$40.58 $ 162.32 $40.00 $ 160.00 $48.00 $ 192.00 J108R00823 |$40.00 160.00
3

80 | 9630 JXER108R0064 |$73.97 $ 147.94 $70.00 $ 140.00 $80.00 $ 160.00 J108R00646 | $62.00 124.00
16

81 | 9631 JXER108R0064 |$251.57 $ 754.71 $220.00 $ 660.00 $265.00 $ 795.00 §108R00645 | $254.00 762.00
5

82 | 9632 JXER115R0005 |$151.24 $ 151.24 $140.00 $ 140.00 $165.00 $ 165.00 §115R00055 |$139.00 139.00
5

83 | 10200 IXER126N0032 |$275.00 $ 275.00 $150.00 $ 150.00 $279.00 $ 279.00 No Bid
16

84 | 10201 IXER022N0234 |$30.00 $ 30.00 $20.00 $ 20.00 $40.00 $ 40.00 No Bid
5

85 | 10202 IXER022N0234 |$30.00 $ 30.00 $10.00 $ 10.00 $39.00 $ 39.00 No Bid
4

Bid # 501022-2014
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

Rasix Computer Center Office Pal Star Data OPG Co City Toner
$ 118,359.49 | $ 129,039.67 | $ 133,034.00| $ 111,234.13
Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor OEM Unit Total Price Vendor OEM Unit Total Price
# # Price Stock # |Price Stock # |Price Stock # Price
86 | 10203 XER002N0278 | $65.00 $ 65.00 $10.00 $ 10.00 $79.00 $ 79.00 No Bid
18
87 | 11530 IXER106R0159 |$101.43 $ 2,535.75 $95.00 $ 2,375.00 $108.00 $ 2,700.00 J106R01594 |$99.00 $ 2,475.00
4
88 | 11531 IXER106R0159 '$101.43 $ 2,535.75 $95.00 $ 2,375.00 $108.00 $ 2,700.00 §106R01596 |$99.00 $ 2,475.00
16
89 | 11532 XER106R0159 | $98.16 $ 2,944.80 $92.00 $ 2,760.00 $108.00 $ 3,240.00 J106R01597 |$97.00 $ 2,910.00
7
90 | 11533 XER106R0159 $101.43 $ 2,332.89 $95.00 $ 2,185.00 $108.00 $ 2,484.00 §106R01595 |$99.00 $ 2,277.00
5
91 | 11915 IXER675K9200 | $150.00 $ 1,500.00 $160.00 $ 1,600.00 $279.00 $ 2,790.00 §675K92001 | $120.00 $ 1,200.00
2
92 | 11916 IXER675K4708 |$141.75 $ 1,417.50 $136.00 $ 1,360.00 $399.00 $ 3,990.00 No Bid
8
93 | 5787 IBRTDR4OO $121.09 $ 363.27 $100.00 $ 300.00 $119.00 $ 357.00 §DR400 $134.47 $ 403.41
94 | 5727 § HEWQ5945A $170.00 $ 7,140.00 $169.00 $ 7,098.00 $188.00 $ 7,896.00 § Q5945A $156.15 $ 6,558.30
95 | 9418 J IVR7935 $30.00 $ 240.00 $30.00 $ 240.00 $89.00 $ 712.00 No Bid
96 | 12153 $90.00 $ 450.00 $82.00 $ 410.00 $277.00 $ 1,385.00 No Bid
XER604K6458
2
97 | 12209 § KYOTK592K |$71.00 $ 710.00 $60.00 $ 600.00 $73.00 $ 730.00 No Bid
98 | 12210  KYOTK592C |$72.00 $ 720.00 $68.00 $ 680.00 $73.00 $ 730.00 No Bid
99 | 12211 § KYOTK592M |$72.00 $ 720.00 $68.00 $ 680.00 $73.00 $ 730.00 No Bid
100 | 12212 f KYOTK592Y |$72.00 $ 720.00 $68.00 $ 680.00 $73.00 $ 730.00 No Bid
NO BII $ 118,359.49 $ 129,039.67 $ 133,034.00 $ 111,234.13

Bid # 501022-2014
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

Frank Parsons Photikon Tree House Inc. CNI Office Supplies
$ 139,890.24 | $ 119,300.92 | $ 120,747.75| $ 116,925.99
Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor OEM Unit | Total Price
# # Price # Price # Price Stock # Price
1 5788 IBRTTN460 $65.73 $ 1,183.14 JTN460 $62.26 $ 1,120.68 JTN460 $61.30 $ 1,103.40 JTN460 $62.39 $ 1,123.02
2 5815 JCNM0454B003$120.59 $ 120.59 J0454B003AA $95.84 $ 95.84 J0454B003AA $118.20 $ 118.20 J0454B003AA |$111.65 $ 111.65
3 5816 JCNMO0455B003$120.59 $ 120.59 J0455B003AA | $95.22 $ 95.22 J0455B003AA 1 $118.20 $ 118.20 J0455B003AA |$111.65 $ 111.65
4 5817 JCNMGRP23 | $60.92 $ 60.92 JO452B003AA | $40.62 $ 40.62 J0452B003AA [$50.80 $ 50.80 JO452B003AA [$46.13 $ 46.13
5 10205 fICNMFM25533 [$17.14 $ 17.14 §FM2-5533-000 | $19.29 $ 19.29 JFM2-5533-000 | $16.60 $ 16.60 JFM2-5533- | $22.06 $ 22.06
Jooo 000 CANON
6 11094 JICNMCRTDG11|$144.81 $ 5,068.35 BLK- $106.36 $ 3,722.60 §2662B001 $107.40 $ 3,759.00 §2662B001 $101.19 $ 3,541.65
18BK LBP7200CDN
7 11095 JCNMCRTDG11$129.89 $ 3,896.70 JMAGN- $103.29 $ 3,098.70 §2660B001 $104.25 $ 3,127.50 § 2660B001 | $100.07 $ 3,002.10
IBMA LBP7200CDN
8 11096 JCNMCRTDG11|$129.89 $ 3,507.03 JCYAN- $103.29 $ 2,788.83 §2661B001 $104.25 $ 2,814.75 §2661B001 $100.07 $ 2,701.89
j18CyY JLBP7200CDN
9 11097 JICNMCRTDG11$129.89 $ 3,896.70 gYLW- $103.29 $ 3,098.70 §2659B001 $104.25 $ 3,127.50 §2659B001 $100.07 $ 3,002.10
1sYw JLBP7200CDN
10 | 5789 JEPST007201 [$27.07 $ 866.24 §T007201 $23.40 $ 748.80 JT007201 $22.95 $ 734.40 §T007201 $23.31 $ 745.92
11 5790 JEPST009201 |$32.33 $ 32.33 JT009201 $28.26 $ 28.26 JT009201 $27.75 $ 27.75 JT009201 $28.16 $ 28.16
12 5821 JEPSS189108 |$29.38 $ 29.38 S189108 $26.67 $ 26.67 §S189108 $26.90 $ 26.90 §S189108 $26.58 $ 26.58
13 | 5822 JEPSS191089 | $28.96 $ 28.96 S191089 $25.24 $ 25.24 §S191089 $26.90 $ 26.90 §S191089 $26.58 $ 26.58
14 | 5713 J92274ARMPC |$50.13 Item is Discontinued discontinued DISCONTIN
discontinued. by HP - no UED
See longer
Exceptions available
Document
attached.
15 | 5723 JHEW51645A $30.83 $ 493.28 |51645A $29.81 $ 476.96 J51645A $29.10 $ 465.60 J51645A $29.19 $ 467.04

Bid # 501022-2014
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

Frank Parsons Photikon Tree House Inc. CNI Office Supplies

$ 139,890.24 1 $ 119,300.92 1 $ 120,747.75 ] $ 116,925.99
Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor OEM Unit | Total Price
# # Price # Price # Price Stock # Price
16 5745 JHEWC4127X | $133.56 $ 133.56 JHP C4127X $129.10 $ 129.10 jC4127X $118.00 $ 118.00 JC4127X $100.00 $ 100.00
17 5750 JHEWC6578AN |$56.59 $ 905.44 JC6578AN $54.69 $ 875.04 JC6578AN $53.35 $ 853.60 JC6578AN $53.57 $ 857.12
18 | 5754 JHEWC4092A | $64.73 $ 129.46 JC4092A $62.57 $ 125.14 JC4092A $61.05 $ 122.10 JC4092A $50.00 $ 100.00
19 | 5763 JHEWCB8061X $133.56 $ 1,469.16 JC8061X $129.10 $ 1,420.10 JC8061X $123.00 $ 1,353.00 JC8061X $120.22 $ 1,322.42
20 | 5791 JHEWC9725A $333.14 $ 333.14 JC9725A $322.04 $ 322.04 JC9725A $289.90 $ 289.90 JC9725A $305.34 $ 305.34
21 | 5792 JHEWQ3675A $306.23 $ 306.23 JQ3675A $303.64 $ 303.64 JQ3675A $260.00 $ 260.00 JQ3675A $264.91 $ 264.91
22 | 5794 JHEWC9720A $162.07 $ 2,755.19 JC9720A $156.66 $ 2,663.22 JC9720A $152.80 $ 2,597.60 JC9720A $145.90 $ 2,480.30
23 | 5795 JHEWC9721A $219.59 $ 2,635.08 JC9721A $212.27 $ 2,547.24 JC9721A $207.00 $ 2,484.00 JC9721A $197.67 $ 2,372.04
24 | 5796 JHEWC9723A $219.59 $ 3,074.26 JC9723A $212.27 $ 2,971.78 JC9723A $207.00 $ 2,898.00 JC9723A $197.67 $ 2,767.38
25 | 5797 JHEWC9722A $219.59 $ 2,415.49 JC9722A $212.27 $ 2,334.97 JC9722A $207.00 $ 2,277.00 JC9722A $197.67 $ 2,174.37
26 5800 JHEWC7115X |$69.67 $ 69.67 JC7115X $67.35 $ 67.35 JC7115X $65.70 $ 65.70 JC7115X $65.34 $ 65.34
27 | 5806 JHEWQ6000A |$68.83 $ 1,101.28 JQ6000A $66.53 $ 1,064.48 JQ6000A $60.70 $ 971.20 JQ6000A $61.63 $ 986.08
28 | 5807 JHEWQG6001A [$75.13 $ 826.43 JQ6001A $72.62 $ 798.82 JQ6001A $69.00 $ 759.00 JQ6001A $67.27 $ 739.97

Bid # 501022-2014
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

Frank Parsons Photikon Tree House Inc. CNI Office Supplies
$ 139,890.24 1 $ 119,300.92 1 $ 120,747.75 ] $ 116,925.99
Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor OEM Unit | Total Price
# # Price # Price # Price Stock # Price
29 | 5808 JHEWQ6002A [$75.13 $ 976.69 JQ6002A $72.62 $ 944.06 JQ6002A $69.00 $ 897.00 JQ6002A $67.27 $ 874.51
30 | 5809 JHEWQ6003A | $75.13 $ 1,051.82 JQ6003A $72.62 $ 1,016.68 JQ6003A $69.00 $ 966.00 JQ6003A $67.27 $ 941.78
31 | 5852 JHEWQ3960A |$75.13 $ 601.04 JQ3960A $72.62 $ 580.96 JQ3960A $70.85 $ 566.80 JQ3960A $70.46 $ 563.68
32 | 5853 JHEWQ3961A $90.63 $ 996.93 JQ3961A $87.60 $ 963.60 JQ3961A $85.45 $ 939.95 JQ3961A $84.99 $ 934.89
33 | 5854 JHEWQ3962A | $90.63 $ 996.93 JQ3962A $87.60 $ 963.60 JQ3962A $85.45 $ 939.95 JQ3962A $84.99 $ 934.89
34 | 5855 JHEWQ3963A | $90.63 $ 996.93 JQ3963A $87.60 $ 963.60 JQ3963A $85.45 $ 939.95 JQ3963A $84.99 $ 934.89
35 | 5856 JHEWQ3964A |$193.84 $ 1,163.04 JQ3964A $187.38 $ 1,124.28 JQ3964A $190.45 $ 1,142.70 JQ3964A $215.67 $ 1,294.02
36 | 5857 JHEWQ6460A |$127.66 $ 1,659.58 JQ6460A $123.40 $ 1,604.20 JQ6460A $120.40 $ 1,565.20 JQ6460A $119.73 $ 1,556.49
37 | 5858 JHEWQ6461A |$275.12 $ 825.36 JQ6461A $265.94 $ 797.82 JQ6461A $259.40 $ 778.20 JQ6461A $258.02 $ 774.06
38 | 5859 JHEWQ6462A |$275.12 $ 275.12 JQ6462A $265.94 $ 265.94 JQ6462A $259.40 $ 259.40 JQ6462A $258.02 $ 258.02
39 | 5860 JHEWQ6463A |$275.12 $ 275.12 JQ6463A $265.94 $ 265.94 JQ6463A $259.40 $ 259.40 JQ6463A $258.02 $ 258.02
40 5885 JHEWQ7504A |$283.64 $ 283.64 JQ7504A $274.17 $ 274.17 JQ7504A $231.00 $ 231.00 gQ7504A $204.40 $ 204.40
41 | 5886 JHEWQ7502A |$314.78 $ 314.78 J110V-Q7502A |$304.28 $ 304.28 JQ7502A $255.00 $ 255.00 JQ7502A $284.73 $ 284.73
Bid # 501022-2014 17



PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

Frank Parsons Photikon Tree House Inc. CNI Office Supplies
$ 139,890.24 | $ 119,300.92 | $ 120,747.75| $ 116,925.99

Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor OEM Unit | Total Price
# # Price # Price # Price Stock # Price
42 5887 JHEWQ5421A |$154.96 $ 154.96 JQ5421A $278.37 $ 278.37 JQ5421A $239.00 $ 239.00 §Q5421A $273.53 $ 273.53
43 | 5888 JHEWQ5997A $90.90 $ 1,181.70 JQ5997A $87.87 $ 1,142.31 JQ5997A $68.15 $ 885.95 JQ5997A $87.12 $ 1,132.56
44 | 5896 HEWQ5998A $304.78 $ 914.34 JQ5998A $294.61 $ 883.83 JQ5998A $240.00 $ 720.00 §Q5998A $261.54 $ 784.62
45 | 5898 JHEWC9385AN | $19.27 $ 404.67 JC9385AN $18.63 $ 391.23 JC9385AN $18.20 $ 382.20 JC9385AN $18.25 $ 383.25
46 | 5899 JHEWC9386AN $13.88 $ 13.88 JC9386AN $13.43 $ 13.43 JC9386AN $13.15 $ 13.15 JC9386AN $13.15 $ 13.15
a7 5900 JHEWC9387AN |$13.88 $ 83.28 JC9387AN $13.43 $ 80.58 JC9387AN $13.15 $ 78.90 JC9387AN $13.15 $ 78.90
48 | 5901 JHEWC9388AN $13.88 $ 69.40 JC9388AN $13.43 $ 67.15 JC9388AN $13.15 $ 65.75 JC9388AN $13.15 $ 65.75
49 | 5903 HEWCB8057A $314.58 $ 314.58 JC8057A $304.09 $ 304.09 JC8057A $299.00 $ 299.00 JC8057A $248.91 $ 248.91
50 | 5904 JHEWC8543X $248.38 $ 248.38 JC8543X $242.49 $ 242.49 JC8543X $236.50 $ 236.50 JC8543X $225.81 $ 225.81
51 5905 JHEWC9152A |$809.16 $ 809.16 JC9152A $659.23 $ 659.23 JC9152A $500.00 $ 500.00 JC9152A $547.06 $ 547.06
52 5906 JHEWC9152A |$472.62 Item is discontinued DISCONTIN

discontinued. | Discontinued by HP - no UED

See longer

Exceptions available

Document

attached.
53 | 9144 QHEWQG6470A $120.40 $ 240.80 JQ6470A $116.39 $ 232.78 JQ6470A $113.55 $ 227.10 JQ6470A $112.92 $ 225.84

Bid # 501022-2014
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

Frank Parsons Photikon Tree House Inc. CNI Office Supplies

$ 139,890.24 1 $ 119,300.92 1 $ 120,747.75 ] $ 116,925.99
Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor OEM Unit | Total Price
# # Price # Price # Price Stock # Price
54 9146 JHEW7581A $154.86 $ 154.86 JQ7581A $149.69 $ 149.69 JQ7581A $146.10 $ 146.10 JQ7581A $145.24 $ 145.24
55 9147 JHEWQ7582A |$154.86 $ 154.86 JQ7582A $149.69 $ 149.69 JQ7582A $146.10 $ 146.10 JQ7582A $145.24 $ 145.24
56 | 9148 JHEWC9730A $224.71 $ 1,123.55 JC9730A $217.21 $ 1,086.05 JC9730A $211.90 $ 1,059.50 JC9730A $202.28 $ 1,011.40
57 9149 JHEWC9731A |$315.12 $ 1,575.60 JC9731A $304.61 $ 1,523.05 JC9731A $297.10 $ 1,485.50 JC9731A $283.66 $ 1,418.30
58 | 9150 JHEWC9732A $315.12 $ 1,575.60 JC9732A $304.61 $ 1,523.05 JC9732A $297.10 $ 1,485.50 JC9732A $283.66 $ 1,418.30
59 | 9151 JHEWC9733A |$315.12 $ 1,575.60 JC9733A $304.61 $ 1,523.05 JC9733A $297.10 $ 1,485.50 JC9733A $283.66 $ 1,418.30
60 9166 JHEWQ7583A |$154.86 $ 154.86 JQ7583A $149.69 $ 149.69 JQ7583A $146.10 $ 146.10 JQ7583A $145.24 $ 145.24
61 | 9435 JHEWQ3676A $333.14 $ 333.14 JQ3676A $322.04 $ 322.04 JQ3676A $260.00 $ 260.00 JQ3676A $286.87 $ 286.87
62 | 10153 JHEWCE255X |$185.91 $ 5,391.39 JCE255X $179.70 $ 5,211.30 JCE255X $175.25 $ 5,082.25 JCE255X $174.35 $ 5,056.15
63 | 10230 JHEWC4906AN |$33.43 $ 468.02 JC4906AN $32.32 $ 452.48 JC4906AN $31.55 $ 441.70 JC4906AN $31.65 $ 443.10
64 | 10231 JHEWC4907AN | $33.43 $ 501.45 JC4907AN $21.54 $ 323.10 JC4907AN $21.05 $ 315.75 JC4907AN $21.09 $ 316.35
65 | 10232 JHEWC4908AN |$22.28 $ 356.48 JC4908AN $21.54 $ 344.64 JC4908AN $21.05 $ 336.80 JC4908AN $21.09 $ 337.44
66 | 10243 JHEWC4909AN |$22.28 $ 334.20 JC4909AN $21.54 $ 323.10 JC4909AN $21.05 $ 315.75 JC4909AN $21.09 $ 316.35

Bid # 501022-2014
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

Frank Parsons Photikon Tree House Inc. CNI Office Supplies
$ 139,890.24 | $ 119,300.92 | $ 120,747.75 | $ 116,925.99
Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor OEM Unit | Total Price
# # Price # Price # Price Stock # Price
67 | 11306 JKYO1TO2MNO [$107.50 $ 3,010.00 JTK-1142 $60.40 $ 1,691.20 JTK-1142 $61.25 $ 1,715.00 JTK-1142 $60.67 $ 1,698.76
uso
68 | 5782 JTSR02810810 |[$555.29 $ 555.29 J02-81081-001 |$471.82 $ 471.82 J02-81081-001 |$472.30 $ 472.30 J02-81081-  |$493.08 $ 493.08
jo1 001
69 | 5893 JXER013R0060 [$119.65 $ 598.25 J013R00606 $92.54 $ 462.70 J013R00606 $94.10 $ 470.50 JO13R00606 |$87.53 $ 437.65
16
70 | 9429 FIXER0113R007 [$237.69 $ 10,696.05 J113R00726 $198.63 $ 8,938.35 J113R00726 $202.45 $ 9,110.25 J113R00726 |$215.11 $ 9,679.95
26
71 | 9430 JXER113R0072 [$262.26 $ 4,720.68 J113R00723 $217.95 $ 3,923.10 J113R00723 $222.00 $ 3,996.00 J113R00723 |$215.11 $ 3,871.98
3
72 | 9431 IXER113R0072 [$262.26 $ 6,818.76 J113R00724 $217.95 $ 5,666.70 J113R00724 $222.00 $ 5,772.00 J113R00724 |$215.11 $ 5,592.86
4
73 | 9432 IXER113R0072 [$262.26 $ 6,818.76 J113R00725 $217.95 $ 5,666.70 J113R00725 $222.00 $ 5,772.00 J113R00725 |$215.11 $ 5,592.86
5
74 | 9443 IXER106R0122 [$216.21 $ 864.84 J106R01221 $179.21 $ 716.84 J106R01221 $182.15 $ 728.60 J106R01221 $160.22 $ 640.88
1
75 | 9444 IXER106R0121 [$354.85 $ 354.85 J106R01218 $299.71 $ 299.71 J106R01218 $299.00 $ 299.00 J106R01218 | $231.49 $ 231.49
18
76 | 9445 IXER106R0121 [$354.85 $ 1,064.55 J106R01219 $299.71 $ 899.13 J106R01219 $299.00 $ 897.00 J106R01219 |$235.88 $ 707.64
9
77 | 9446 JXER106R0122 [$354.85 $ 354.85 J106R01220 $299.71 $ 299.71 J106R01220 $299.00 $ 299.00 J106R01220 |$231.49 $ 231.49
10
78 | 9595 IXER108R0079 [$191.32 $ 11,670.52 J108R00795 $153.00 $ 9,333.00 J108R00795 $156.45 $ 9,543.45 J108R00795 |$156.71 $ 9,559.31
5
79 | 9596 JXER108R0082 |$43.59 $ 174.36 §108R00823 $38.72 $ 154.88 J108R00823 $39.35 $ 157.40 J108R00823 |$41.54 $ 166.16
3
80 | 9630 JXER108R0064  $96.93 $ 193.86 J108R00646 $72.46 $ 144.92 J108R0O0646 $74.00 $ 148.00 §108R00646 | $71.21 $ 142.42
16
81 | 9631 JXER108R0064  $319.81 $ 959.43 J108R00645 $245.01 $ 735.03 J108R00645 $251.00 $ 753.00 J108R00645 | $262.58 $ 787.74
5
82 | 9632 JXER115R0005 $191.11 $ 191.11 J115R00055 $146.20 $ 146.20 J115R00055 $145.00 $ 145.00 §115R00055 |$155.61 $ 155.61
5
83 | 10200 $196.56 $ 196.56 §126N00326 $158.80 $ 158.80 DISCONTIN $ =
UED
84 | 10201 $28.08 $ 28.08 J022N02345 TBD DISCONTIN $ =
UED
85 | 10202 $39.52 $ 39.52 J022N02344 TBD DISCONTIN $ =
I UED
Bid # 501022-2014 20



PA Turnpike Commission Toner Supply Bid Tabulation Due 6/2/2014

Frank Parsons Photikon Tree House Inc. CNI Office Supplies
$ 139,890.24 | $ 119,300.92 | $ 120,747.75| $ 116,925.99
Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor OEM Unit | Total Price
# # Price # Price # Price Stock # Price
86 | 10203 $41.60 $ 41.60 JO02N02788 TBD DISCONTIN $ -
UED
87 | 11530 JXER106R1594 |$108.05 $ 2,701.25 J106R1594 $100.06 $ 2,501.50 §106R01594 $101.50 $ 2,537.50 J106R01594 | $100.88 $ 2,522.00
88 | 11531 IXER106R1596 $108.05 $ 2,701.25 J106R1596 $100.06 $ 2,501.50 §106R01596 $101.50 $ 2,537.50 §J106R01596 |$100.88 $ 2,522.00
89 | 11532 IXER106R1597 $152.29 $ 4,568.70 J106R1597 $96.84 $ 2,905.20 §106R01597 $95.25 $ 2,857.50 J106R01597 | $94.20 $ 2,826.00
90 | 11533 IXER106R1595 $108.05 $ 2,485.15 J106R1595 $100.06 $ 2,301.38 §106R01595 $101.50 $ 2,334.50 J106R01595 |$100.88 $ 2,320.24
91 | 11915 IXER675K9200 |$149.02 $ 1,490.20 J675K92001 TBD 1675K92001 $143.00 $ 1,430.00 §675K92001 |$149.01 $ 1,490.10
1
92 | 11916 §XER675K4708 1$143.12 $ 1,431.20 §675K47088 TBD 675K47088 $135.00 $ 1,350.00 J675K47088 | $142.67 $ 1,426.70
8
93 | 5787 IBRTTDR4OO $126.38 $ 379.14 DR400 $120.41 $ 361.23 JDR400 $117.65 $ 352.95 DR400 $119.70 $ 359.10
94 | 5727 §HEWQ5945A $185.24 $ 7,780.08 § Q5945A $178.17 $ 7,483.14 § Q5945A $174.65 $ 7,335.30 § Q5945A $173.74 $ 7,297.08
95 | 9418 [ Compatible $7.44 $ 59.52 § 793-5 PITNEY | TBD $ =
Only 7935 CPT IBOWES DISCONTIN
UED
96 | 12153 $100.31 $ 501.55  604K64582 $78.40 $ 392.00 | 604K64582 $81.15 $ 405.75 | 604K64582 | $85.81 $ 429.05
XER604K6458
2
97 | 12209 § TK-592K $60.32 $ 603.20 § TK-590K $66.33 $ 663.30 | TK-592K $65.85 $ 658.50 $ =
IKYOCERA DISCONTIN
UED
98 | 12210 § TK-592C $60.32 $ 603.20 § TK-590C $67.60 $ 676.00 | TK-590C $66.95 $ 669.50 $ =
IKYOCERA DISCONTIN
UED
99 | 12211 § TK-592M $60.32 $ 603.20 § TK-590M $67.60 $ 676.00 § TK-590M $66.95 $ 669.50 $ =
IKYOCERA DISCONTIN
UED
100 | 12212 | TK-592Y $60.32 $ 603.20 § TK-590Y $67.60 $ 676.00 f TK-590Y $66.95 $ 669.50 $ =
KYOCERA DISCONTIN
UED
NO BII $ 139,890.24 $ 119,300.92 $ 120,747.75 $ 116,925.99
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

PriStore Services Supply Saver Paper Systems Carolina Imaging Products
$ 117,217.95] $ 129,160.00 | $ 241,033.86 No Bid Proposal Document Received
Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price
# # Price # Price # Price # Price
1 5788 JTN460 $62.55 $ 1,125.90 §TN460 $72.00 $ 1,296.00 BRTTN460 $128.29 $ 2,309.22 TN460 $ =
2 5815 J0454BO03AA |$111.93 $ 111.93 J0454B0O03AA | $118.00 $ 118.00 JCNM0454b003 | $224.08 $ 224.08 JO454B003AA | $64.90 $ 64.90
AA CANON
3 5816 JO455B003AA |$111.93 $ 111.93 J0455B003AA | $118.00 $ 118.00 JCNMO0455B003 ' $224.08 $ 224.08 JO455B003AA $109.50 $ 109.50
AA CANON
4 5817 J0452BO03AA |$46.25 $ 46.25 J0452B003AA | $59.00 $ 59.00 JCNM0452B003 $99.00 $ 99.00 JO452B003AA | $109.50 $ 109.50
AA CANON
5 10205 JFM2-5533-000 [$22.12 $ 22.12 JFM2-5533 $23.00 $ 23.00 JCNMFM25533 [$42.28 $ 42.28 JFM2-5533-000 |$58.95 $ 58.95
CANON jooo CANON
6 11094 j2662B001 $101.44 $ 3,550.40 J2662B0O01AA | $120.00 $ 4,200.00 JCNM2662B001 | $208.24 $ 7,288.40 BLK- $28.49 $ 997.15
AA LBP7200CDN
CANON
7 11095 | 2660B001 $100.32 $ 3,009.60 J2660BO01AA | $120.00 $ 3,600.00 JCNM2660B001 | $202.65 $ 6,079.50 gMAGN- $112.40 $ 3,372.00
AA LBP7200CDN
CANON
8 11096 j2661B001 $100.32 $ 2,708.64 J2661BO01AA | $120.00 $ 3,240.00 JCNM2661B001 | $202.65 $ 5,471.55 JCYAN- $109.95 $ 2,968.65
AA JLBP7200CDN
CANON
9 11097 j2659B001 $100.32 $ 3,009.60 J2659B001AA | $120.00 $ 3,600.00 JCNM2659B001 | $202.65 $ 6,079.50 gYLW- $109.95 $ 3,298.50
AA JLBP7200CDN
CANON
10 | 5789 §T007201 $23.37 $ 747.84 §T007201 $25.00 $ 800.00 jT007201 $54.94 $ 1,758.08 JT007201 $109.95 $ 3,518.40
EPSON
11 | 5790 §T009201 $28.23 $ 28.23 §T009201 $31.00 $ 31.00 JT009201 $63.55 $ 63.55 §T009201 $24.50 $ 24.50
EPSON
12 5821 §S189108 $26.65 $ 26.65 S189108 $30.00 $ 30.00 §S189108 $60.80 $ 60.80 §S189108 $29.50 $ 29.50
EPSON
13 | 5822 §S191089 $26.65 $ 26.65 §S191089 $30.00 $ 30.00 §S191089 $60.62 $ 60.62 §S191089 $23.40 $ 23.40
EPSON
14 | 5713 NO BID NO BID 92274A $69.00 JHT274A $66.66 HP92274A $46.50
HEWLETT-
PACKARD
15 | 5723 J51645A $29.26 $ 468.16 J51645A $33.00 $ 528.00 JHTBLACK $70.23 $ 1,123.68 J51645A $30.75 $ 492.00
HEWLETT
PACKARD
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PA Turnpike Commission Toner Supply Bid Tabulation Due 6/2/2014

PriStore Services Supply Saver Paper Systems Carolina Imaging Products

$ 117,21795] $ 129,160.00 | $ 241,033.86 No Bid Proposal Document Received

Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price
# # Price # Price # Price # Price

16 | 5745 JC4127X $100.25 $ 100.25 JC4127X $115.00 $ 115.00 gCN127X $250.73 $ 250.73 gHP C4127X $118.00 $ 118.00
HEWLETT
PACKARD

17 | 5750 JC6578AN $53.70 $ 859.20 JC6578AN $59.00 $ 944.00 JC6578AN $118.31 $ 1,892.96 JC6578AN $54.50 $ 872.00
HEWLETT-
PACKARD

18 | 5754 JC4092A $50.13 $ 100.26 JC4092A $55.00 $ 110.00 JC4092A $128.30 $ 256.60 JC4092A $43.70 $ 87.40
HEWLETT
PACKARD

19 | 5763 JC8061X $120.52 $ 1,325.72 JC8061X $115.00 $ 1,265.00 JC8061X $250.73 $ 2,758.03 JC8061X $104.50 $ 1,149.50
HEWLETT
PACKARD

20 | 5791 JC9725A $306.10 $ 306.10 JC9725A $299.00 $ 299.00 JC9725A $481.50 $ 481.50 JC9725A $134.50 $ 134.50
HEWLETT
PACKARD

21 | 5792 JQ3675A $265.57 $ 265.57 JQ3675A $330.00 $ 330.00 JHEWQ367A  $432.23 $ 432.23 JQ3675A $259.70 $ 259.70
HEWLETT
PACKARD

22 | 5794 JC9720A $146.26 $ 2,486.42 JC9720A $159.00 $ 2,703.00 JHEWC9720A |$301.46 $ 5,124.82 JC9720A $146.50 $ 2,490.50
HEWLETT
PACKARD

23 | 5795 JC9721A $198.16 $ 2,377.92 JC9721A $189.00 $ 2,268.00 JHEWC9721A |$403.84 $ 4,846.08 JC9721A $182.30 $ 2,187.60
HEWLETT
PACKARD

24 | 5796 JC9723A $198.16 $ 2,774.24 JC9723A $189.00 $ 2,646.00 JHEWC9723A | $403.84 $ 5,653.76 JC9723A $182.30 $ 2,552.20
HEWLETT
PACKARD

25 | 5797 JC9722A $198.16 $ 2,179.76 JC9722A $189.00 $ 2,079.00 JHEWC9722A |$403.84 $ 4,442.24 JC9722A $182.30 $ 2,005.30
HEWLETT
PACKARD

26 | 5800 JC7115X $65.50 $ 65.50 JC7115X $69.00 $ 69.00 JC7115X $124.00 $ 124.00 JC7115X $70.50 $ 70.50
HEWLETT
PACKARD

27 | 5806 JQ6000A $61.78 $ 988.48 JQ6000A $65.00 $ 1,040.00 JHEWQG6000A | $135.53 $ 2,168.48 JQ6000A $59.40 $ 950.40
HEWLETT
PACKARD

28 | 5807 JQ6001A $67.44 $ 741.84 JQ6001A $69.00 $ 759.00 JHEWQG6001A | $146.70 $ 1,613.70 JQ6001A $64.20 $ 706.20
HEWLETT
PACKARD
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

PriStore Services

Supply Saver

Paper Systems

Carolina Imaging Products

$

117,217.95

$

129,160.00 | $

241,033.86

No Bid Proposal Document Received

Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit
# # Price

29 | 5808 JQ6002A $67.44 $

30 | 5809 JQG6003A $67.44 $
31 | 5852 JQ3960A $70.64 $
32 | 5853 JQ3961A $85.20 $
33 | 5854 JQ3962A $85.20 $
34 | 5855 JQ3963A $85.20 $
35 | 5856 JQ3964A $216.21 $
36 | 5857 JQ6460A $120.03 $
37 | 5858 JQ6461A $258.67 $
38 | 5859 JQ6462A $258.67 $
39 | 5860 JQ6463A $258.67 $
40 | 5885 JQ7504A $204.91 $

41 | 5886 JQ7502A $285.44 $

Bid # 501022-2014

Total Price

876.72

944.16

565.12

937.20

937.20

937.20

1,297.26

1,560.39

776.01

258.67

258.67

204.91

285.44

Vendor Stock

#

Q6002A

Q6003A

Q3960A

Q3961A

Q3962A

Q3963A

Q3964A

Q6460A

Q6461A

Q6462A

Q6463A

Q7504A

Q7502A

OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock
Price #

$69.00 $ 897.00 JHEWQG6002A

$69.00 $ 966.00 JHEWQG6003A
$77.00 $ 616.00 JHPQ3960A
$85.00 $ 935.00 JHPQ3961A
$85.00 $ 935.00 JHPQ3962A
$85.00 $ 935.00 JHPQ3963A
$179.00 $ 1,074.00 JQ3964A
$129.00 $ 1,677.00 JHPQ6460A
$249.00 $ 747.00 JHPQG6461A
$249.00 $ 249.00 JHPQ6462A
$249.00 $ 249.00 JHPQ6463A
$309.00 $ 309.00 JHEWQ7504A

$349.00 $ 349.00 JHEWQ7502A

OEM Unit
Price

Total Price
$146.70 $ 1,907.10
$146.70 $ 2,053.80
$159.15 $ 1,273.20
$175.09 $ 1,925.99
$175.09 $ 1,925.99
$175.09 $ 1,925.99
$365.56 $ 2,193.36
$241.02 $ 3,133.26
$502.93 $ 1,508.79
$502.93 $ 502.93
$502.93 $ 502.93
$385.25 $ 385.25

$454.03 $ 454.03

Vendor Stock | OEM Unit
# Price

Q6002A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q6003A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q3960A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q3961A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q3962A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q3963A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q3964A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q6460A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q6461A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q6462A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q6463A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q7504A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

110V-Q7502A |$234.50 $
HEWLETTPAC
KARD

$64.20 $

$64.20 $

$64.30 $

$72.70 $

$72.70 $

$72.70 $

$169.20 $

$107.65 $

$219.10 $

$219.10 $

$219.10 $

$239.75 $

Total Price

834.60

898.80

514.40

799.70

799.70

799.70

1,015.20

1,399.45

657.30

219.10

219.10

239.75

234.50

24



PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

PriStore Services

Supply Saver

Paper Systems

Carolina Imaging Products

$

117,217.95

$

129,160.00 | $

241,033.86

No Bid Proposal Document Received

Line

42

43

44

45

46

a7

48

49

50

51

52

53

id

5887 Q5421A

5888 JQ5997A

5896 JQ5998A

5898

5899

5900

5901

5903

5904

5905

C9385AN

C9386AN

C9387AN

C9388AN

C8057A

C8543X

C9152A

5906 INO BID

9144 [Q6470A

Bid # 501022-2014

Vendor Stock | OEM Unit

Price

$274.21

$87.34

$262.19

$18.30

$13.18

$13.18

$13.18

$249.53

$226.37

$548.43

NO BID

$113.20

Total Price

$

$

274.21

1,135.42

786.57

384.30

13.18

79.08

65.90

249.53

226.37

548.43

226.40

Vendor Stock

#

Q5421A

Q5997A

Q5998A

C9385AN

C9386AN

C9387AN

C9388AN

C8057A

C8543X

C9152A

C4155A

Q6470A

OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock
Price #

$269.00 $ 269.00 JHEWQ5421A

$79.00 $ 1,027.00 JHEWQ5997A
$259.00 $ 777.00 JHEWQ5998A
$22.00 $ 462.00 HEWC9385AN
$16.00 $ 16.00 JC9386AN
$16.00 $ 96.00 JC9387AN
$16.00 $ 80.00 JC9388AN
$249.00 $ 249.00 JC8057A
$269.00 $ 269.00 JC8543X
$599.00 $ 599.00 JC9152A
$229.00 C4155A

$114.00 $ 228.00 JHPQ6470A

OEM Unit

Price

$432.05

$149.45

$435.89

$48.81

$38.82

$38.82

$38.82

$402.74

$459.52

$850.91

$481.50

$227.29

Total Price

$

$

$

432.05

1,942.85

1,307.67

1,025.01

38.82

232.92

194.10

402.74

459.52

850.91

454.58

Vendor Stock | OEM Unit
# Price

Total Price

Q5421A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q5997A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q5998A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C9385AN
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C9386AN
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C9387AN
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C9388AN
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C8057A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C8543X
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C9152A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C4155A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

$249.77 $ 249.77

$73.50 $ 955.50
$239.50 $ 718.50
$18.70 $ 392.70
$13.59 $ 13.59
$13.59 $ 81.54
$13.59 $ 67.95
$168.50 $ 168.50
$210.40 $ 210.40
$442.70 $

442.70

$155.00

Q6470A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

$119.30 $ 238.60
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

PriStore Services

Supply Saver

Paper Systems

Carolina Imaging Products

$

117,217.95

3 129,160.00

$

241,033.86

No Bid Proposal Document Received

Line

54

55

56

57

58

59

60

61

62

63

64

65

66

id

9146 [Q7581A

9147 Q7582A

9148

9149

9150

9151

C9730A

C9731A

C9732A

C9733A

9166 JQ7583A

9435 JQ3676A

10153

10230

10231

10232

10243

CE255X

C4906AN

C4907AN

C4908AN

C4909AN

Bid # 501022-2014

Vendor Stock | OEM Unit

Total Price
Price

$145.60 $ 145.60

$145.60 $ 145.60
$202.79 $ 1,013.95
$284.37 $ 1,421.85
$284.37 $ 1,421.85
$284.37 $ 1,421.85
$145.60 $ 145.60
$287.59 $ 287.59
$174.79 $ 5,068.91
$31.73 $ 444.22
$21.14 $ 317.10
$21.14 $ 338.24

$21.14 $ 317.10

Vendor Stock | OEM Unit
# Price

Total Price

Q7581A $140.00 $ 140.00

Q7582A $140.00 $ 140.00

C9730A $225.00 $ 1,125.00

C9731A $289.00 $ 1,445.00

C9732A $289.00 $ 1,445.00

C9733A $289.00 $ 1,445.00

Q7583A $140.00 $ 140.00

Q3676A $279.00 $ 279.00

CE255X $179.00 $ 5,191.00

C4906AN $36.00 $ 504.00

C4907AN $24.00 $ 360.00

C4908AN $24.00 $ 384.00

C4909AN $24.00 $ 360.00

Vendor Stock

id

JHPQ7581A

IHPQ7582A

JC9730A

JC9731A

JC9732A

JC9733A

IHPO5783A

IHEWQ3676A

JHEWCE255X

JHEWC4906AN | $75.09 $

JHEWC4907AN | $54.75 $

JHEWC4908AN | $54.75 $

JHEWC4909AN | $54.75 $

OEM Unit
Price

Total Price
$289.19 $ 289.19
$289.19 $ 289.19
$413.09 $ 2,065.45
$573.90 $ 2,869.50
$573.90 $ 2,869.50
$573.90 $ 2,869.50
$288.64 $ 288.64
$462.18 $ 462.18
$344.14 $ 9,980.06
1,051.26

821.25

876.00

821.25

Vendor Stock | OEM Unit
# Price

Q7581A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q7582A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C9730A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C9731A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C9732A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C9733A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q7583A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

Q3676A
HEWLETT
PACKARD

CE255X
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C4906AN
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C4907AN
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C4908AN
HEWLETT
PACKARD

C4909AN
HEWLETT
PACKARD

$127.40 $

$127.40 $

$181.90 $

$269.40 $

$269.40 $

$269.40 $

$127.40 $

$142.00 $

$161.90 $

$31.90 $

$21.50 $

$21.50 $

$21.50 $

Total Price

127.40

127.40

909.50

1,347.00

1,347.00

1,347.00

127.40

142.00

4,695.10

446.60

322.50

344.00

322.50
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

PriStore Services Supply Saver Paper Systems Carolina Imaging Products
$ 117,21795] $ 129,160.00 | $ 241,033.86 No Bid Proposal Document Received
Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price
# # Price H# Price # Price H# Price
67 | 11306 TK-1142 $60.82 $ 1,702.96 JTK1142 $79.00 $ 2,212.00 jKYO1TO2FVO |$133.51 $ 3,738.28 JTK-1142 $59.40 $ 1,663.20
uso KYOCERA
MITA
68 | 5782 J02-81081-001 |$494.31 $ 494.31 J02-81081-001 |$509.00 $ 509.00 J02-81081-001 |$888.09 $ 888.09 §02-81081-001 |$319.50 $ 319.50
TROY
69 | 5893 JO13R00606 $87.75 $ 438.75 JO13R00606 $105.00 $ 525.00 JO13R00606 $184.79 $ 923.95 J013R00606 $69.40 $ 347.00
XEROX
70 | 9429 J113R00726 $215.65 $ 9,704.25 §113R00726 $199.00 $ 8,955.00 IXER113R0072 |$384.70 $ 17,311.50 J113R00726 $179.50 $ 8,077.50
16 XEROX
71 | 9430 J113R00723 $215.65 $ 3,881.70 J113R00723 $219.00 $ 3,942.00 XER113R0072 |$421.06 $ 7,579.08 J113R00723 $198.50 $ 3,573.00
3 XEROX
72 | 9431 J113R00724 $215.65 $ 5,606.90 §J113R00724 $219.00 $ 5,694.00 IXER113R0072 |$421.06 $ 10,947.56 J113R00724 $198.50 $ 5,161.00
4 XEROX
73 | 9432 J113R00725 $215.65 $ 5,606.90 J113R00725 $219.00 $ 5,694.00 IXER113R0072 |$421.06 $ 10,947.56 J113R00725 $198.50 $ 5,161.00
5 XEROX
74 | 9443 J106R01221 $160.62 $ 642.48 J106R01221 $169.00 $ 676.00 IXER106R0122 |$349.08 $ 1,396.32 J106R01221 $189.40 $ 757.60
1 XEROX
75 | 9444 J106R01218 $232.07 $ 232.07 §106R01218 $289.00 $ 289.00 IXER106R0121 $574.36 $ 574.36 J106R01218 $273.50 $ 273.50
18 XEROX
76 | 9445 J106R01219 $236.47 $ 709.41 §106R01219 $289.00 $ 867.00 IXER106R0121 |$574.36 $ 1,723.08 J106R01219 $273.50 $ 820.50
9 XEROX
77 | 9446 J106R01220 $232.07 $ 232.07 §106R01220 $289.00 $ 289.00 IXER106R0122 $574.36 $ 574.36 J106R01220 $273.50 $ 273.50
| (0] XEROX
78 | 9595 J108R00795 $157.10 $ 9,583.10 §108R0O0795 $179.00 $ 10,919.00 gXER108R0079 |$299.63 $ 18,277.43 J108R00795 $162.20 $ 9,894.20
5 XEROX
79 | 9596 J108R00823 $41.64 $ 166.56 J108R00823 $59.00 $ 236.00 IXER108R0082 '$100.73 $ 402.92 J108R00823 $44.30 $ 177.20
3 XEROX
80 | 9630 J108R0O0646 $71.39 $ 142.78 J108R00646 $84.00 $ 168.00 XER108R0064 |$151.74 $ 303.48 J108R00646 $83.50 $ 167.00
16 XEROX
81 | 9631 J108R00645 $263.24 $ 789.72 §108R00645 $269.00 $ 807.00 IXER108R0064 $477.29 $ 1,431.87 J108R00645 $261.50 $ 784.50
5 XEROX
82 | 9632 J115R00055 $156.00 $ 156.00 J115R00055 $179.00 $ 179.00 gXER115R0005 | $289.37 $ 289.37 §115R00055 $169.75 $ 169.75
5 XEROX
83 | 10200 NO BID NO BID 126N00326 $239.00 $ 239.00 IXER126N0032 $330.18 $ 330.18 §126N00326 $234.95 $ 234.95
16 XEROX
84 | 10201 NO BID NO BID J022N02345 $39.00 $ 39.00 IXER022N0234 |$42.63 $ 42.63 J022N02345 $24.95 $ 24.95
5 XEROX
85 | 10202 NO BID NO BID |022N02344 $69.00 $ 69.00 IXER022N0234 $49.45 $ 49.45 |022N02344 $27.50 $ 27.50
4 XEROX

Bid # 501022-2014
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PA Turnpike Commission

Toner Supply Bid Tabulation

Due 6/2/2014

PriStore Services Supply Saver Paper Systems Carolina Imaging Products
$ 117,21795] $ 129,160.00 | $ 241,033.86 No Bid Proposal Document Received
Line Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit Total Price Vendor Stock | OEM Unit | Total Price
# # Price # Price # Price # Price
86 | 10203 jNO BID NO BID J002N02788 $69.00 $ 69.00 fXERO02N0278 | $54.85 $ 54.85 JO02N02788 $34.00 $ 34.00
18 XEROX
87 | 11530 j106R01594 $101.13 $ 2,528.25 J106R1594 $113.00 $ 2,825.00 IXER106R0159 | $200.73 $ 5,018.25 J106R1594 $106.25 $ 2,656.25
4 XEROX
88 | 11531 J106R01596 $101.13 $ 2,528.25 J106R1596 $113.00 $ 2,825.00 IXER106R0159 $200.73 $ 5,018.25 J106R1596 $106.25 $ 2,656.25
16 XEROX
89 | 11532 j106R01597 $94.44 $ 2,833.20 J106R1597 $111.00 $ 3,330.00 IXER106R0159 | $194.23 $ 5,826.90 J106R1597 $102.50 $ 3,075.00
7 XEROX
90 | 11533 §J106R01595 $101.13 $ 2,325.99 J106R1595 $113.00 $ 2,599.00 IXER106R0159 |$200.73 $ 4,616.79 J106R1595 $106.25 $ 2,443.75
5 XEROX
91 | 11915 §675K92001 $149.38 $ 1,493.80 J675K92001 $172.00 $ 1,720.00 IXER675K9200 |$241.14 $ 2,411.40 §675K92001 $153.99 $ 1,539.90
1 XEROX
92 | 11916 §675K47088 $143.03 $ 1,430.30 §675K47088 $165.00 $ 1,650.00 IXER675K4708 | $416.65 $ 4,166.50 j675K47088 $149.50 $ 1,495.00
I8 XEROX
93 | 5787 JDR400 $120.00 $ 360.00 §DR400 $135.00 $ 405.00 |BRTDR400 $234.43 $ 703.29 JDR400 $109.50 $ 328.50
BROTHER
94 | 5727 § Q5945A $174.17 $ 7,315.14 § Q5945A $194.00 $ 8,148.00 § Q5945A $343.37 $ 14,421.54 § Q5945A $179.99 $ 7,559.58
HEWLETT
PACKARD
95 | 9418 g NO BID NO BID 793-5 $36.00 $ 288.00 | PRMPT7935 [$51.83 $ 414.64 | 793-5 PITNEY [$83.50 $ 668.00
BOWES
96 | 12153 | 604K64582 $86.02 $ 430.10 § 604K64582 $107.00 $ 535.00 $316.75 $ 1,583.75 § 604K64582 $93.70 $ 468.50
XER604K6458 XEROX
2
97 | 12209 § NO BID NO BID TK590K $79.00 $ 790.00 f KYOTK592K $137.16 $ 1,371.60 § TK-590K $74.50 $ 745.00
IKYOCERA
98 | 12210 NO BID NO BID TK590C $80.00 $ 800.00 f KYOTK592C $139.28 $ 1,392.80 § TK-590C $75.90 $ 759.00
IKYOCERA
99 | 12211 g NO BID NO BID TK590M $80.00 $ 800.00 f KYOTK592M $139.28 $ 1,392.80 § TK-590M $75.90 $ 759.00
IKYOCERA
100 | 12212 § NO BID NO BID TK590Y $80.00 $ 800.00 f KYOTK592Y $139.28 $ 1,392.80 § TK-590Y $75.90 $ 759.00
IKYOCERA
NO BII $ 117,217.95 $ 129,160.00 $ 241,033.86 $ 116,281.28

Bid # 501022-2014
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