PA Turnpike Commission - Bid Tabulation Authentic Promotions.com Apex Advertising Inc Envision Images Alive Ltd Artistic Imprints Guernsey
Bid Number |582000-2014 Carmichael CA Lancaster PA Camp Hill PA Northbrook IL Camp Hill PA Middletown PA
Promotional/Corp Apparel
Opening Date 8/7/2014
Item| Qty Unitof |Description Unit Price |Other Charges | Unit Price |Other Charges | Unit Price |Other Charges | Unit Price |Other Charges | Unit Price |Other Charges | Unit Price |Other Charges
Measure
CORPORATE APPAREL 1-time setup |no additional charges includes setup and delivery | min order:@2 embr. pieces
$40.00 10% over/under
1 Stretch Tech Shell
A Men's |S-2XL $23.99 $34.50 $42.00 $25.25 $26.90 | none $30.95
$36.00 $26.40
B Men's |3XL - 4XL $23.99 $37.50 $46.00 $28.60 $30.90 | none $33.95
$39.00 $29.75
C Men's |5XL-6XL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Polo Shirts
A Men's |S-XL $13.99 $20.00 $21.00 $14.15 $14.90 |none $17.95
B Men's |2XL $13.99 $21.50 $23.00 $15.25 $15.90 |none $18.95
C Men's |3XL $13.99 $23.00 $27.00 $17.50 $17.90 |none $20.95
D Men's |4XL $13.99 $24.50 $34.00 $18.60 $18.90 |none $21.95
Men's |5XL $13.99 $26.00 $34.00 $20.85 $18.90 |none $23.95
Men's | 6XL $13.99 $27.50 $34.00 $21.95 $18.90 none $25.95
E Women's |S-XL $13.99 $20.00 $21.00 $14.15 $14.90 |none $17.95
F Women's |2XL $13.99 $21.50 $23.00 $15.25 $15.90 |none $18.95
G Women's |3XL $13.99 $23.00 NO BID $16.40 $16.90 none NO BID
PROMOTIONAL CORE ITEMS free ar.tW(.)rk .Setup .onI.y on first order includes set up and delivery
incl shipping incl shipping
A | 1000/ each Bike Bottle $0.59 $0.69 $40 new art $0.79 | setup $20 $0.87 | $40 setup $0.88 | $.05 each PMS $0.56 | $55 screen
S5 for existing color match $150 ship
B | 1000/ each |Power Clip $0.49 S0.64 $0.64 | setup $50 $0.56 | $40 setup $0.68 $0.52 | $50 screen
$18 PMS ink
$90 ship
C | 1000/ each |First Aid Kit $1.59 $1.90 $1.49 | setup $40 $1.53 | $40 setup $1.26 $1.45 | S60 screen
$60 ship
D | 3000/ each |Pencil $0.14 $0.19 $0.18 | sharpening $0.168 $0.19 $0.16 | $70 ship
option $60
E | 5000 each |JavalinaPen $0.37 $0.40 $0.46 | setup $25 $0.335 | $15 setup $0.43 $0.33 | $15 screen
$80 ship
F 500 each |Sports Pack 1 color $1.09 $1.49 $1.49 | setup $50 $1.63 | $40 setup $1.74 $1.45 | $50 screen
$80 ship
500| each |Sports Pack 2 color $1.39 $1.99 $40 setup per $1.99 | setup $50 $2.08 | $80 setup $2.34 $2.10 | $100 screen
color S50 PMS ink
$80 ship
NO BID |Houck Printing




PA Turnpike Commission - Bid Tabulation

Proforma Destiny
Promotions

Levin Promotional Products

Joe Palahunik Associates -

Advertising Apparel Inc

Commonwealth Printing &
Promotions

Linda's Imprinted Products

Atlas Pen & Pencil Corp

Bid Number |582000-2014 Hummelstown PA Harrisburg PA McKees Rocks PA 15136 Mt Holly Springs PA Pittsburgh PA Shelbyville TN
Promotional/Corp Apparel
Opening Date 8/7/2014
Item Qty Unitof Description Unit Price |Other Charges | Unit Price |Other Charges | Unit Price |Other Charges | Unit Price |Other Charges | Unit Price |Other Charges Unit Price |Other Charges
Measure
CORPORATE APPAREL $.50 shipping per shirt Orders of 50 or more reduce includes setup and freight
unit price by $1.00
1 Stretch Tech Shell
A Men's |S-2XL $30.75 $32.30 $33.65 $32.98 27.79 $35.00 set up NO BID
$34.50 29.05 |+ freight
B Men's |3XL - 4XL $36.00 $36.50 $37.95 $38.32 31.45 $35.00 set up NO BID
$38.50 32.69 |+ freight
C Men's |5XL-6XL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Polo Shirts
A Men's |S-XL $18.00 $19.10 $22.98 $24.56 $15.89 | $35.00 set up NO BID
» + freight
B Men's |2XL $19.25 $20.50 $24.00 $26.23 $17.08 | $35.00 set up NO BID
+ freight
C Men's |3XL $21.50 $22.50 $26.00 $29.57 $19.49 | $35.00 set up NO BID
+ freight
D Men's |4XL $23.00 $23.50 $27.75 $31.23 $20.69 | $35.00 set up NO BID
+ freight
Men's |5XL $26.00 $25.50 $29.50 $34.56 $20.69 | $35.00 set up NO BID
+ freight
Men's |6XL $27.25 $27.00 $31.25 $36.23 $20.69 | $35.00 set up NO BID
+ freight
E Women's |S-XL $18.00 $19.10 $22.98 $24.56 $15.89 | $35.00 set up NO BID
+ freight
F Women's |2XL $19.25 $20.50 $24.00 $26.23 $17.08 | $35.00 set up NO BID
+ freight
G Women's |3XL NO BID $22.50 $33.95 ** NO BID NO BID NO BID
PROMOTIONAL CORE ITEMS includes setup and freight |UPS ground freight
A | 1000/ each Bike Bottle $0.61 | S50 setup - 1st $0.73 | $210 freight $1.09 | S50 setup $1.09 $0.989 | 5% over /under $1.53 | **
$25 - reorder S10 art PMS $30.00
S67 shipping | |
B | 1000/ each |Power Clip $0.50 | S50 setup - 1st $0.65 | $80 freight $0.71 | S50 setup $0.79 $0.676 | 5% over /under $0.92 | **
$25 - reorder S10 art PMS $25.00
S 38 shipping
C | 1000, each |First Aid Kit $1.27 | $45 setup - 1st $1.74 | $44 freight $1.45 | S50 setup $1.9085 $1.220 | 5% over /under §2.25 | **
$20 - reorder S10 art PMS $25.00
$ 83 shipping
D | 3000/ each |Pencil $0.16 | $22 shipping $0.19 | $70 freight $0.19 | $10 art $0.1976 $0.178 | 5% over /under $0.117 | **
$71 shipping PMS $25.00
E | 5000 each |JavalinaPen $0.36 | $20 setup - 1st $0.46 | $80 freight $0.32 | $10 art $0.411 $0.375 | 5% over /under $0.55 | **
$15 - reorder PMS $25.00
S 34 shipping
F 500, each |Sports Pack 1 color $1.53 | $50 setup - 1st $1.67 | $85 freight $1.49 | $25 setup $1.98 $1.410 | 5% over /under $1.63
$25 - reorder S10 art PMS $25.00
$ 90 shipping | ‘
500| each |Sports Pack 2 color $1.60 | $100 setup 1st $2.19 | $85 freight $1.99 | $25 setup $2.77 $1.950 | 5% over /under $2.05
$50 - reorder S10 art PMS $25.00
$ 90 shipping
** see exceptions ** see exception
NO BID |Houck Printing




PA Turnpike Commission - Bid Tabulation

Print Works On Demand Inc

Triangle Press Inc

Bid Number |582000-2014 Harrisburg PA Harrisburg PA
Promotional/Corp Apparel
Opening Date 8/7/2014
Item Qty Unitof Description Unit Price |Other Charges | Unit Price |Other Charges
Measure
CORPORATE APPAREL 1-time set up 350
1 Stretch Tech Shell
A Men's |S-2XL $34.00| $5.25/shirt $43.40 | min 10 for free
$35.00|shipping shipping
B Men's |3XL-4XL $36.00 | $5.25/shirt $47.32 | min 10 for free
shipping shipping
C Men's |5XL-6XL NO BID NO BID
2 Polo Shirts
A Men's |S-XL $16.50 | $5.25/shirt $28.84 | min 10 for free
shipping |shipping
B Men's [2XL $18.00 | $5.25/shirt $30.19 | min 10 for free
shipping shipping
C Men's |3XL $19.50 | $5.25/shirt $33.04 | min 10 for free
shipping shipping
D Men's |4XL $21.00 | $5.25/shirt $38.08 | min 10 for free
shipping shipping
Men's |5XL $24.50 | $5.25/shirt $38.08 | min 10 for free
shipping shipping
Men's |6XL $25.50 | $5.25/shirt $38.08 | min 10 for free
shipping shipping
E Women's |S-XL $16.50 | $5.25/shirt $28.84 | min 10 for free
shipping shipping
F Women's |2XL $18.00 | $5.25/shirt $30.19 | min 10 for free
shipping shipping
G Women's |3XL $19.50 | $5.25/shirt NO BID
shipping
PROMOTIONAL CORE ITEMS includes shipping
A | 1000| each |Bike Bottle $0.96 | $225 shipping $1.24
B | 1000/ each |Power Clip $0.98 | $25 1-time $0.68 |
setup
C 1000 each First Aid Kit $2.35 | $15 1-time $1.91
setup
D | 3000/ each |Pencil $0.21 | $65 shipping $0.23
E | 5000, each |Javalina Pen $0.49 | shipping $0.45
F 500| each |Sports Pack 1 color $1.94 | S80 shipping $1.46
500| each |Sports Pack 2 color $2.53 | $80 shipping $1.96
5
NO BID |Houck Printing
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