
958400-2014

Printing & Graphic Design 

Services

8/20/2014

PrintWorks On Demand

Qty Unit of 

Measure

Description Unit Price Note Unit Price Note Unit Price Note Unit Price Note

Standard Services

1 HOUR Artwork 40.00$         35.00$        60.00$         50.00$         

100 COPIES 8.5" x 11"  8 page Saddlestitch 164.00$      163.00$      281.00$      4 - Color 370.00$      

500 COPIES 8.5" x 11"  8 page Saddlestitch 430.00$      583.00$      702.00$      4 - Color 1,655.00$   

1000 COPIES 8.5" x 11"  8 page Saddlestitch 730.00$      615.00$      772.00$      4 - Color 2,900.00$   

100 COPIES 8.5" x 11" 12 page Saddlestitch 278.00$      245.00$      383.00$      550.00$      

500 COPIES 8.5" x 11" 12 page Saddlestitch 827.00$      839.00$      1,036.00$   2,450.00$   

1000 COPIES 8.5" x 11" 12 page Saddlestitch 1,305.00$   948.00$      1,132.00$   4,300.00$   

Digital Scanning

1 EACH 4" x 6" Photo 5.00$           5.00$          7.00$           15.00$         

1 EACH 11" x 15" Photo 5.00$           5.00$          8.00$           15.00$         

Banners

1 EACH Banner 8" x 3" 120.00$      128.00$      1-9 70.00$         144.00$      

1 EACH Banner 5" x 5" 125.00$      219.00$      1-9 120.00$      144.00$      

Signs

1 EACH 8.5" x 11", Ultra Mount 11.00$         Print & Mount -

Offer Volume 

Discount

3.25$          15.00$         10.00$         

1 EACH ITEM REMOVED DUE TO TYPO 25.00$         403.00$      35.00$         60.00$         

1 EACH 11" x 17", 3mm PVC 9.80$           Offer Volume 

Discount
12.00$        26.00$         15.00$         

Laminating Services

1 EACH 1.5 mil 8.5" x 11" NO BID 0.81$          0.41$           1.00$           

1 EACH  3 mil 8.5" x 11" 0.60$           0.81$          0.41$           1.50$           

1 EACH  5 mil 8.5" x 11" 4.00$           Offer Volume 

Discount
1.63$          0.52$           2.00$           

1 EACH  3 mil 22" x 36" 7.00$           7.00$          3.26$           12.00$         

1 EACH  5 mil 22" x 36" 11.00$         14.00$        4.21$           18.00$         

1 EACH  3 mil 24" x 36" 7.00$           7.50$          3.56$           12.00$         

1 EACH  3 mil 19" x 36" 7.00$           6.00$          3.41$           12.00$         

Formex Inc

Lemoyne, PA

Formex Inc Envision

Envision

Camp Hill, PA

PrintWorks On Demand

Bid Number

Opening Date

PrintWorks On Demand

Harrisburg, PA

Low Bid based on High 

Usage:

ARC Document Solutions LLC

Lemoyne, PA

ARC Document Solutions LLC
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PrintWorks On Demand

Qty Unit of 

Measure

Description Unit Price Note Unit Price Note Unit Price Note Unit Price Note

Formex Inc EnvisionPrintWorks On DemandLow Bid based on High 

Usage:

ARC Document Solutions LLC

Printing Services

1 EACH 8.5" x 11" B&W one-sided 0.025$         0.024$        0.07$           0.03$           

1 EACH 8.5" x 11" B&W two-sided 0.05$           0.048$        0.13$           0.05$           

1 EACH 8.5" x 11"Color one-sided 0.25$           0.090$        0.41$           0.35$           

1 EACH 8.5" x 11" Color two-sided 0.50$           0.180$        0.80$           0.50$           

1 EACH 11" x 17" B&W one-sided 0.12$           0.034$        0.15$           0.09$           

1 EACH 11" x 17" B&W two-sided 0.16$           0.068$        0.30$           0.12$           

1 EACH 11" x 17" Color one-sided 0.40$           0.100$        0.79$           0.70$           

1 EACH 11" x 17" Color two-sided 0.60$           0.200$        1.58$           0.90$           

Poster Output

1 EACH 30"x 40" Foam Core one-sided 42.00$         Offer Volume 

Discount
55.00$        45.00$         72.00$         

1 EACH 42"x 54" 100# Gloss Text 63.00$         Offer Volume 

Discount
82.00$        53.00$         165.00$      

Work Samples: Total Total Total Total

250 EACH Fast Facts 0.656$         164.00$       0.88$          220.00$       1.03$           257.00$       0.90$           225.00$         

500 EACH The Road To Progress 0.62$           310.00$       0.416$        208.00$       0.85$           425.00$       1.95$           975.00$         

50,000 EACH E-Z Pass Brochure 0.0533$      2,665.00$    0.0488$      2,440.00$    0.06$           3,000.00$    0.20$           10,000.00$   

No Bid: Alan Skulsky & Associates, d/b/a 

Levin Promotional Products

2



958400-2014

Printing & Graphic Design 

Services

8/20/2014

PrintWorks On Demand

Qty Unit of 

Measure

Description

Standard Services

1 HOUR Artwork

100 COPIES 8.5" x 11"  8 page Saddlestitch

500 COPIES 8.5" x 11"  8 page Saddlestitch

1000 COPIES 8.5" x 11"  8 page Saddlestitch

100 COPIES 8.5" x 11" 12 page Saddlestitch

500 COPIES 8.5" x 11" 12 page Saddlestitch

1000 COPIES 8.5" x 11" 12 page Saddlestitch

Digital Scanning

1 EACH 4" x 6" Photo 

1 EACH 11" x 15" Photo

Banners

1 EACH Banner 8" x 3"

1 EACH Banner 5" x 5"

Signs

1 EACH 8.5" x 11", Ultra Mount

1 EACH ITEM REMOVED DUE TO TYPO

1 EACH 11" x 17", 3mm PVC

Laminating Services

1 EACH 1.5 mil 8.5" x 11"

1 EACH  3 mil 8.5" x 11"

1 EACH  5 mil 8.5" x 11"

1 EACH  3 mil 22" x 36"

1 EACH  5 mil 22" x 36"

1 EACH  3 mil 24" x 36"

1 EACH  3 mil 19" x 36"

Bid Number

Opening Date

Low Bid based on High 

Usage:
Unit Price Note Unit Price Note Unit Price Note Unit Price Note

75.00$        35.00$         75.00$         100.00$         Design 

300.00$      Color 262.00$      299.00$      1,697.00$     

270.00$      Color 458.00$      667.00$      5,060.00$     

240.00$      Color 768.00$      999.00$      9,070.00$     

420.00$      Color 312.00$      376.00$      2,500.00$     

390.00$      Color 610.00$      900.00$      7,050.00$     

360.00$      Color 1,024.00$   1,399.00$   11,525.00$   

2.00$          15.00$         50.00$         15.00$           

6.75$          15.00$         70.00$         25.00$           

210.00$      118.00$      NO BID 58.32$           

250.00$      170.00$      NO BID 63.00$           

8.00$          18.00$         75.00$         6.00$             

3.00$          320.00$      NO BID 15.60$           

16.00$        20.00$         NO BID 8.10$             

3.00$          1.25$           NO BID 1.75$             

3.30$          1.35$           NO BID 3.00$             

4.70$          1.45$           NO BID 3.00$             

22.25$        7.80$           NO BID 15.00$           

26.00$        7.90$           NO BID 28.00$           

24.30$        7.80$           NO BID 16.00$           

19.20$        7.40$           NO BID 12.00$           

Horizon Concepts

Bellmore, NY

Horizon Concepts

Colortech, Inc.

Lebanon, PA

Colortech, Inc.

Eclipsecorp

Gahanna, OH

Eclipsecorp

Ricoh USA, Inc.

Wayne, PA

Ricoh USA, Inc.
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PrintWorks On Demand

Qty Unit of 

Measure

Description

Low Bid based on High 

Usage:

Printing Services

1 EACH 8.5" x 11" B&W one-sided

1 EACH 8.5" x 11" B&W two-sided

1 EACH 8.5" x 11"Color one-sided

1 EACH 8.5" x 11" Color two-sided

1 EACH 11" x 17" B&W one-sided

1 EACH 11" x 17" B&W two-sided

1 EACH 11" x 17" Color one-sided

1 EACH 11" x 17" Color two-sided

Poster Output

1 EACH 30"x 40" Foam Core one-sided

1 EACH 42"x 54" 100# Gloss Text

Work Samples:

250 EACH Fast Facts

500 EACH The Road To Progress

50,000 EACH E-Z Pass Brochure

No Bid: Alan Skulsky & Associates, d/b/a 

Levin Promotional Products

Unit Price Note Unit Price Note Unit Price Note Unit Price Note

Horizon Concepts Colortech, Inc. EclipsecorpRicoh USA, Inc.

0.025$        NO BID 0.05$           10M min 1.50$             

0.05$          NO BID 0.054$         10M min 2.50$             

0.20$          NO BID 0.082$         10M min 1.75$             

0.30$          NO BID 0.090$         10M min 3.00$             

0.15$          NO BID 0.070$         10M min 3.50$             

0.30$          NO BID 0.076$         10M min 5.00$             

0.30$          NO BID 0.100$         10M min 3.50$             

0.60$          NO BID 0.110$         10M min 6.00$             

70.125$      Color 42.00$         150.00$      35.00$           

120.00$      Color 56.00$         NO BID 42.00$           

Total Total Total Total

2.10$          525.00$        0.912$         228.00$       1.19$           297.00$       2.50$             625.00$           

1.35$          675.00$        0.512$         256.00$       0.80$           398.00$       1.00$             500.00$           

0.17$          8,500.00$    0.046$         2,330.00$    0.05$           2,283.00$    0.65$             32,500.00$     
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