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5452  BROOM, GARAGE, 18 IN., W/O HANDLE PALMYRA 

FILL, LACQUERED HARDWOOD BLOCK, W/TWO 
THREADED HANDLE HOLES

EA 42022 WEILER 5147220 12 104.00 Case 1A844 1 4.59 Each 7920-2026-020 12 133.61
(11.14 ea)

Dozen

5453  BROOM, OFFICE, 18 IN., W/O HANDLE BLACK 
TAMPICO CENTER W/BORDER OF BLACK 
HORSEHAIR & PLASTIC MIX, LACQUERED 
HARDWOOD W/TWO THREADED HANDLE HOLES.

EA 42016 WEILER XPEDX 5352510
Carlisle 4504003

12 184.00 case 1A842 1 5.24 Each 7920-2025-021 12 167.03
(13.92 ea)

Dozen

5454  BROOM, HOUSEHOLD, CORN FIBRE, 4 SEWS 
HARDWOOD HANDLE

EA 10150 HAMBURG XPEDX 5135628
Carlisle 4135200

12 5.53 each 1VAB6 1 7.84 Each

5455  BROOM, STREET, 16 IN., W/O HANDLE, WOOD 
BLOCK W/TWO TAPERED HANDLE HOLES, 7-1/4 
IN. TRIM, FILL MATERIAL BASS AND PALMYRA 
BLEND

EA 42099 WEILER XPEDX 5352489
Carlisle 36219118

12 5.84 each 5LG66 1 10.39 Each

5456  BRUSH, DUST PAN, 8 IN. BRUSH, GREY FIBER MIX EA 44365 WEILER XPEDX 2074584
Rubbermaid 

FG634200SILV

6 5.80 each 3U788 1 1.90 Each

5457  BROOM-WHISK, CORN FIBRE, 3 SEWS, 10 IN. 
WIRE WRAPPED

EA 44266 WEILER 5147405 12 3.45 each 1VAB9 1 5.69 Each 7920-0520-010 12 31.71
(2.64 ea)

Dozen

5458  BRUSH, CAR WASH, 9-1/2 IN., WITHOUT HANDLE 
WHITE FLAGGED POLYSTYRENE, GREY FIBERFILL

EA 44318 WEILER 5148287 12 131.97 case 5A171 1 5.48 Each

5459  BRUSH, WINDOW, 5 IN. W/O HANDLE, 
PORTSMOUTH SILVER ROUND WITH FLAGGED TIP 
AND 3 HANDLE HOLES

EA 73003 WEILER 1VAE8 1 3.50 Each

5460  BRUSH, SCRUB, 6 INCH HAND GRIP, PLASTIC EA PF85 5146451 48 2.19 each 1VAD9 1 1.44 Each
5461  BRUSH, SCRUB, 9 IN., WOOD BLOCK HANDLE 

WHITE TAMPICO FILL
EA 44023 WEILER 5148112 12 2.95 each 2PYV9 1 2.28 Each 250017 12 35.89

(2.99 ea)
Dozen

5464  HANDLE, OFFICE BROOM, WOOD, 15/16 IN X 60 
IN THREADED LACQUER

EA 6361 RUBBERMAID  XPEDX 5052369
Carlisle 4027100

12 2.07 each 1A849 12 3.29 Each 7920-5300-021 12 28.03
(2.35 ea)

Dozen

5465  HANDLE, STREET BROOM, TAPERED 1-1/8 IN. X 60 
IN.

EA 44020 WEILER XPEDX 5039258
Carlisle 4026200

12 2.18 each 3A326 12 2.49 Each 7920-5300-020 12 33.61
(2.80 ea)

Dozen

5466  HANDLE, MULTI PURPOSE, WOOD, 60 IN. X 1-1/8 
IN. THREADED LACQUER

EA 44019 WEILER XPEDX 5208851
Carlisle 4026700

12 2.67 each 1A849 12 3.29 Each

11622 HANDLE,DUST MOP HEAD,CLIP ON, WOOD,SIZE: 1 
INCH
DIAMETER X 60 INCHES LENGTH, COLOR: 
NATURAL

EA 4602661  XPEDX   4602661 12 6.28 each 1TZG8 1 4.21 Each

11633 MOP HEAD,DRY, DUST,5 IN. WIDE X 18 IN EA 4602470  XPEDX 4602470 12 5.33 each 6PVT7 1 5.35 Each
11634 FRAME, DRY DUST MOP HEAD, METAL EA 4602621  XPEDX 4602621 12 1.67 each 6PVU9 1 8.24 Each
5468  SPONGE, CELLULOSE, 4 X 6. EA C31-3M 5355222 24 31.85 Case 3U163 1 2.21 Each
5470  SQUEEGEE, WINDOW, 14 INCH. COMPLETE, 

SOLID BRASS CONSTRUCTION, INCLUDES HANDLE, 
CHANNEL AND SOFT RUBBER BLADE

EA GS350 UNGER 5212008 10 12.70 each 2RNA2 5 9.45 Each

5471  STRIP, RUBBER REPLACEMENT, 14 IN. EA RT350 UNGER 5387131 12 36.26 Case 3U431 1 0.89 Each
5476  BUCKET, MOP WITH SIDE PRESSURE WRINGER, 35 

QT., POLYPROPYLENE, WITH 3 NON-MARKING 
CASTERS AND POWDER COATED METAL HANDLE

EA 7580-88 
RUBBERMAID

5265419 1 54.55 each 5NY79 1 51.81 Each

5478  BUCKET, WATER, 14 QUART, PLASTIC COLOR: 
GRAY

EA 2614 RUBBERMAID 2031178 6 8.00 each 3U660 6 6.51 Each

5479  WASTEBASKET, MEDIUM, SOFT PLASTIC, ROLLED 
RIMS, 14-3/8 IN.L X 10-1/4 IN.W X 15 IN.H, 28-1/8 
QT. CAP. COLOR: BEIGE

EA 2956BG 
RUBBERMAID

2030505 12 5.03 each 4HC00 1 4.78 Each

5481  CAN, WASTEPAPER, 30 INCH PLASTIC, BEIGE, 23 
GAL. SLIM JIM

EA 3540 RUBBERMAID 2030376 4 35.86 each 5W406 1 35.06 Each

5482  DUST PAN, METAL 12 INCH. EA 2069526 XPEDX 2069526 12 4.31 each 5W639 1 2.80 Each
5483 HANDLE, MOP, SPRING AND LEVER, 54 IN. EA 6514   HAMBURG  5MM87 1 6.59 Each 7920-5320-030 12 56.85 Dozen
5486  MOP, WET, WEB FOOT SHRINKLESS, 

ANTIMICROBIAL MEDIUM, 16 OZ., 6 PER CASE, 
COLOR: BLUE

EA A252-06BL 
RUBBERMAID

XPEDX 4601620
Golden Star 16Z-
LB5B

12 3.81 each 3U676 1 7.83 Each

5487  MOP, WET, WEB FOOT SHRINKLESS, 
ANTIMICROBIAL MEDIUM, 16 OZ., 6 PER CASE, 
COLOR: GREEN

EA A252-06GR 
RUBBERMAID

2074599 6 52.70 Case 3U675 1 7.83 Each

5490  MOP, SPONGE, STEEL ROLLER, WITH CELLULOSE 
HEAD, FRONT PULL LEVER ON HANDLE

EA 6435 RUBBERMAID 2028781 6 25.05 each 2U671 1 20.66 Each

5491  REPLACEMENT SPONGE MOP HEAD, STEEL 
ROLLER, CELLULOSE (FITS RUBBERMAID 6435 
MOP)

EA 6436 RUBBERMAID 2028752 12 8.12 each 2U672 1 5.83 Each

5494  SOAP, HAND CLEANER GO-JO, NATURAL ORANGE 
WITH PUMICE, PETROLEUM FREE, CITRUS 
FORMULA, 1 GAL. WITH PUMP

EA 0955 GO-JO 2205914 4 40.05 Case 12V409 1 14.04 Each

5495  SOAP, DISHWASHING DETERGENT, 38-50 OZ. 
BOTTLES

EA 37000-45112 P/G 
DAWN

5199978 8 33.91 Case 1XEJ8 DISCD Each

5499  BLEACH, CHLORINE, 1/2 TO 1 GAL. CONTAINER EA 33440 AUSTIN XPEDX 6003736
PureBright 
1108635042

6 9.10 Case 3CA44 6 13.55 CS

5503  CLEANER PADS, SOS, 4 PAD BOX , 96 PADS PER 
CASE

BOX 2170756 XPEDX 2170756 96 26.10 Case 2NTH7 120 32.03 CS

5506  CLEANER, WINDOW, AMMONIATED DETERGENT 
BLEND, FOR GLASS AND MIRROR, WITH SPRAYER 
FOR EACH BOTTLE, 22 TO 32 OZ., 12 PER CASE, 
READY FOR USE

EA 90135  WINDEX
NO SUBSTITUTE

XPEDX 6152742
Reliable 83638439

12 20.98 Case 3JW49 12 50.56 CS 6835-4500-020 12 42.00 Case

5511  CLEANER, CREAM, INTENSE, 12 PER CASE EA REGENCY LIQ CREME 
CLEANSER

XPEDX 6140806
Reliable 83638334

12 27.67 Case 2LEF6 1 2.58 Each

5522  DISPENSER, LIQUID SOAP, WITH BREAK 
RESISTANT BOTTLE FOR DISPENSING BULK SOAP, 
SIZE: 10-1/2 IN. H X 4-1/2 IN. W X 4-3/8 IN. D, 
COLOR: BLACK PEARL  MODEL OCEANS

EA S890TBK SAN JAMAR XPEDX 5249768 6 19.00 each NO BID

5523  DISPENSER, SOAP, PUSH LEVER, USES CARTRIDGE 
TYPE REFILLS

EA 9034 GOJO XPEDX 2029043
9034 GO JO

12 3.50 each NO BID

Grainger
Harrisburg, PA

Grainger

XPEDX
Camp Hill, PA

XPEDX

Unique Source
Harrisburg, PA

Unique Source

Central Poly Corp
Linden NJ

Central Poly Corp

All American Poly
Piscataway, NJ

All American Poly
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GraingerXPEDX Unique Source Central Poly CorpAll American Poly

5525  SOAP, HAND 2-1/2 OZ., UNWRAPPED, 200 PER 
CASE

EA HPC2058856 DIAL 2058856 200 52.01 Case 5RZZ7 DISCD Each

5526  SOAP, GRIT HAND, PUMICE EA 5011193 XPEDX 5011193 48 41.00 Case 1XEH8 DISCD Each

5527  SOAP, WATERLESS HAND GO-JO 18 OZ. CAN 12 
PER CASE

EA 1109-12GO-JO 5329649 12 25.60 Case 5FX83 1 23.81 CS

5529  SOAP, LOTION HAND CLEANER, 1 GAL. BOTTLE EA RELIABLE PINK 4440090 4 16.41 Case 5W208 1 7.68 Each
5531  FLOOR FINISH, GRANDSTAND, LOW MAINT- 

ENANCE, COVERAGE PER GALLON: 2,000 SQ. FT., 
DRY TIME: 20-30 MIN., MEETS ASTM D2047 
REQUIREMENTS FOR SLIP RESISTANCE, 5 GALLON 
CONTAINER - Removed from Bid

EA GRANDSTAND 
RAMSEY
(CAB Only)

3U689 DISCD

5536  PAD, STRIPPING, 20 IN. COLOR: BLACK 5 PADS 
PER CASE

EA 20014 GLIT Reliable 2252716 5 15.75 case 4UT87 DISCD

5538  PAD, STRIPPING, 15 IN., 5 PER CASE EA 20009 GLIT 2030599 5 15.62 case 4RU84 5 8.34 CS
5540  PAD, STRIPPING, 13 IN., 5 PER CASE EA 20007 GLIT 2152744 5 7.46 case 4RU83 5 6.68 CS
5544  PAD, SCRUBBING, 13 IN., 5 PER CASE EA 20124 GLIT 2030611 5 12.62 case 4RY11 5 6.45 CS
5546  PAD, SPRAY BUFFING, 20 IN., COLOR: RED 5 PADS 

PER CASE
EA 20053 GLIT 2152736 5 11.70 case 4RY21 5 11.44 CS

5548  PAD, BUFFING, 13 IN., 5 PER CASE EA 20046 GLIT 2152726 5 7.23 case 4RY17 5 6.39 CS
5552  PAD, POLISHING, 13 IN., 5 PER CASE EA 14413 GLIT 2152737 5 7.23 case 4RY23 5 5.59 CS
5554  PAD, POLISHING, 20 IN. SUPER POLISH PAD, 

COLOR: WHITE, 5 PADS PER CASE
EA 14420 GLIT 2152804 5 15.00 case 4RY27 5 10.51 CS

5559  FLOOR MAINTAINER, "SNAPBACK" SPRAY BUFF, 
JOHNSON WAX PROFESSIONAL, NO SUBSTITUTE

GAL 4116 JOHNSON WAX 2072267 4 76.80 Case 10C421 1 21.00 Each

5562  FLOOR STRIPPER, HEAVY DUTY, "BRAVO", 
JOHNSON WAX PROFESSIONAL, NO SUBSTITUTE, 
5 GAL ENVIROBOX

BOX 4576 JOHNSON WAX 5412561 1 39.81 each 10C425 1 61.29 Each

5564  WAX, FLOOR, JOHNSON COMPLETE, 1 GALLON 
CAN, 4 PER CASE

GAL 4649 COMPLETE 2096866 4 48.99
(12.25 ea) Case 10F951 1 15.54 Each

5567  WAX REMOVER, 1 GAL. CAN, 4 PER CASE GAL 045830 BRAVO 5415357 4 35.86 Case 5LH23 1 40.32 Each
5579  FLOOR PAD, RED BUFFING PAD, 16 IN., 5 PER 

CASE
EA 5100 3M 4WC88 5 20.15 CS

5580  SHOP TOWEL, STEEL BLUE, KIMBERLY CLARK 
33570 (POP-UP CARTON) 5 BOXES PER CASE

BOX 2226893 XPEDX
KIMBERLY CLARK 
33570

XPEDX 6212527
ToolBox 78100
38 ea/pk, 16 pk/cs

608 
ea

40.00 Case 2VHX6 5 76.19 CS

5581  WIPERS, "BRAWNY", DISPOSABLE, DOUBLE 
RECREPE FABRIC MATERIAL, SHEET SIZE 9-1/4 IN. X 
16-3/4 IN., POP-UP DISPENSING BOX, NO 
SUBSTITUTE - 90 WIPERS PER BOX - 10 BOXES PER 
CASE

BOX 20070/03 GEORGIA-
PACIFIC

5278512 900 81.22 Case 6YE60 10 69.73 CS

5583  TOILET TISSUE, 605 SHEETS, 2 PLY, 4 IN. X 4-1/2 
IN., 80 ROLL CASE

CS 4460-50 KIMBERLY 
CLARK

2388020 80 40.00 Case 1FC56 DISCD

5584  TOILET TISSUE, WHITE, 2 PLY, 1,000 FT. ROLL, 
JUMBO JUNIOR, 12 ROLLS PER CASE

CS TJ0922 SCA NORTH 
AMERICAN

5313860 12 24.83 Case 1PHJ2 8 27.98 CS

5585  TOWELS, PAPER, 150 PER PACK, C-FOLD STYLE 16 
PACKS PER CASE

CS 150 KIMBERLY CLARK 5189338 2400 23.93 Case 2U227 10 29.06 CS

5587  TOILET TISSUE, WHITE 2 PLY, 2000 FT. TO 2640 
FT. ROLL, 6 ROLLS PER CASE

CS 07827-20 KIMBERLY 
CLARK

5150710 6 34.29 Case 4KT77 6 41.88 CS

11893 TOILET TISSUE, WHITE 1 PLY, 2000 FT. CS 13718  GEORGIA 
PACIFIC

XPEDX 5258539 8 20.91 Case 1PHJ1 8 28.29 CS 8405-1500-500 80 38.81 Case

11894 TOWEL, PAPER, ROLL, WHITE, 1 PLY, 800 FT 89460  GEORGIA 
PACIFIC

 XPEDX 5054610 6 51.29 Case 3EB46 6 61.73 CS

5589  COVER, TOILET SEAT, HALF FOLD, WHITE 5000 
PER CASE, (20 PKGS /250 EA)

PKG DISCONTINUED: 
25180573 

Replace with: 
25177673 
ROCHESTER 
MIDLAND

 XPEDX 2255555
Reliable 2255555

5000 31.00 Case 1MM38 DISCD

5590  CUPS, DRINKING, PAPER, 6 OZ. 100 PER BOX BOX R6NN-0062 SOLO 5385632 2000 69.20 Case 13C001 DISCD
5591  FACIAL TISSUE 100-2 PLY PER BOX, BOX SIZE 8 X 

8.3 IN. ONLY, 30 BOXES PER CASE SURPASS
BOX 21340 KIMBERLY 

CLARK SURPASS
5158355 3000 20.00 Case 1FC57 30 31.73 CS

5593  TAMPONS, PLAYTEX GENTLE GUIDE, BULK PACK 
500 PER CASE.

CS 5074023 500 67.15 Case 3U822 500 56.25 CS

5594  SANITARY NAPKINS, MODESS 8 STAYFREE, 250 
PER CASE

CS 2028079 250 34.00 Case 3U819 250 33.54 CS

5595  SANITARY NAPKINS, MAXI, FOLDED, 4 IN BOX 250 
PER CASE

CS 4-147 HOSPITAL 
SPECIALTY

2126074 250 35.00 Case 3U818 250 31.69 CS

5596  AIR FRESHENER, AEROSOL, REFILL, ECO FIRST 
IMPRESSION, 1.8 OZ., DISTRIBUTED BY ECOLAB, 
SCENT - LINEN

EA 30076 ECOLAB 5141099 12 99.00 Case NO BID

5597  AIR FRESHENER, AEROSOL, REFILL, ECO FIRST 
IMPRESSION, 1.8 OZ., DISTRIBUTED BY ECOLAB, 
SCENT - SPRING SHOWER

EA 30077 ECOLAB 5141100 12 99.00 Case NO BID

5598  AIR FRESHENER, AEROSOL, REFILL, ECO FIRST 
IMPRESSION, 1.8 OZ., DISTRIBUTED BY ECOLAB, 
SCENT - MANDARIN BURST

EA 30078 ECOLAB 5114315 12 99.00 Case NO BID

5599  AIR FRESHENER, AEROSOL, REFILL, ECO FIRST 
IMPRESSION, 1.8 OZ., DISTRIBUTED BY ECOLAB, 
SCENT - JUNIPER SPLASH

EA 30079 ECOLAB 5032452 12 99.00 Case NO BID

5601  BRUSH, TOILET BOWL, PLASTIC FIBER, WOOD 
HANDLE

EA 27182 HAMBURG 2039919 12 2.16 each 1VAE9 1 1.64 Each 7920-2120-020 12 21.57
(1.79 each)

Dozen

5607  URINAL MATS, DISPOSABLE, SCENTED, 
ABSORBANT, COLOR: GRAY

EA 1525 IMPACT 5015632 6 31.05 Case 2LHJ9 6 30.50 CS

5613  DRAIN OPENER, LIQUID, 32 OZ BOTTLE, REGULAR 
STRENGTH, ELIMINATES CLOGS, CLEARS SLOW 
DRAINS, SAFE FOR SEPTIC SYSTEMS, GARBAGE 
DISPOSALS, AND PVC, PLASTIC AND COPPER PIPES

EA R02701    ZEP 2357630 12 63.00 Case 3HUN2 12 4.86 CS

5615  PLUNGER, DRAIN OPENER RUBBER 6 IN. EA 9200 IMPACT 1361495 6 6.00 each 1RLV8 1 5.76 Each
5621  INSECTICIDE, MULTIPURPOSE, AEROSOL 15 OZ. 

TO 19 OZ. CAN
EA 94891 RAID

Replace with 
CB016605 RAID

6223983 12 56.00 Case 4HK57 6 DISCD
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5626  POLISH, FURNITURE, 12 OZ. TO 19 OZ. AEROSOL 
CAN, 12 PER CASE

EA 415849 REGENCY 
LEMON

4159490 12 29.00 Case 2DBY8 1 2.13 Each

5631  DUST CLOTH, TEE SHIRT, WHITE 10 LB. BOX. BOX 2133669 XPEDX 2133669 10# 17.20 Case 3U586 1 28.90 Each
5632  GLASS-WIPING CLOTH, ABSORBENT. FABRIC 10 

LB. BOX.
BOX #10 DIAPER 

MATERIAL
2133672 10# 18.38 Case 16M204 1 50.74 Each

5634  DISPENSER, TOILET SEAT COVER, HALF FOLD, 
WHITE STYRENE, (CAPACITY 2 PKGS./250 EA.)

EA HG-1 Health Gards 5561582 1 9.35 each 1KT77 1 DISCD

5635  TISSUE DISPENSER, JUMBO ROLL, PLASTIC 
SMOKE/GREY,WITH LOCKING MECHANISM, 
HOLDS A 2000 FT. 2-PLY ROLL, DIMENSIONS: 
13 88 IN  X 16 IN X 5 75 IN

EA 09612 KIMBERLY-
CLARK

5049952 1 10.50 each 4DJU7 1 11.55 Each

5636  DISPENSER, PAPER TOWEL, TRANSLUCENT 
PLASTIC, SMOKE GREY, IN-SIGHT SERIES, 
UNIVERSAL TOWEL DISPENSER, 18.85 IN. X 13.31 
IN  X 5 85 IN

EA 09905 KIMBERLY 
CLARK

5042151 1 10.50 each 4CJ95 1 19.14 Each

5649 BAG, PAPER DUST, FOR WET/DRY VACUUM 
MODEL WV-375 NUMATIC. 10 BAGS PER PKG.
Removed from Bid

NO BID

5650 BAG, DISPOSABLE, VACUUM CLEANER, FOR 
EUREKA MIGHTY MITE, 3670-3695 SERIES, 
PACKAGE OF 3, M/M STYLE.

6096357 18 2.90 pkg of 3 3ZJK1 10 6.96 CS

5662  URINAL SCREEN, WITH DEODORANT BLOCK, 
100% BIODEGRADABLE

EA 5405-0510-005 PIBH 5412021 12 7.05 box of 12 15F539 35 9.69 CS 5405-0510-005 12 18.65 Carton

10284  TRASH PICKUP TOOL, HEAVY DUTY STEEL 
CONSTRUCTION WITH POWERFUL CLAWS AND 
ERGONOMIC GRIP, 36 IN. LONG SQUEEZE HANDLE 
FOR PICKING UP BOTTLES, CANS AND 
MISCELLANEOUS DEBRIS - Removed from Bid

EA NN900 UNGER NIFTY 
NABBER
INCORRECT PART 
NUMBER ON BID

5212202 10 26.00 each 3UP49 1 14.84 Each

11106 LINER, LAMINATED ALUMINUM/POLY LINER PKG 26827 JUSTRITE 5LTR2 10 15.16 CS
5618  TRASH BAG, PLASTIC 2 MIL, 250 BAGS PER 

CARTON. 16"" X 14"" X 36"".
CTN 2115582 250

39.70

Case 4YPA4 100 23.71 CS 8105-7000-300 250

43.90

Case 3036XXH-AAP 250

26.87

carton/case CENTRAL POLY 
#CP1614362M

250

20.80

CASE

5623  TRASH BAG, PLASTIC 1.5 MIL. 20"" X 13"" X 39"". 
250 BAGS PER CASE.

CS 6208582 100

14.58

Case 38D110 100 18.63 CS 3339XH-AAP 250

24.01

case CENTRAL POLY 
#CP2013391.5M

250

24.10

CASE

5624  TRASH BAG, PLASTIC, 2 MIL., BLACK, 44 IN. X 48 
IN., 100 BAGS PER CASE

CS 6208577 100

24.00

Case 3U863 100 31.74 CS 4448XXH-AAP 100

21.02

case CENTRAL POLY 
#CP44482M

100

25.40

CASE

5625  TRASH BAG, PLASTIC 22 IN. X 16 IN. X 58 IN. 3 
MIL., POLYETHLENE, 75-100 BAGS PER CASE

CS 5030148 100

64.00

Case 34G190 100 69.64 CS 8105-7000-340 60

36.37

Case 3848SH-AAP 75

24.68

case
.3291 ea

CENTRAL POLY 
#CP2216583M

100

25.90

CASE

12216 TRASH BAG, PLASTIC, 1.5 MIL., RECYCLING CS 20133915CLEAR 15E484 100 25.34 CS 3339XHR-AAP 250 30.67 case
(.12268 ea)

CENTRAL POLY 
#CP201339N15

100 14.20 CASE

NO BID: Action Supply Products
** TRASH BAGS - combined and awarded to overall 

low bidder that met specifications.

** UniqueSource is eligible for PA State Use 
preferential purchasing.
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PA Turnpike Commission - Bid Tabulation
Bid 427000-2014

Janitorial Supplies
Open Date 6/5/2014

Awarded to:
Material Description

5452  BROOM, GARAGE, 18 IN., W/O HANDLE PALMYRA 
FILL, LACQUERED HARDWOOD BLOCK, W/TWO 
THREADED HANDLE HOLES

5453  BROOM, OFFICE, 18 IN., W/O HANDLE BLACK 
TAMPICO CENTER W/BORDER OF BLACK 
HORSEHAIR & PLASTIC MIX, LACQUERED 
HARDWOOD W/TWO THREADED HANDLE HOLES.

5454  BROOM, HOUSEHOLD, CORN FIBRE, 4 SEWS 
HARDWOOD HANDLE

5455  BROOM, STREET, 16 IN., W/O HANDLE, WOOD 
BLOCK W/TWO TAPERED HANDLE HOLES, 7-1/4 
IN. TRIM, FILL MATERIAL BASS AND PALMYRA 
BLEND

5456  BRUSH, DUST PAN, 8 IN. BRUSH, GREY FIBER MIX

5457  BROOM-WHISK, CORN FIBRE, 3 SEWS, 10 IN. 
WIRE WRAPPED

5458  BRUSH, CAR WASH, 9-1/2 IN., WITHOUT HANDLE 
WHITE FLAGGED POLYSTYRENE, GREY FIBERFILL

5459  BRUSH, WINDOW, 5 IN. W/O HANDLE, 
PORTSMOUTH SILVER ROUND WITH FLAGGED TIP 
AND 3 HANDLE HOLES

5460  BRUSH, SCRUB, 6 INCH HAND GRIP, PLASTIC
5461  BRUSH, SCRUB, 9 IN., WOOD BLOCK HANDLE 

WHITE TAMPICO FILL
5464  HANDLE, OFFICE BROOM, WOOD, 15/16 IN X 60 

IN THREADED LACQUER
5465  HANDLE, STREET BROOM, TAPERED 1-1/8 IN. X 60 

IN.
5466  HANDLE, MULTI PURPOSE, WOOD, 60 IN. X 1-1/8 

IN. THREADED LACQUER
11622 HANDLE,DUST MOP HEAD,CLIP ON, WOOD,SIZE: 1 

INCH
DIAMETER X 60 INCHES LENGTH, COLOR: 
NATURAL

11633 MOP HEAD,DRY, DUST,5 IN. WIDE X 18 IN
11634 FRAME, DRY DUST MOP HEAD, METAL
5468  SPONGE, CELLULOSE, 4 X 6.
5470  SQUEEGEE, WINDOW, 14 INCH. COMPLETE, 

SOLID BRASS CONSTRUCTION, INCLUDES HANDLE, 
CHANNEL AND SOFT RUBBER BLADE

5471  STRIP, RUBBER REPLACEMENT, 14 IN.
5476  BUCKET, MOP WITH SIDE PRESSURE WRINGER, 35 

QT., POLYPROPYLENE, WITH 3 NON-MARKING 
CASTERS AND POWDER COATED METAL HANDLE

5478  BUCKET, WATER, 14 QUART, PLASTIC COLOR: 
GRAY

5479  WASTEBASKET, MEDIUM, SOFT PLASTIC, ROLLED 
RIMS, 14-3/8 IN.L X 10-1/4 IN.W X 15 IN.H, 28-1/8 
QT. CAP. COLOR: BEIGE

5481  CAN, WASTEPAPER, 30 INCH PLASTIC, BEIGE, 23 
GAL. SLIM JIM

5482  DUST PAN, METAL 12 INCH.
5483 HANDLE, MOP, SPRING AND LEVER, 54 IN.
5486  MOP, WET, WEB FOOT SHRINKLESS, 

ANTIMICROBIAL MEDIUM, 16 OZ., 6 PER CASE, 
COLOR: BLUE

5487  MOP, WET, WEB FOOT SHRINKLESS, 
ANTIMICROBIAL MEDIUM, 16 OZ., 6 PER CASE, 
COLOR: GREEN

5490  MOP, SPONGE, STEEL ROLLER, WITH CELLULOSE 
HEAD, FRONT PULL LEVER ON HANDLE

5491  REPLACEMENT SPONGE MOP HEAD, STEEL 
ROLLER, CELLULOSE (FITS RUBBERMAID 6435 
MOP)

5494  SOAP, HAND CLEANER GO-JO, NATURAL ORANGE 
WITH PUMICE, PETROLEUM FREE, CITRUS 
FORMULA, 1 GAL. WITH PUMP

5495  SOAP, DISHWASHING DETERGENT, 38-50 OZ. 
BOTTLES

5499  BLEACH, CHLORINE, 1/2 TO 1 GAL. CONTAINER

5503  CLEANER PADS, SOS, 4 PAD BOX , 96 PADS PER 
CASE

5506  CLEANER, WINDOW, AMMONIATED DETERGENT 
BLEND, FOR GLASS AND MIRROR, WITH SPRAYER 
FOR EACH BOTTLE, 22 TO 32 OZ., 12 PER CASE, 
READY FOR USE

5511  CLEANER, CREAM, INTENSE, 12 PER CASE

5522  DISPENSER, LIQUID SOAP, WITH BREAK 
RESISTANT BOTTLE FOR DISPENSING BULK SOAP, 
SIZE: 10-1/2 IN. H X 4-1/2 IN. W X 4-3/8 IN. D, 
COLOR: BLACK PEARL  MODEL OCEANS

5523  DISPENSER, SOAP, PUSH LEVER, USES CARTRIDGE 
TYPE REFILLS

Vendor Product 
ID

Case 
Qty

INVOICING 
PRICE

INVOICING 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Vendor Product ID Case 
Qty

INVOICING 
PRICE

INVOICING 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

25195 12 127.40 Case - 12 
qt.

State Industrial Products

Interboro Packaging
Montgomery, NY

Interboro Packaging

State Industrial Products
Mayfield Heights OH
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5525  SOAP, HAND 2-1/2 OZ., UNWRAPPED, 200 PER 
CASE

5526  SOAP, GRIT HAND, PUMICE

5527  SOAP, WATERLESS HAND GO-JO 18 OZ. CAN 12 
PER CASE

5529  SOAP, LOTION HAND CLEANER, 1 GAL. BOTTLE
5531  FLOOR FINISH, GRANDSTAND, LOW MAINT- 

ENANCE, COVERAGE PER GALLON: 2,000 SQ. FT., 
DRY TIME: 20-30 MIN., MEETS ASTM D2047 
REQUIREMENTS FOR SLIP RESISTANCE, 5 GALLON 
CONTAINER - Removed from Bid

5536  PAD, STRIPPING, 20 IN. COLOR: BLACK 5 PADS 
PER CASE

5538  PAD, STRIPPING, 15 IN., 5 PER CASE
5540  PAD, STRIPPING, 13 IN., 5 PER CASE
5544  PAD, SCRUBBING, 13 IN., 5 PER CASE
5546  PAD, SPRAY BUFFING, 20 IN., COLOR: RED 5 PADS 

PER CASE
5548  PAD, BUFFING, 13 IN., 5 PER CASE
5552  PAD, POLISHING, 13 IN., 5 PER CASE
5554  PAD, POLISHING, 20 IN. SUPER POLISH PAD, 

COLOR: WHITE, 5 PADS PER CASE
5559  FLOOR MAINTAINER, "SNAPBACK" SPRAY BUFF, 

JOHNSON WAX PROFESSIONAL, NO SUBSTITUTE
5562  FLOOR STRIPPER, HEAVY DUTY, "BRAVO", 

JOHNSON WAX PROFESSIONAL, NO SUBSTITUTE, 
5 GAL ENVIROBOX

5564  WAX, FLOOR, JOHNSON COMPLETE, 1 GALLON 
CAN, 4 PER CASE

5567  WAX REMOVER, 1 GAL. CAN, 4 PER CASE
5579  FLOOR PAD, RED BUFFING PAD, 16 IN., 5 PER 

CASE
5580  SHOP TOWEL, STEEL BLUE, KIMBERLY CLARK 

33570 (POP-UP CARTON) 5 BOXES PER CASE

5581  WIPERS, "BRAWNY", DISPOSABLE, DOUBLE 
RECREPE FABRIC MATERIAL, SHEET SIZE 9-1/4 IN. X 
16-3/4 IN., POP-UP DISPENSING BOX, NO 
SUBSTITUTE - 90 WIPERS PER BOX - 10 BOXES PER 
CASE

5583  TOILET TISSUE, 605 SHEETS, 2 PLY, 4 IN. X 4-1/2 
IN., 80 ROLL CASE

5584  TOILET TISSUE, WHITE, 2 PLY, 1,000 FT. ROLL, 
JUMBO JUNIOR, 12 ROLLS PER CASE

5585  TOWELS, PAPER, 150 PER PACK, C-FOLD STYLE 16 
PACKS PER CASE

5587  TOILET TISSUE, WHITE 2 PLY, 2000 FT. TO 2640 
FT. ROLL, 6 ROLLS PER CASE

11893 TOILET TISSUE, WHITE 1 PLY, 2000 FT.

11894 TOWEL, PAPER, ROLL, WHITE, 1 PLY, 800 FT

5589  COVER, TOILET SEAT, HALF FOLD, WHITE 5000 
PER CASE, (20 PKGS /250 EA)

5590  CUPS, DRINKING, PAPER, 6 OZ. 100 PER BOX
5591  FACIAL TISSUE 100-2 PLY PER BOX, BOX SIZE 8 X 

8.3 IN. ONLY, 30 BOXES PER CASE SURPASS
5593  TAMPONS, PLAYTEX GENTLE GUIDE, BULK PACK 

500 PER CASE.
5594  SANITARY NAPKINS, MODESS 8 STAYFREE, 250 

PER CASE
5595  SANITARY NAPKINS, MAXI, FOLDED, 4 IN BOX 250 

PER CASE
5596  AIR FRESHENER, AEROSOL, REFILL, ECO FIRST 

IMPRESSION, 1.8 OZ., DISTRIBUTED BY ECOLAB, 
SCENT - LINEN

5597  AIR FRESHENER, AEROSOL, REFILL, ECO FIRST 
IMPRESSION, 1.8 OZ., DISTRIBUTED BY ECOLAB, 
SCENT - SPRING SHOWER

5598  AIR FRESHENER, AEROSOL, REFILL, ECO FIRST 
IMPRESSION, 1.8 OZ., DISTRIBUTED BY ECOLAB, 
SCENT - MANDARIN BURST

5599  AIR FRESHENER, AEROSOL, REFILL, ECO FIRST 
IMPRESSION, 1.8 OZ., DISTRIBUTED BY ECOLAB, 
SCENT - JUNIPER SPLASH

5601  BRUSH, TOILET BOWL, PLASTIC FIBER, WOOD 
HANDLE

5607  URINAL MATS, DISPOSABLE, SCENTED, 
ABSORBANT, COLOR: GRAY

5613  DRAIN OPENER, LIQUID, 32 OZ BOTTLE, REGULAR 
STRENGTH, ELIMINATES CLOGS, CLEARS SLOW 
DRAINS, SAFE FOR SEPTIC SYSTEMS, GARBAGE 
DISPOSALS, AND PVC, PLASTIC AND COPPER PIPES

5615  PLUNGER, DRAIN OPENER RUBBER 6 IN.
5621  INSECTICIDE, MULTIPURPOSE, AEROSOL 15 OZ. 

TO 19 OZ. CAN

Vendor Product 
ID

Case 
Qty

INVOICING 
PRICE

INVOICING 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Vendor Product ID Case 
Qty

INVOICING 
PRICE

INVOICING 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

State Industrial Products Interboro Packaging

107655
liquid

4 63.00 4x3 liter

106212 1 56.00 5 - gallon 
container

112203 12 129.50 Case - 12 
7.25 oz. 

cans
112203 12 129.50 Case - 12 

7.25 oz. 
cans

117483 12 129.50 Case - 12 
7.25 oz. 

cans
113310 12 129.50 Case - 12 

7.25 oz. 
cans

122057 12 64.40 Case - 12
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5626  POLISH, FURNITURE, 12 OZ. TO 19 OZ. AEROSOL 
CAN, 12 PER CASE

5631  DUST CLOTH, TEE SHIRT, WHITE 10 LB. BOX.
5632  GLASS-WIPING CLOTH, ABSORBENT. FABRIC 10 

LB. BOX.
5634  DISPENSER, TOILET SEAT COVER, HALF FOLD, 

WHITE STYRENE, (CAPACITY 2 PKGS./250 EA.)
5635  TISSUE DISPENSER, JUMBO ROLL, PLASTIC 

SMOKE/GREY,WITH LOCKING MECHANISM, 
HOLDS A 2000 FT. 2-PLY ROLL, DIMENSIONS: 
13 88 IN  X 16 IN X 5 75 IN

5636  DISPENSER, PAPER TOWEL, TRANSLUCENT 
PLASTIC, SMOKE GREY, IN-SIGHT SERIES, 
UNIVERSAL TOWEL DISPENSER, 18.85 IN. X 13.31 
IN  X 5 85 IN

5649 BAG, PAPER DUST, FOR WET/DRY VACUUM 
MODEL WV-375 NUMATIC. 10 BAGS PER PKG.
Removed from Bid

5650 BAG, DISPOSABLE, VACUUM CLEANER, FOR 
EUREKA MIGHTY MITE, 3670-3695 SERIES, 
PACKAGE OF 3, M/M STYLE.

5662  URINAL SCREEN, WITH DEODORANT BLOCK, 
100% BIODEGRADABLE

10284  TRASH PICKUP TOOL, HEAVY DUTY STEEL 
CONSTRUCTION WITH POWERFUL CLAWS AND 
ERGONOMIC GRIP, 36 IN. LONG SQUEEZE HANDLE 
FOR PICKING UP BOTTLES, CANS AND 
MISCELLANEOUS DEBRIS - Removed from Bid

11106 LINER, LAMINATED ALUMINUM/POLY LINER
5618  TRASH BAG, PLASTIC 2 MIL, 250 BAGS PER 

CARTON. 16"" X 14"" X 36"".

5623  TRASH BAG, PLASTIC 1.5 MIL. 20"" X 13"" X 39"". 
250 BAGS PER CASE.

5624  TRASH BAG, PLASTIC, 2 MIL., BLACK, 44 IN. X 48 
IN., 100 BAGS PER CASE

5625  TRASH BAG, PLASTIC 22 IN. X 16 IN. X 58 IN. 3 
MIL., POLYETHLENE, 75-100 BAGS PER CASE

12216 TRASH BAG, PLASTIC, 1.5 MIL., RECYCLING

NO BID: Action Supply Products
** TRASH BAGS - combined and awarded to overall 

low bidder that met specifications.

** UniqueSource is eligible for PA State Use 
preferential purchasing.

Vendor Product 
ID

Case 
Qty

INVOICING 
PRICE

INVOICING 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Vendor Product ID Case 
Qty

INVOICING 
PRICE

INVOICING 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

State Industrial Products Interboro Packaging

100513 12 71.76 Case - 12 
20 oz. cans

Low bid for each item selected and compared to spec.
Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
161436-XH  As per 
sample #1E 

250

17.84

250 bags 
per case

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
201339-XH  As per 
sample #2C

250

20.82

250 bags 
per case

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
4448-Exh  As per 
sample #3C 

100

17.74

100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
221658-Super Exh  
As per sample #4D

100

22.82

100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
201339-XH As per 
sample #5C

100 10.34 100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
161436-Super Ex-
Hvy As per sample 
#1A 

250

33.24

250 bags 
per case

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
201339-Super Exh 
As per sample #2A

250

29.84

250 bags 
per case

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
4448-Super Ex-Hvy 
As per sample #3A 

100

26.20

100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
221658-Super Tuff 
As per sample #4A 

100

40.32

100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
201339-Super Exh 
As per sample #5A

100 15.32 100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
161436-Super XH  
As per sample #1B 

250

29.84

250 bags 
per case

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
201339-Exh  As per 
sample #2B

250

25.82

250 bags 
per case

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
4448-Super Exh  As 
per sample #3B 

100

21.34

100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
221658-Super Ex-
Ex-Hvy As per 
sample #4B 

100

34.98

100 bags 
per case 
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Vendor Product 
ID

Case 
Qty

INVOICING 
PRICE

INVOICING 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

Vendor Product ID Case 
Qty

INVOICING 
PRICE

INVOICING 
UNIT OF 

MEASURE

State Industrial Products Interboro Packaging

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
201339-Exh As per 
sample #5B

100 12.82 100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
161436-Super Exh   
As per sample #1C 

250

26.74

250 bags 
per case

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
201339-XH  As per 
sample #2C

250

20.82

250 bags 
per case

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
4448-Exh  As per 
sample #3C 

100

17.74

100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
221658-Super Ex-
Hvy As per sample 
#4C

100

28.90

100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
201339-XH As per 
sample #5C

100 10.34 100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
161436-Exh  As per 
sample #1D 

250

22.34

250 bags 
per case

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
201339-Hvy  As per 
sample #2D

250

16.98

250 bags 
per case

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
4448-XH  As per 
sample #3D

100

14.24

100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
221658-Super Exh  
As per sample #4D

100

22.82

100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
201339-Hvy As per 
sample #5D

100 8.34 100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
161436-XH  As per 
sample #1E 

250

17.84

250 bags 
per case

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
201339-Hvy  As per 
sample #2D

250

16.98

250 bags 
per case

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
4448-Hvy As per 
sample #3E

100

11.84

100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS INT-
221658-Exh As per 
sample #4E

100

18.84

100 bags 
per case 

Manufacture Aluf 
Plastics/IBS  INT-
201339-Hvy As per 
sample #5D

100 8.34 100 bags 
per case 
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